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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 October 2018 7:48 AM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna'; SUR

Subject: RE: SGT2228)-Market value DOA 1.10.18
Dear Kelvyna,

The market value of SGT 22287 is $62K-$63K (Estimated) as at Oct 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 15 October 2018 4:56 PM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW; SGT2228)-Market value DOA 1.10.18

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Veron,

Kindly assist

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna [mailto:Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Monday, 15 October 2018 4:54 PM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SGT2228)-Market value DOA 1.10.18

Hi team

Could kindly advise market value as at DOA 1.10.18.



Thanks & Best Regards,
Kelvyna Ngian
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The content of this ¢-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Page [ of |

DoR : l(!f’lﬁ 2

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC (. Gm)
Owner ID: 4596H
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SGT2228)
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 240ct 2018
Vehicle Make: HONDA
Vehicle Model: VEZEL 1.5X CVT
Primary Colour: Maroon
Manufacturing Year: 2015
Engine No.: L15B4025294
Chassis No.: RU11105261
Maximum Power Qutput: 96.0 kw (128 bhp)
Open Market Value: $19,386.00
Original Registration Date: 09 Nov 2015
First Registration Date: 09 Nov 2015
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $9,386.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 08 Nov 2025
PARF Rebate Amount: $7,039.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 08 Nov 2025
COE Category: A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $55,399.00
COE Rebate Amount: $3%,006.00
Total Rebate Amount: $46,045.00
The information contained hereinis correct as at 15 Oct 2018
OK
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https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPubl icBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F03... 10/15/2018



10/15/2018 Used Honda Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart
s ARMART.COM Login  Sign up

New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

Let us tell you how much your car can sell for!

No obligations and it’s FREE!

Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just

$58 until it's SOLD!
Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling

[Browse by Category 7 | «Back(123456) Next » Sort by Date Posted ¥ || 20 resuks/page ¥ |
105 vehicles )Honda Ve_ze_l_ o ) _mu - - . e
Price Depreciation Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Status
Search Selection Honda Vezel Any Ay 2015 Any Any Any All

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $63,300 58,400 fyr 22-0ct-2015 1,496 cc 59,000 km suv Available
Graded A by ST

Up To 90% Loan! Flexible Repayment With In House Financing, Our Vehicle Inspected By Professional Team For Highest Quality, Owning A Car Is So
Much Easier With Us. View To Believe. Call Us Now!

Universe Motoring

Posted; 14-0ct-2018 - Taws: 2015 Honda Vezel, 2015 honde vezel, Honda Vezel, honda vezel, Honda, Verel, vezel, Used Honda

Honda Vezel 1,54 X $66,800 $8,970 /yr 02-Oct-2015 1,496 cc 31,000 km Suv Available

Pearl White Unit! Well Maintained By Previous Owner, Accident Free, Most Popular Compact SUV, Low Mileage, One Owner, 1 Year Warranty And 1
Free Servicing! Buy With A Peace Of Mind, Trade In Welcome, ...

AL Autocar Pte Ltd

Posted: 13-0ct-2018  Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, 2015 honda vezel, Honda Vezel, honda vezel, Honda, Vezel, vazel, Used Honda

Honda Vezel 1.5A X = N.A 07-Dec-2015 1,496 cc - Suv SOLD

Guaranteed Non Grab/Uber/Leasing Car, 1 Banker Owner! Genuine Low Mileage Done 44938km With Servicing Proof, Totally Like Brand New, See To
Certify, Low PARF Of $4,451. 100% Accident Free, Call Now!

Lake View Credit Pte Ltd

Posted: 13-0ct-2018  Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, 2015 honda vezel, Honda Vezel, handa vezel, Honda, Vezel, vezel, Used Honda

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $67,800 $8,800 /yr 18-Dec-2015 1,496 cc 36,833 km Suv Available

$0 Down Payment For Limited Period Only! Other Loan Packages From Bank/In House/Balloon Scheme Available With Most Attractive And 100% Fast
Approval Rates! 1 Owner Only! Sporty White Vezel Selling Low.., E RN 4D )

Le Motor Enterprise

Posted: 12-Oct-2018  Tags: 2015 Henda Vezel, 2015 honda vezel, Honda Vezel, honda vezel, Honda, Vezel, vezel, Used Honda

HP Car Camcorder f870¢g Car Camera
Brand new - HP FB70G front and rear car cam, with 32GB SD card

More info about this product

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $68,800 $9,210 /yr 02-Oct-2015 1,496 cc 43,348 km Suv Available

1 Owner, New Road Tax Till April 2019, Full Servicing Record, 1 Year Extended Warranty Cover Engine And Gear Box, You Will Love Its Great Looks
And Good Driving Dynamics, While Its Fuel Efficiency Wil...

Accendore Autolution Pte Ltd
Posted: 12-0ct-2018  Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, 2015 honda vezel, Honda Vezel, honda verel, Honda, Vezel, vezel, Used Honda

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $59,800 $8,840 /yr 09-Apr-2015 1,496 cc 62,201 km SuvV Available

Well Maintained Single Owner Unit! Selling Cheap! Practical And Fuel Efficient SUV! Spacious And Easy To Maintain! Trade In Available! Call For A
Viewing Appointment Today!

Mayfair Motoring

Posted: 11-Oct-2018  Tags: 2015 Honda Vezel, 2015 honda vezel, Honda Vezel, honda vezel, Honda, Vezel, vezel, Used Honda

anda Vezel 1,54 X $65,800 48,540 /yr 15-Sep-2015 1,496 ¢cc 38,188 km suv Available
Compare [ 1] | Offer 1,99%-2.28% Cheapest Rates In The Market! A Best Value For Money! Fuel Efficiency And Maney Saver For Your Family! Enjoy A

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?BRSR=0&MOD=Honda&MMO=Vezel&RPG=20&VEH=0&RGD=2015 1/3



