Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 3:53 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SDD128Y - CRUZE 1.6 - OWN DAMAGED - LONPAC INSURANCE BHD - DOA
11-10-2018

Attachments: LKKAdjustment1a.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; LKKInvoice1.pdf; photo.pdf

Dear Gerald,

Enclosed herewith survey report (soft copy).

Hard copy will send to your good office shortly.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 December 2018 3:38 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: SDD128Y - CRUZE 1.6 - OWN DAMAGED - LONPAC INSURANCE BHD - DOA 11-10-2018

Our Ref :17/18/18/VP05/021013
Dear Catherine,

Please close your file and let us have your bill for our settlement.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all ©Hew" lonpac.com.sg

From: Vincent Sim [mailto:vincent.sim@alpinemotors.sq]

Sent: Thursday, 13 December, 2018 3:17 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: SDD128Y - CRUZE 1.6 - OWN DAMAGED - LONPAC INSURANCE BHD - DOA 11-10-2018
1



Dear Sir/ Madam,
as attached the final bill for the above claim ( Ref no ; 171818VP05021013 ) for your approval and payment
we will be also sent by dispatch .

Regards,
Vincent Sim- Claims Dept

vincent.sim@alpinemotors.sg

65113022 ext 343

The information contained in this message is intended only for the recipient, and may be a confidential attorney-client communication or may otherwise be
privileged and confidential and protected from disclosure. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for
delivering this message to the intended recipient, please be aware that any dissemination or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have
received this communication in error, please immediately notify us by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.



