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Corsultants
Pte Litd Company Registration No 1936071588

!.' "/’!{7 Auto

t

51 UBIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTHLAL PARE, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (065) 62563361 FAX ; 1065) 62564315

Your Ref: SGV10195/SA/pl
Our Ref: CS/EGIR01865%Uvb Date: 19/10/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s; ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SLH 7639C

We thank you for your instruction on 15/10/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

18/10/2018 at the premises of M/s TRANS EUROKARS PTELTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 5%15,069.09
Revised Estimate Amount + 55$5,468.21
"Check” Items Amount : §%5,197.099
Market Value : 58

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
front portion.

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Catherine Chung (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <5urvey.Report@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 15 October, 2018 3:07 PM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com'

Subject: OI: SGV1019S / TP : SLH7639C/LKK / DOA : 12/10/2018

Attachments: 5GV10195 - SAS. pdf; SLH7639C - SAS.pdf; SLH7639C - ESTIMATE.pdf; SLH7639C -

PRS FORM.pdf; RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY-TP / YOUR REF: SGV10195 / OUR REF:
SLH7639C (21.2 KB)

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the "Single Joint Expert”,

Please assist to conduct this survey from TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD,

ADDRESS : 5 UBI CLOSE
SINGAPORE 408605

PERSON TO CONTACT : RONALD YAP @ 6395 8899 /9127 7928
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : SITI

Note: To survey on DIRECT SETTLEMENT basis. Please inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to

conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep
us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey

status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.
Attached are estimate, insured & Third Parties SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

B £ .'._]-'_1I 15
Yee Peil

aims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd,

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Eurnpe. Worldwide, ERGO s represented in mere than 30 countries and concentrates
on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Sroup). ona of the world's lead ng risk carriers



Date:
Qur Reference:

Your Reference:

To:

15.10.2018

SGV 10195/SA/pl

SLH 7639C

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

Pre-Repair Survey (PRS) Acknowledgement

Vehicle For Inspection; SLH 7639C

Insured's Vehicle:

Date Of Accident:

5GV 10195

12.10.2018

We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS on:

15.10.2018

ERGO

Sent via Fax

or

Email
ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *,

*

Als Automaobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
FTA FoarmTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd LKK LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd
145 Infinith Appraisal Service Ps Priority Services

JPK JP Knights Pte Ltd VAL Vicom Ltd

Owr Insured’s driver has not reported the accident to us todate.

Your request for inspection does not have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy.
Your request for inspection does not have your client's GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upon receipt of estimate,

V |others:  We write to confirm our agreement to have a direct settlement of this claim with
quantum to be agreed. OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - SITI
Prepared by: é} Pei L 6829 9194 claims@ergo.com.sg
. Q /'-- -\.__,_,-r' & B
Signature: FAX : 6829 9247
Assessor usg only: Workshop use only:
Assessor attended workshep on:
Assignment Date: Date:
Assignment Time: Time
Inspector:

Remarks:

D Vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Warkshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Note: Qur Inspection is on a without odmission to liability basis.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuta)

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2018 2:22 PM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.)'

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: SGV10195 / TP : SLH7639C/LKK / DOA : 12/10/2018
Attachments: SLH 7639C PREL| REVISED. pdf

Dear Pei Li,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLH 7639C
Date of survey: 18/10/2018
MNumber of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 15 October 2018 3:13 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SGV10195 / TP : SLH7639C/LKK / DOA : 12/10/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Thank you for the assighment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 15 October, 2018 3:07 PM

To: 'admin-d @lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: O1: 5GV10195 /TP : SLH7639C/LKK / DOA : 12/10/2018

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single loint Expert”.



Please assist to conduct this survey from TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD,

ADDRESS : 5 UBI CLOSE

SINGAPORE 408605
PERSON TO CONTACT : RONALD YAP @ 6395 8899 /9127 7928
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : SITI

Note: To survey on DIRECT SETTLEMENT basis. Please inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to
conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep

us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are estimate, insured & Third Parties 5AS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee Peill

Claims Assistant (Motor)
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd,

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

DID - +B65 6829 3194

Tel ;. +65 68299199

Fax : +65 6B2G 5247

ERGO

ERGO iz ane of the major insurance groups in Gamnany and Europe. Werldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries and concantrates
an Europe and Asia. ERGOQ is part of Munich Re (Group). one of the world's ieading risk carriers

WA EMa . Com 50



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 1

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
89558

SLH7639C

No

18 Oct 2018

MAZDA

MAZDA3 4-DOOR SEDAN 1.5L SP.6EAT
Red

2016

P520375358
IM6BM42A8G0346458
88.0 kW (118 bhp)
$20,847.00

17 Nov 2016

17 Nov 2016

0

$16,186.00

Yes
16 Nov 2026
$12,139.00

16 Nov 2026

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$52,668.00

$42,552.00

$54,691.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Oct 2018

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lIta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput ?FUNCTION_ID=F030... 18-Oct-18
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i’ TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

m NO:5 UBI CLOSE, SINGAPORE 408605 Q‘“ ElROKA
mazpa ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIRS

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. MAME ; Mr Teo Chek Wei WIP 31633

5 Temasek Boulevard ADDRESS : Blk 5 Lorong Lew Lian EXCESS :

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five #10-108 DATE: 13-0ct-18

Singapore 038385 Singapore 530005

ATTN. MOTOR CLAIMS TEL: 83220244

FAX :

VEH NO : SLH7639C DATE IN : CONTACT PERSON : Ronald 63957875

CHASSIS NO : IMEBMAZABGO346458  |MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : THIRD PARTY CLAIM

MODEL : MAZDAZ DATE REG.: 17-Mov-16 POLICY NO. :

NATURE OF WORKS
Parts Description

NO Qary REVISED PRICES
1 |FRONT BUMPER 1 MBHR3-50-031BBR - P $.+1,081.70 | a—m"
2 |RETAINER RHS 1 MBHN1-50-0T1F Lo s ww|
3 |COVER RHS, FRONT BUMPER MBHM1-50-101 e, 5 28.00 j}/
4 |CHROME RHS, FOGLAMP X MBIE1-50-C12 P 5 106.70 3
5 |COVER RHS, FOGLAMP 1 MBJE1-S0-C114 1 7 5 46.40 [
6 |FRONT REINFORCEMENT 1 MB45A-50-0704 5 44450 i
7 |CLIP, FRONT BUMPER 12 MC274-50-133 il 5 a2004—
8 |FASTENER, FRONT BUMPER 2 MB45A-56-1464 iler |8 s60|—
9 |GROMMET, FRONT BUMPER 2 MGHPI-50-075 e~ |5 540 |
10 |BRACKET LHS, FRONT BUMPER 1 MBHN1-50-152 "f‘_ﬂj/ 5 15.10 et
11 |GRILLE TOP 1 MBEHN1-50-033 62 yrd §— 33500
12 |RIVET, GRILLE TOP B MS515-51-833 2l s 22.80 ::_
13 |RIVET, GRILLE TOP 4 MTE21-50-355 o 5.~ 3480 "
14 |BRACKET TOP, GRILLE 1 MBHN1-50-717D AN s A 10240 i
15 |FASTEMER, GRILLE 8 MGD7A-SO-EAL Aet |8 24.00 |7
16 |CHROME LHS 1 MEHN1-50-7K14 - S » 17670 |
17 |CHROME RHS 1 MBHN1-50-7114 C N 5 176.70 |—"
18 |MASCOT, FRONT 1 MC235-51-731A f A 5 44.20 | —
19 |FRONT GRILLE 1 MBIEL-50-7128 ¢ NA $  S8L60 |7
20 |BRACKET LHS, FRONT GRILLE 1 MBHNM1-50-163 s 5 15.10 |7~
21 |BRACKET RHS, FRONT GRILLE 1 MEHN1-50-153 JUA § 1510 7
22 |GROMMET, FRONT GRILLE 2 MKD45-50-E51 g 5.40 :Jl
23 |PIN LOCATOR, FRONT GRILLE 2 MKD45-50-1K54 5 5.40 -1
24 |RIVET, FRONT GRILLE 2 MEAD1-50-037 A g 1520 | %
25 |FRONT PANEL UPPER 1 MB45A-E3-1504 $ 12400 X
26 |STAY LOCK 1 MBA5A-52-15Y A 5 38.80 | ¥
27 |FRONT SUPPORT PANEL 1 MGHRS-53-1108 A $ 46970 |
28 |FASTEMER, PLATE SEAL 4 MKD45-50-EAL . 5 10,00 ’i
29 |PLATE SET, FRONT REINFORCEMENT 1 MBHN3-50-1C0 A ) 5 52.70 ?
30 |FASTEMER, PLATE SET 4 MGDT7A-50-EAL 5 12.00 F}‘

SLP5086T Page 10of 3



SR &\

31 |BONNET 1 MBHYO-52-3104 !W/‘iwc & -1,067.30
32 |WEATHERSTRIP, BONNET 1 MBHNS-56-7704 A | S 6360
33 |HEADLAMP RHS MBHT6-51-031A - §  2,245.00
34 |HID CONTROL UNIT 1 MBHN3-51-0H3 = |§ 89550
35 |GASKET, CONTROL UMNIT MC236-51-0B2 4 13.60
36 [RIVET, HEADLAMP MB092-51-833 5 3.30
37 |CLIP, HEADLAMP 2 MFBO1-50-133C 5 7.60
38 |RADIATOR COOLANT 1 g 68.50
TOTAL PARTS 8,410.10
LESS 10% 841.01
TOTAL PARTS COST 7,569.09
Labour Description
TO REPLACE FRONT BUMPER, FRONT REINFORCEMENT, GRILLE TOP AND BONNET.
1 |MZ-BR-FRONTA \pppaR ALL AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT . /320 ¢ 254000
&
2 MZ-5P-5FRT04 |TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER, FRONT REINFORCEMENT, GRILLE TOP AND BONNET. S f df 3 5 2520.00
F 4 . &
TO REMOVE & INSTALL RADIATOR, RADIATOR FAM AND FRONT SUPPORT PANEL. TO
3 | MZ-BR-PANELL |conpycT PRESSURE TEST & PERFORM LEAK TEST. 'm, L, |®  es0.00
4 | MZ-BR-TOPR-UR |TO REMOVE & INSTALL CONDENSOR, AIR COND PIPE AND TOP-UP (GAS COOLING SYSTEM, | ¢ i.l X |s  se0.O0
5 | MZ-BR-PLATE1-{FE-5HPREY NUMBER PLATE . NETT 3 70.00
6 | MZ-BR-CAVITY |TO CARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION. ra 3 § 250,00
#T =1 i
7 | MZ-BR-ELECTR |TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING. /2o |$ 00
& | MZ-BR-REPROG |TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDEMT REPAIR WORKS f( - |$ 35000
—
9 | MZ-BR-SUNDRI [SUNDRIES. Vitan L0 NETT 5 100,00
[ hence notify
owing. TOTAL LABOUR $ - |s 150000
ay paniing
S PESUNGY TOTAL PARTS s - |s 7,569.09
nfirmation TOTAL 5 - | 15,069.09
| Nithoul Prajudice DS
| AR LESS EXCESS s ]
i 41 ba resurveyed and TOTAL AFTER EXCESS [3
il [rom Ingurancs LOompany
GST 7% 5 :
Acknowledged by Repairer GRAND TOTAL 5 =
REMARKS TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

THIS IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE FROM VISUAL INSPECTION AND SHOULD

THERE BE MORE DAMAGES FOUND DURING THE PROCESS OF
REPAIRING, YOU WILL BE INFORMED BEFORE THE REPAIRS ARE BEING
CARRIED OUT. TAKE NOTE THAT SHOULD ¥OU DECIDE NOT TO PROCEED

SLP5086T Page 2 of 3



WITH THE REPAIRS, A QUOTATION FEE OF 5400 WILL BE APPLIED
ACCORDINGLY FOR MAN-HOURS INVOLVED IN SOURCING FOR PARTS
PRICE AS WELL AS LABOUR CHARGES.

Authorised Signature

SLPSDBET Page 3 of 3
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TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD
NO:5 UBI CLOSE, SINGAPORE 408605
FINALISED COST OF REPAIRS

(&) ELROKARS

mazpa
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. HAME: Mr Teo Chek Wel WP : 31633
S Temasek Boulevard ADDRESS : Bk 5 Lorong Lew Lian EXCESS :
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five #10-108 DATE: 13-0ct-18
Singapore 038985 Singapore 530005
ATTN. MOTOR CLAIMS TEL ! 83220244
FAX :
WVEH NO : SLH7639C DATE IN : CONTACT PERSON : Ronald 63957875
CHASSIS NO ; IMEBMAZABGO346458  |MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : THIRD PARTY CLAIM
MODEL : MAZDAZ DATEREG.: | 17-Mov-16  |POLICY NO. :
NATURE ORKS
Parts Descr
NO ary REVISED PRICES
1 |FRONT BUMPER 1 MEBHR3-50-031B86 § 1,03L70 |5 103170
2 |RETAINER RHS 1 |MBHN1-50-0T1F 5 18.70 | § 18.70
3 |COVER RHS, FRONT BUMPER 1 |MBHN1-50-101 3 28.00
4 |CHROME RHS, FOGLAMP 1 IMBIEL-50-C12 S 10670
5 |COVER RHS, FOGLAMP 1 |MBIE1-S0-C11A 5 46.40
6 |FRONT REINFORCEMENT 1 [MB45A-50-070A $ 44450
7 |CLIP, FRONT BUMPER 12 IMC274-50-133 3 42.00 | 5 42.00
g |FASTENER, FRONT BUMPER 2 |MBA5A-56-145A $ 560 5 5.60
9  |GROMMET, FRONT BUMPER 2 |MGHPg-50-0Z5 5 5.40 | § 5.40
10 |BRACKET LHS, FRONT BUMPER 1 IMBHN1-50-152 $  1510(% 1510
11 |GRILLE TOP 1 IMBHN1-50-033 62 ¢ 335.00|% 33500
12 [RIVET, GRILLE TOP 6 | |Ms515-51-833 3§ 22.80 | & 22.80
13 |RIVET, GRILLE TOP 4 | |MTK21-50-355 3 34.80 | 5 34,80
14 |BRACKET TOP, GRILLE 1| |MBHN1-50-717D $ 10240
15 [FASTEMER, GRILLE 8 | MGDTA-50-EAL $ 2400 | 5 24.00
16 |CHROME LHS 1 | |MBHN1-50-7K1A s 17670
17 |CHROME RHS 1 | IMBHN1-50-7J1A $§ 176705 17670
18 |MASCOT, FRONT 1 |  MC235-51-731A $ 44,20 | 5 44.20
19 |FRONT GRILLE i | |MBIE1-50-T128 § 58160 |5 58160
20 |BRACKET LHS, FRONT GRILLE 1 | MBHN1-50-163 s 15.10 | 5 15,10
21 |BRACKET RHS, FRONT GRILLE i MBHN1-50-153 $ 15.10 | 5 15,10
22 |GROMMET, FRONT GRILLE 2 MKD45-50-E51 5 5.40
23 |PIN LOCATOR, FRONT GRILLE 2 |MKDA5-50-1K54 3 5.40
24 |RIVET, FRONT GRILLE 2 |MEAQ1-50-037 5 15.20
25 |FRONT PANEL UPPER 1 MB45A-53-1504 $§ 12400
26 |STAY LOCK E |MBASA-52-15Y L3 38,80
27 |FRONT SUPPORT PANEL 1 |MGHR5-53-1108 §  469.70
28 |FASTENER, PLATE SEAL 4 MKD45-50-EAL 3 10.00
29 |PLATE SET, FRONT REINFORCEMENT 1 | | MBHN3-50-1C0 3 92.70
30 |FASTENER, PLATE SET 4 | |MGD7A-50-EAL 5 12.00
31 |BONNET 1 MBHY0-52-31XA $ 1,067.30 | § 1,067.30

SLP5086T Page 10f 2




WEATHERSTRIP, BONNET ' 1

5 REPAIR DAYS (exclude preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)

SLP5086T Page 2 of 2

17 MBHNS-56-7704 5 63.60 | & £3.60
33 |HEADLAMP RHS 1 MBHTE-51-0314 5 2.245.00
34 |HID CONTROL UNIT 1 MBHNI-51-DH3 $  EOS &)
35 IGASKET, CONTROL UNIT 1 MC236-51-082 5 13.60
35 |RIVET, HEADLAMP 1 MBO92-51-833 5 3.30
37 |CLIP, HEADLAMP 2 MFBO1-50-133C 5 7.60
38 [RADIATOR COOLANT 1 5 £8.50

TOTAL PARTS § 3498705 B41010
LESS 10% s 34987 | 5 841,01
TOTAL PARTS COST $ 3,14883|%5 756909
Labour Cripti
TO REPLACE FRONT BUMPER, FRONT REINFORCEMENT, GRILLE TOP AND BONNET.
} [ MEBR-FRONTA |oepAIR ALL AREAS AFFECTED By THE ACHIOIG $ 132000 (5 2,640.00
I | MZ-SP-SFRTO4 |TO RESPRAY FROMT BUMPER, FRONT REINFORCEMENT, GRILLE TOP AND BONNET, 5 126000 (S5 252000
TO REMOVE & INSTALL RADIATOR, RADIATOR EAN AND FRONT SUPPORT PANEL. TO
3 | MZBR-PANELL |0oNDUCT PRESSURE TEST & PoR FORM LEAK TEST, 5 660,00
4 | MZ-BR-TOP-UP |TO REMOVE & INSTALL CONDENSOR, AIR COND FIPE AND TOP-UP GAS COOLING SYSTEM. S 6B0.00
5 | MZ-BR-PLATE1 |TO SUPPLY NUMBER PLATE, 5 70.00
& | MZ-BR-CAVITY [TO CARRY-OUT BODY GAVITY PRESERVATION. $ 250,00
7 | MZ-BR-ELECTR (TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING. 5 12000 | 5 250.00
8 | MZ-BR-REPROG [TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS, § 150,003 35000
8 | MZ-BR-SUNDR| |SUNDRIES. s 2000 [ 5 10000
TOTAL LABOUR $ 2,870.00 |$ 7,500.00
TOTAL PARTS 5§ 314883 |$ 7.569.09
TOTAL 5 6,018.83 | 5 15,069.00
LESS EXCESS 5 o
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS § 6,018.83
G5ST 7% s 421.32 | &% .
GRAND TOTAL 5 644015 |8 -
REMARKS:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
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ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CS/EGIM8018657/Uvbn2

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date : 12-12-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code : EGI
1. Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, ~ SGV 10188 Veh. Inspected SLH 7638C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SGV10195/SA/pl Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  YEE PEILI Assign Date 15M10/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDAZ (A) C.C 14596
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. JMEBMAZABGO345458 Colour RED
Odometer 37451 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTOME 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60R16 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date 12102018 Inspection Date 18M10/2018
Survey held at TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD
NO 5 UBI CLOSE
SINGAPORE 408605
5a, Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDIGE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




/ |
Al BE B

174 V4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Uibi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Req. Mo: 100807198k GST Reg. Mo 18-9607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 7639C

Page No.:1 of 3

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | FSLoCe {gﬂ {‘i]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER TORN 1,031.70 1.031.70
1|RETAINER RHS BENT 18.70 18.70
1|COVER RHS, FRONT BUMPER MOT NECESSARY 28.00
1|CHROME RHS FOGLAMP WOT MECESSARY 106.70 -
1|COVER RHS FOGLAMP NOT NECESSARY 45,40 -
1|FRONT REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 444 50 -
12|CLIP.,FRONT BUMPER NECESSARY 42 00 4200
2|FASTEMNER FRONT BUMPER NECESSARY 560 5.60
2| GROMMET FRONT BUMPER MECESSARY 5.40 5.40
1|BRACKET LHS FRONT BUMPER BENT 15.10 15.10
1|GRILLE TOP DISTORTED 335.00 335.00
&6|RIVET,GRILLE TOF MECESSARY 2280 22 B0
4|RIVET,GRILLE TOP NECESSARY 34 .80 34 BD
1|BRACKET TOP.GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 102.40 -
B{FASTENER . GRILLE NMECESSARY 24.00 24.00
1|CHROME LHS NOT NECESSARY 176.70 -
1|CHROME RHS CRACKED 178.70 176.70
1|MASCOT, FRONT NECESSARY 44.20 44 20
1|FRONT GRILLE CRACKED 581.60 581.60
1|BRACKET LHS,FRONT GRILLE MECESSARY 15.10 1510
1|BRACKET RHS5, FRONT GRILLE MECESSARY 15.10 15.10
2|GROMMET FRONT GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 540 -
2{PIN LOCATOR FRONT GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 540
2|RIVET FRONT GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 15.20 -
1|FRONT PANEL UPFER NOT NECESSARY 124 .00 -
115TAY LOCK NOT NECESSARY 38.80 -
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL NOT HNECESSARY 469,70 -
4|FASTENER, PLATE SEAL NOT NECESSARY 10.00 -
1|PLATE SET,FRONT REINFORCEMENT MOT NECESSARY 92,70 -
4|FASTEMER FLATE SET NOT NECESSARY 12.00 -

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18018657/Uvbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

._J; e 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 62568 4315
Reg. No: 199B07198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607 188-R Page Mo.:2 of 3
res Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
i s Workshop (§)| ()
1|BOMNET DENTED/ 1,067.30 1.067.30
BUCKLED
1|WEATHERSTRIP BONNET NECESSARY B3.60 63.60
1|HEADLAMP RHS NOT NECESSARY 2,245.00 .
1|HID CONTROL UNIT NOT NEGESSARY 895.50 -
1|GASKET . CONTROL UNIT NOT NECESSARY 13.60 A
1|RIVET HEADLAMP NOT NECESSARY 3.30
2|CLIP HEADLAMP NOT NECESSARY 7.60
1|RADIATOR COOLANT NOT NECESSARY £8.50 2
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -841.01 -340 87
7.569.09 3.148.83
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 100,00 20.00
1|NUMBER PLATE (SN) MOT NECESSARY 70.00
170.00 20.00
LABOUR
TO REPLACE FRONT BUMPER FRONT 2.640.00 1,320.00
REINEORCEMENT.GRILLE TOP AND BONNET REPAIR
ALL AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT.
TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER, FRONT 2 520.00 1,260.00
REINFORCEMENT GRILLE TOP AND BONNET
T REMOVE & INSTALL RADIATOR, RADIATOR FAN AND |NOT NECESSARY 660.00 -
FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TO CONDUCT PRESSURE
TEST & PERFORM LEAK TEST.
TO REMOVE & INSTALL CONDENSOR.AIR COND PIPE NOT MECESSARY 650,00 -
AND TOP-UP GAS COOLING SYSTEM.
TO CARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION, NOT NECESSARY 250.00 2
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER 250.00 120.00
FUNCTIONING.
TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR 350.00 150,00
WORKS.
7.330.00 2.B50.00
GRAND TOTAL 15,069.09 6,018.83
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 6,018.83

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18018657/Uvbn2
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CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

[4SCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD FARTIES:- This Rleport is made sclely for the use and banafit of the Client named on the frant page of this Report.




