Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Katherine Chong <katherine.chong@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 January 2019 3:58 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Adam Ng Chun Wei

Cc: Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); Liu Chun Cheong

Subject: RE: VANTAGE/ REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKP8805C AND SKK1212K ON

27/09/2018 -TP CHINA

Hi Shirley,
I did check with the client and client mention cancel to make an accident claim.
Thank You.

Regards,

Katherine Chong

Senior Admin

Vantage Automotive Limited

305 Alexandra Road

#02-01 Vantage Automotive Limited
Singapore 159942

Email: katherine.chong @simedarby.com.sg
DID:+65 6477 7364

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, October 24, 2018 9:26 AM

To: Adam Ng Chun Wei

Cc: BIE ©; Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); shabir.abdul.hamid@simedarby.com;
sgchong.kean.yap@simedarby.com.sg; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan

Subject: RE: VANTAGE/ REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKP8805C AND SKK1212K ON 27/09/2018 -TP CHINA

Dear Adam,

kindly check with claims officer Catherine Thia as email address :
catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 7:35 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: VANTAGE/ REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKP8805C AND SKK1212K ON 27/09/2018 -TP CHINA

CS/CTI118018641/R1sd3



Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Adam Ng Chun Wei <adam.ng.chunwei@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 8:44 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid <shabir.abdul.hamid@simedarby.com.sg>; Chong Kean Yap
<chong.kean.yap@simedarby.com.sg>; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan <natarajan.k.rajan@simedarby.com.sg>
Subject: Re: VANTAGE/ REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKP8805C AND SKK1212K ON 27/09/2018 -TP CHINA

Dear LKK Team,

Any updates on liability for this case?
Thank you

Regards,

Adam Ng

Customer Service Advisor
AutoFrance ( PEUGEOT ) / Regent Motors (FORD)
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