Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2018 10:25 AM
To: SUR

Subject: FW: MCT18100346

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:olivialau@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 19 October, 2018 10:20 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; assighments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: MCT18100346

From: Mekavathanan Sarangapani

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2018 10:20:46 AM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: fleetsafety@cdgtaxi.com.sg; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Sundari Nagarajan - III

Subject: MCT18100346

Dear Sirs,

Need CCTV footage

Also status if Insured claim against TP

Olivia and Team frontal damage to TP vehicle consistent .

Sundari will arrange to fwd CCTV fooatge to assist in your team’s assessment if damages claimed by TP is
consisent, also liability issues .

Meka



DETAILS OF (WYN VEHICLE

Wehicle Registration Number SHBO33Z

Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Cwner COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
Co Reg Na 186303821R

Email Address FLEETSAFETY@CODGTAXI COM.SG
Maobile Phone Mo

Alternative Phaone Mo OFFICE-B3508758

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer HYUNDAI

fodel 140

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time af accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance palicy NG
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken REPCRETING OMLY

Wehicle Category TAX]

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
Type Of Coverage THIRD PARTY FIRE ANDIGR THEFT

Fleet Paolicy YES

Policy Mumber MCOMODM S

Cover Mote Mumber

Criver

Mame of Driver TAM TONG MENG
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

[Created by adjuste

Insured:
Main Claimant: FUSIOMN CAR RENTALS PTE LTD
:f_'_'“'ﬂ Red-  gjT5248X Date of Loss: [12/10/2018 08:00 - :5
3 : Policy/Cover
Claim Type: TP Mote MNo.:
Wehicle Req. Policy No.
Mo. (Insured): SRS (Claimant):
Excess:
Repairer: V8 Motor Werkz Pte Ltd (HQ) Jiv/g IS8 BLK 8 #01-44 SIN MING IND EST SECTOR C, 575630 Sin M
:_.a;f_ll.rn_g India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63475100 ... [Handled by Sundari Nagarajan - ¢
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6255-3561 ... [Handled by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final R

CLAIM MOT REGISTERED

This claim is not registered. Click to register this claim.
You need to register a claim if you want to link other related subfolders to it.

ASS0CIATED MAIL RECEIVED

There are no mail for this case,
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TP VEHICLE/INJURY DETAILS

i

DOCUMENTE

[CURRENTLY VIEWING]
= TP reported: SITS5248X.

purchased]
= TP reported: SHB033Z.

Best Regards,

Mekavathanan
HOD
Motor Claims Department
India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street, #04/#05 10B Building, Singapore 049711
DID: 6347 6105 Fax: 6224 4174
W lrpia
O vrermaTIONAL
) INSIJMNCE

3 HG A PFPDRE
Sarvimg the regiow niaoe 1807

Related Accident Reports
« B - MCD618132389 submitted on 12/10/2018 10:21 to India International Insurance Pte Ltd ...

« LS - MCA118132405 submitted on 12/10/2018 10:43 to Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd ...



Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



