Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 26 June 2019 4:15 PM
To: Nancy Lam; jason@fastechauto.com.sg
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SKW 6886U AND SJR 3479U ON 13.10.2018
Attachments: DV CTl.pdf
Tracking: Recipient Delivery
Nancy Lam

jason@fastechauto.com.sg

Admin A

olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 26/6/2019 4:15 PM
Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 26/6/2019 4:15 PM
shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 26/6/2019 4:15 PM

Our Ref: CC4/CTI18019399/Uka3n2
Your Ref: SLD3036P

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return back the original hard copy to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nancy Lam <nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 June 2019 3:11 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; jason@fastechauto.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SKW 6886U AND SJR 3479U ON 13.10.2018

Our Ref: CC6/CT118018635/Uka3n2
Your Ref: SKW6886U



Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We do accept your offer as below.

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2019 2:49 PM

To: Nancy Lam <nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg>; jason@fastechauto.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SKW 6886U AND SJR 3479U ON 13.10.2018

Our Ref: CC6/CT118018635/Uka3n2
Your Ref: SKW6886U

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $5,900.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nancy Lam <nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 June 2019 11:32 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SKW 6886U AND SJR 3479U ON 13.10.2018




Without prejudice,
Dear Khanchna,

Any update for the above vehicle?

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, June 13, 2019 11:24 AM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (chewht@lkkauto.com)' <chewht@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SKW 6886U AND SJR 3479U ON 13.10.2018

Without prejudice,
Dear Hsiao Tong,
Any update for the above vehicle?

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, April 23,2019 3:18 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (chewht@lkkauto.com)' <chewht@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SKW 6886U AND SJR 3479U ON 13.10.2018

Without prejudice,
Dear Hsiao Tong,
Please refer to our LOD dated 07.11.2018.

We have yet to receive any reply pertaining to the claim settlement.

Please revert.

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6746 5405



Fax: 6745 8520



