Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 June, 2019 11:50 AM

To: Chris Bulaclac

Cc: Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Mars Ler; Renemer Bagang;
Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Re : Outstanding Debt as of 14/06/2019 Your Ref SLV 9311K LKK REF
CC3/CTI18018627/Aha3

Attachments: DV.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Chris,
We refer further to our below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer settlement as below:

Cost of Repair (w/gst) $ 2,396.80
Loss of Use ($60 x 3 days) S 180.00
GIA Search Fee S 2.00

TOTAL $2,578.80

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward the original signed hard copy to us (LKK) for
payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to CYCLE & CARRIAGE — FULCO MOTOR DEALER PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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" Save the Larth- Print only whernr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 14 June, 2019 4:05 PM

To: Chris Bulaclac

Cc: Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Mars Ler; Renemer Bagang; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic
(LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Re : Outstanding Debt as of 14/06/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Chris,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that till date, we are still pending for mandate approval from our principal for both cases.
We will continue to follow up and will get back to you for an update the soonest time.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F EFES e
SemmEwm e Save the Larthe Print only wherr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Chris Bulaclac [mailto:chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 14 June, 2019 3:51 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Mars Ler; Renemer Bagang
Subject: Re : Outstanding Debt as of 14/06/2019

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please see below

S/NO Insurance Vehicle No. Type of Claim Date Invoice aculia: Cost of Rey
Company Date

1 CHINA INSURANCE | SKH8892S DIRECT 20.11.2018 17.10.2018 S 7,67¢

SETTLEMENT o o a




DIRECT
2 CHINA INSURANCE | SLV9311K SETTLEMENT 23.11.2018 | 08.10.2018 S 2,39¢

This 3 cases has been outstanding for a long time , please assist to settle once and for all.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Christopher L. Bulaclac

Assistant Manager — Customer Service
H/P 96552177 D/D 65949160

email : chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sq
Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd
330 UBI Road 3 Singapore 408650

Tel : 67461000 Fax : 64875857

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 24 April 2019 22:49

To: Chris Bulaclac <chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
<olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Re : Outstanding Debt as of 06032019

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Kindly refer to the LKK Remarks in blue.

We will follow up and get back to you asap.

S/NO ::n:;':::: \I\ﬁr'\icle Z}l;renc’f ﬁ\avt:ice g:rt:Ldent Cost of Repair | Loss of Use | Loss of Car Re
1 ICNH;L'\J'RAANCE GBG2849U SDS_E&MENT 12.11.2018 | 12.09.2018 | $  5,860.39 | s .
2 ICNH;L'\J'RAANCE SKH88925 SDS_E&MENT 20.11.2018 | 17.10.2018 | §  7,67939 | $ 48000 | $
3 f:NHSIl'j:ANCE $J52255A EéRT?ngENT 12.11.2018 | 31.08.2018 | $  6,067.97 | $ 32000 $
4 ICNH;L'\J'RAANCE SLV9311K SDS'I;:'EEFMENT 23.11.2018 | 08.10.2018 | $  2,396.80 | $  240.00 | $

Best Regards,



Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chris Bulaclac <chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 11:13 AM
To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: Re : Outstanding Debt as of 06032019

Hi Both,

Kindly assist on below email , until now we have not receive any update on this matter.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Christopher L. Bulaclac

Assistant Manager — Customer Service

H/P 96552177

D/D 65949160

email : chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sq

Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd

330 UBI Road 3 Singapore 408650
Tel : 67461000 Fax : 64875857

From: Chris Bulaclac

Sent: Wednesday, 6 March 2019 14:27
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)
Cc: Mars Ler (mars.ler@ccfulco.com.sg); Renemer Bagang

Subject: Re : Outstanding Debt as of 06032019

Dear Hsiao Tong & Vic

Dear Both,

May we remind you that according to our records the below amount is due for payment? If you have paid within the

last few days please accept our apologies for troubling you and disregard the reminder of this letter.

If however, your account is outstanding then early settlement would be appreciated. We would ask that full
payment reaches our office by the 01 April 2019 .

Outstanding Debts As of

China  06/03/2019
Vehicle Accident
S/NO Insurance Company | No. Type of Claim Date Invoice | Date Cost of Repair | Loss
1 | CHINA INSURANCE GBG2849U SDE”;?L:IIMENT 12.11.2018 12.09.2018 S 5,860.39 | S
2 [ CHINA INSURANCE SKH8892S SDE”;?L:IIMENT 20.11.2018 17.10.2018 S 7,679.39 | S
3 [ CHINA INSURANCE SJS2255A SDE”;?L:IIMENT 12.11.2018 31.08.2018 S 6,067.97 | S

4



DIRECT
4 | CHINA INSURANCE SLV9311K | SETTLEMENT

|23.11.2018 |08.10.2018 |$ 2,396.80 | S

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Christopher L. Bulaclac

Assistant Manager — Customer Service
H/P 96552177 D/D 65949160

email : chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sq
Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd
330 UBI Road 3 Singapore 408650

Tel : 67461000 Fax : 64875857




