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- man Pt L Company Registration Ha, 198607198R

S1UBIAVE 1, 80215 PAYA UKL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) #25635h1 FAN : (065) 61364015

Your ref: TBA
Our refl: CCH/EQII8018604/T 1hal Date: A0/ 12018

The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SKG 6852B
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 23.10.2018
at the premises of M/fs CarCrafters Singapore Pte Ltd have the following to report:-

Warkshop Estimate Amount : 5§ 4,885.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 1,110.00
"Check” Items Amount 1 5% 1,030.00
Total (Including Check lItems) : S8 2,140.00
Market Value : 88 -
LTA Reimbursement Value ;55 -
Nett Value 1 5% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages al the i
Rear Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3.0  days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser
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Repair Estimate
48 Ton Guan Road East Te B2ET DO1E
EQ insurnnce Company Lid #05-155 Entarprise Hub Fax B28T §313
5 Mamwirll Road Singapore BOSSSE www CRICTENETs sg
#17-00 Tower Block Dhate : | 1-001-2018
MND Comples \ehicle Num : SKGEBS2E
Singapore (69110 MsheMudel : VW TIGUAN 2.0 TSI
Chassis Yo : WYGZZZENZDWO007B0
e e Tora
1 lLower sPoiLER 1 5 25000 |8 Cné " aso00 )
1 |REAR HUMPER 1 ] T40.00 | § r{}' 740.00 |
4 |REINFORCEMENT 1 s woo0|s 1 asoco | VAN
§ |BUMPER GUIDE PIECE LH 1 $ 2800 % s zme0| WA
& _|BUMPER GUIDE PIECE RH 1 s 34008 X zapn| ww
7_|END PANEL 1 $ sooools o 500,00 WA
8 |LICENSE PLATE LIGHT 1 s mools K amoo WA
10 |REFLECTOR LH 1 [ 3800 8 X o0 |
12 |REFLECTOR RH 1 s seools K ameo| WA
13 |PARKING SENSOR rAEE D 160.00 | § T sampt Mohed
- _ JOTAL fmrs = ] 2,685.00
e — s | )| | -
1_|To removel replacel refit & panel rear portion of realigned rear s _.gﬁ'*-‘-‘ 1,000,00 |+
|bumper, end panasi, lower spoller & other affected arme
2 |To putty & respray rear bumper, taiigats, end panel, s 400 somml
& other affected accident area.
3 _|To check sccident affectsd wiring systam & recover. ] {":' £0.00 |
4 |To remove, refix rear sensor. $ L oo
§ [To recode & decode engine management system & laull code .r/lﬂ“’
clearing after repair works.
TOTAL 5 488500
GST 1% s 241,95
! Fa __ GRAMDTOTAL § 5,226.95
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Vic iI.I{KAutu}

From: Tony Ong <tony@carcrafterssg>

Sent: Monday, 25 February, 2019 6:10 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); ‘Jeslyn - VAG Singapore’; Claims Assistance - VAG Singapore

Subject: Re: SUBMISSION OF CLAIMS DOCUMENT FOR 55KGE8528 LKK REF
CC6/EQI18018604/T1ha3

Without Prejudice

Thanks for your quick reply. We accept the offer $1,906.35 before GST.
Awaiting vour DV soonest.

Regards

Tony

On 25/2/2019 5:28 PM, Vie (LKKAuto) wrote:
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Faisal,
We refer further to the below email,

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settiement on a without admission of
liability to our Insured’s part, we offer settlement as below:

Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 1,358.90
Loss of Rental (5180 x 3 days) S 540,00
LTA Search Fee S 745
= STOTALS e BONTC RN

For your acceptance please. Kindly note that no DV is required.
The above amount is to be made payable to CARCRAFTERS SINGAPORE PTE LTD.
Thank you.

"Plegse note thot cur cbove offer and any settlement arising from the obove cffer are made on o without
prejudice basis, ond should not be construed as an admission of llability on our part or on the port of our Insured
Driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference
shall be made to this affer or any settlement arising from this affer in ony other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of oniginal documents on demand at any time and
execution of Discharge Voucher (for settiement sum above $§20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further oli
original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment on the settlement sum.



CarCrafters

CarCrafters Singapore Pte Ltd Tel: +65 62679916

48 Toh Guan Road East Fax: +65 6267 9313
#05-155 Enterprise Hub www.carcrafters.sg
Singapore 608586

Our Ref: File 242 -SKG 6852 B WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Date: 26™ DECEMBER 2018 (AR Registered)
Attention: Motor Claim Department
EQ Insurance Company Ltd

5 Maxwell Road
#17-00 Tower Block
MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Dear Sir / Ma’am,

TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5KG6852B & FBD3708C ALONG CLEMENTI AVE 2 TOWARDS CLEMENTI ROAD
DATED 10/10/18 @ 0920 HRS

We have been authorized by SURTECO PTE LTD, the owner of vehicle number: SKG 6852 B, to claim against the
party/parties responsible for the damages arising from the above-mention accident.

Our record show that you are the insurer of vehicle number: FBD 3708 C, at the material time of the accident with
the driver of our client’s vehicle, SURTECO PTE LTD.

As a result of the accident caused by your Insured Driver’s negligent and/or management of your insured vehicle
Number: FBD 3708 C, our client’s vehicle was damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

{1) Cost of Repairs (Including GST) 51,358.90

{2) Loss of Use -3 Days [Rental Car) S600.00

(3) LTA Search receipt 57.45
$1,966.35

A Copy of each of the following supporting documents are enclosed:
{1] Repairer Invoice, Rental invoice, LTA Receipt, LOA & Discharged voucher

Our Ref: File 242 - SKG 6852 B



CarCrafters

CarCrafters Singapore Pte Ltd Tel: +65 62679916

48 Toh Guan Road East Fax: +65 6267 9313
#05-155 Enterprise Hub www.carcrafters.sg
Singapore 608586

We would appreciate if you could look into the subject matter and let us have your favorable offer within 14 days.
If you are agreeable to the settiement of the above said claims, please made payment to “CarCrafters Singapore
Pte Ltd"

Please note that if we do not hear from you within the stipulated 14 days, we will have no alternative but to
appoint our solicitor to act on our behalf to commence proceedings against you without further notice to you.

Yours faithfully,

(

F '. -
-~ ,/

Claims Department — Md Faisal Bin Masrif

Email: faisal@carcrafters sg
NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via emall or phone call to expedite all matters
PS: Please quote our reference number when replying

c.c Client — SURTECO PTE LTD



Vic (LKKAuto)

————— e ———

From: Vic (LEKAuUto)
Sent: Thursday, 18 October, 2018 12:13 PM
To: mikesiowl3@yahoo.com.sg
Cc: Admin A Vie (LKKAuta)
Subject: Your Ref:FBD 3708C_ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBD 3708C AND SKG 68528 ON
10/10/2018
Auro
USRS e

ads BRA B P L

§1 UK AVE |, #01.25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (065) 62563561 FAN : 1065) 62564313
Our Ref: CCB/EQI18018604/ha3

18 SEPTEMBER 2018

SIOW BOON FONG

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBD 3708C AND SKG 68528 ON 10/10/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us, We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consullants Pte Lid

Phone: 6B41-20096 | email: vicalpeh@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

r ey

i

SeSR2R ST Save the Earth Print only when necessary-

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inlended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintenhded reciplent is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. Il you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any atlached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sander thal you have daleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



To:

-

CarCrafters Singapore Pte Ltd
48 Toh Guan Road East #05-155
Enterprise Hub

Singapore 608586

mmnmmmm;uunmm.qtékﬁﬂﬁ anoEDZ 8  on__ (o0 K
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e _SURTECO 9156 VP the owner of motor vehicle noSKACEIE (my vehicie®) hereby sppoint you and

horize you te commerce repairs to my vehicle. Except for cases where direct settiement i1 made with the opposite party’s
insurers, you will only commence repairs only upon receipt of notification from my/our appointed solicitors that |/we have
appointed to act for me/us in the daim in respect of the above caption.

Pending notification by my/our solicitors 1o you, |/we suthorize you to appolnt a surveyor to survey the damages to my vehicle and
to do all necessary worlk | "the preliminaries”) with a view to expediting the repairs to my vehicle in the event that /'We decide not
1o procesd with the repairs to my vehicle after the preliminaries were done and/or arranged by you. |/We agres to pay for all the
expenses incurred for the preliminanes

You shall not be llable for any delay in the repairs to my vehicle for delays occasioned by the delay in notification by my/our
appointed solicitors that |/We have appointed them ta act for me/us in the claim in respect of the above caption,

I/We also authorize you to llaise with and give all necessary instructions to my/our solicitors a3 If the instructions are given by me/us
with respect 1o the conduct of my/our claim against the third party driver and/or his insurers Including, if necessary to commence
legal proceedings in my/our name agaimt the third party  Further. |/We have suthorized my/our solicitors to direct all
correspondence including documents in support of my/our claim and court documents to you as my/our nominated representstive
o facilitate the settlement of my/our daim.

In consideration of you agreeing not to collect from me/fus the repair costy, rental fees for another vehicle (If applicabie) and
surveyor's fees now. |/We agree to assign the whle proceeds of my/our third party claim to you_ In this regard, |/We shall authaorize
myfour salicitors to receive the settlement sum from the third party’s insurers and for our salicitors to release all the balance of the
settiement funds less the legal costs and disbursements, directly to you whom |/We have 10 authorized and |/We hereby absolve
you and the third party’s insurers of any and all lability during your/their course of following any/or all of my/our instructions.
My/Our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irrevacable authority to pay the compensation amount in my/our third party claim
directly to you after deducting of their costs on a solicitor and client basis_ in the event that the third party insurers should make
payment to the settlement sum directly to me/us. we will notify you and/or our solicitors of same and make payment to my/our
solicitors the settlemant sum so recerved by me/us for my solicitors’ necessary action

in the event that my/our claim or suit for damages against the third party Is unsuccessful or is dismissed for whatever reasons, |/We
understand that [/we shall be liable to pay the legal costs of the third party and the sum of monies due 1o you Including the survey
fees and any other costs and disbursements and incidentals incurred by you

lirnyfundnmwthtrwdmyndrwmmmumrcuﬂulurmmhmﬂmHMnrﬂmmmmu
settiement Is not honored or satisfied by the third party, |/we authorize you to make a claim under my own maotor comprehensive
palicy for the repair costs and other losses recoverable under the palicy. In this respect, |/we understand and accept that the escess
amount under the policy shall be barne by me/us.

it for whatever reason, my/our insurers reject my/our claim [or indemnity for the repair costs and/or other losses recoverable under
the policy or offer ta pay less than the amount claimed by you, |/we agree and undertake to pay the full amount of your repalr bill,
survey fee and other expenses reasanably incurred on my/our behalf or to pay you the difference in amount as the case may be

I/We lurther understand that |/we may recelve communications from the third party’s imurers including but not limited to
statements to be signed by me/us confirming that all items being claimed were caused by the accident or letter of offer/proposal at
settlement enclasing discharge voucher. |/We undertake that we will not communicate with the third party’s insurers or sign any
documents whatsoever ar do any act which will jeopardise my/our claim; but rather |/we will direct all communications and forward
all documents recenved by me/us to you of 1o our solicitors.

& e Vyoms O o

Signature / Company Stamp

e o THILR




CarCrafters

CarCrafters Singapore Pte Ltd

48 Toh Guan Road Eas! Tel S267 9516
#05-155. Enterpnse Hup Fax 8267 8312
Singapore 608586 WWw carcrafters sg

[ Co Reg No.: 2014085208 |

SATISFACTION CUM DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Claim No: I'P/ OD Invoice No

[' COMPREHENSIVE

Messrs: Q\lr‘tftt- P‘h' 'i“‘_,_
( HM«; tkﬂ_'}f v v )

I/'We hereby declare that the repairs 1o my/our motor vehicle model

THIRD PARTY [ | oD CLAIM WINDSCREEN

VUJ_ ‘[l ﬁuﬂi‘l ] [ & 'I.'gl

Vehicle Registration No f.;t'.ﬁ C»'S'.:- pI have been completed by CarCratters Sin.

Pte Ltd at 48 Toh Guan Road Easi. 205-153, Enterprise Hub. Singapore #08356

satisfaction. I/'We agree that the pavment of their account for such repairs shal

seitlement and discharge of all claims under Policy No VR I P‘E"‘{’GTJ n e

oy

W

damage caused to My/Our said motor vehicle s accident an \ﬂ‘f‘ﬂ' 2013 (? ‘?’1_}!:4"1 )

'r \
Dniver’s Signature: ot “'( wl “"‘“":'-_ Owner’s Signature :
Name Name f
NRIC . NRIC:
L
Witness Signature: Dated: 3""_( [1%
Time Discharged: '?'I; bis

CarCrafiers Singapore Pre Ltd

m: Ll F i
Upon conclusion with the Third Party claim, the Discharge Voucher has to be signed oy you. in the even

ou refuse to sign the DV, you are liable for tha repair cost and other disbursement INCUrrea



TAX INVOICE

CarCrafters Singapore Pte Ltd
CarCrafters AR oh s Bt o P (85) 6267 9313
The Soray Paint & Bodywork Specialisi SUPRUA . S i -

Invoice No. : INV2018-120039 o T . ACTSNZOWON?E0

Invoice Date 26/12/2018 Mileage 000000

Job No, S502018-00675 Colour Code

Date Out Fuel 1i4

Payment Terms 30 Days Cash Card Yes

Payment Mode INS CLAIM Vehicle Make & Model VW Tiguan 4motion 2.0

Invoice To :

EQ insurance

Tel 62230433

Emai: 0

S/N Hem No, Description Qty Price (SGD) Amount (SGD)

1 410030 Lower Spoiler 1 250.00 250,00

2 410030 Parking Sensor 1 160.00 160,00

3 420070 Ta RemoveRaplace/Refil & Panel Rear Porbon of 1 300.00 300.00
Reasiigned Rear Bumper, End Pansl & Lower Spoier

4 410010 To Putly & Respray Rear Bumper, Tallgate. End 1 400.00 400 00
Panel. & Other Affected Accident Area

- 420070 To Check Accent Affected Winng System & recoves 1 3000 3000

-] 420070 To Remove, Reliz Rear Semsor 1 30.00 3000

7 420070 To recoce & Decode Engine Management System & 1 100.00 100.00
Faul Coge Clearing After Rapair Works

Note

* Interest for lake payment will be charged at 1% per month on all cverdus invoces
* Balance due 10 be paid and ordered goods mus! be collectad within 3 months from Deposit date in order 1o avesd forfeture of Deposit
Armount

* Quotes vaidity: 14 days

| cartity that | have received all products in good condilion and confirm thal sl services have Sub Total 1.270.00

been satisfactority completed | understand thal goods solkd are not refurmatile and herety

absoive CarCrafiers Singapore Pie Lid of any iabitty ansing from use therefrom GST 7% 88 90
Total SGD 1,158.90

Customer Signature Prepared By:

GST REGISTRATION NO: 201405620M

BANK ACCOUNT: DBS Bank -107-801991-8



Invoice

SURTECO PTE LTD Invoice No

C/O CARCRAFTERS SINGAPORE PTE LTD Invoice Date :
Due Date
VHA No
Referral ID

Description :

Rental for 3 Day/s (@ $200 per Day

Vehicle No : SLT6006Y

Vehicle Description : Mazda62.0A

Rental Period ;o 23/1072018 to  25/10/2018

Total Amount Payable
{ f le 2 d )

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #¥06-04 Premiar@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875

Tel: 8315 8479 HP: 9833 DBOT

UEN: 2015051200

:GPLINODO1007

26/1072018

:26/10/2018
: 1283
:C061

Amount

$ 600.00

1 $ 600.00



GOOD WAY RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD 104

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #06-04 Premier@Kaki Bukit Singapors 415675 VHA No:

Tel; 6315 84T H/P; BB33 0807 invoice No:
EN: 2015081200 mmmm Hirer’s Venicle No
HIRER'S PARTICULARS ' e T L ————
mmmuc:_}_.._, £lst Mileage Out Milaage Out
NRIC/FINNo: . = L _ Make & Modek Auto / Manual j
m-m 7 ""'."""*" iry L P . HAZOR
(=04 LLBILS Out - Date Time: T
""“"""'-“'EE"'" —— HIRE / PERIOD EXPIRY Time:
=9 [ = &)
- NON-WAIVER EXCESS=%
Occupation: ' | Driving Expx
Singapore Dring Licence No: CHARGES
lsveOute: ___ DateofBithc | Daly o per day
Teb (O] R HP:4esdd Wty et e wiseh
Name: (msini/C)_— .
Lo e BN { Hours a5 per haur
Acciress (Res): B T e Extension ot
B Dalivery/Collecbon Senvice ,
Occupation: Driving Exp: =~ 1
Sngapore Drving Licence No- SUB-TOTAL § - i.
lssue Date: DateofBeth | PETROLLEVEL
i " WP ——— low E wvel14l3e 1250 v4 70 F
VEHICLE CHECK LIST In E 18 1/4l3m 1258 4 78 F
Fuel
E REAR Trathic / Parking Fines
8 % TOTAL CHARGES §
an : -
E of 7
g-: RIGHT FRONT Top Hirer's Signatune :
MISSING / FAULTY ACCESSORIES / PARTS
REMARKS 2!
Additional Driver's Signature
H'-nr-d hhm-lmm:mbuliiﬁlﬂh If | have presented a charge/credit card lor payment. | thait
umnh“um may be billed to that account and my n:::.:ih

mnmmmmhw voucher All imformution | have given GOOD WAY RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD in connaction
with this agreement i true.

IMPORTANT

1 VEMICLE B BTRICTLY PROHIBITED FOR “HIRE FOR MEWARDS" UAGE BUICH AL LIBFH | CRARCAR | GRABSHANE ETT

@ ONLY FERSON ABOVE 29 YRARS OF AGE WITH NOFEE THAN 7 YEARS DFVING EXPERIENCE AL THORISED LICENSED AMD SIGHNING THES AGHEEMENT MAT DRVE THE VEHICLE.
1 ALL PRAING At TIAFFIC WOLATIONS ARE THE RESPOMNSIBILITY OF THE HIER. AN ADMINSTRATIVE CHARGE WILL B LEVIED D% AN TRAFFIC WOUATIOME REDIRECTED
& T VIRER SrALL N LOAHLE FON EXCESS CHARGES FOR ANY [ATE RETURS AT THE RATE BOWN PER HOUR R PER DAY, INCLUSAVE OF COW ANDVOR Pay WHERE APPUCARLE
L W CANE OF ACCIDEMT THE HIREN Sl IEPOIT 70 RENTAL OFFICE IEMEDMTRLY B THERE 13 BOCALY SULRTES. & FOLICE REPORAT MUST GE WADE WITHIN 34 HOURS.

B VEHICLE 18 HTRICTLY FOM SINCIPOIE LIS CHLr AME NAY MO 8 NN DU CF BIMGAPORE WITHOUT SI0M CONSENT OF THE COMIMMY (00D Wi BENT-ACAR PTE 1D

FETURM OF VEMCLE THE HERER { DRIVER & AELISED 10 SIGN N THE COLUUN * SGNATURE OF SFER - [FIVER * Pl 0l It THE D D TIME SETTTED BELOW frALs. DEEMED
TO BE THE DAY AND TIME THE VEHICLE & RETUANED TO GOOD Wi HENT-A-CAR PTE LTD AMD THE SAME SHALL BE ACCEPTED A5 CONCLUSIVE EVIDENCE OF THE SAME AND
AL NETT B CHALLENGED OR QUESTIONED C%) ANY ACTIRMT WHATSOEVER.

DATEIN | TIMEIN | MILEAGE | cHECKED BY REMARKS @

SIGNATURE OF HIRER/DRIVER

\
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Land i:;i:h;nr‘x\urf Wit

Land Transpon Autharty
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapare STST0
GST Registration No. | M4-0006529-2
Print Data/Time 11 Oct 2018/ 11:49:34

Recaipt Date/Time : 11 Oct 2018/ 11:49:34

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. ITNET-00000-181011-000782
Pravious Receipt No.
SN em Description/ Amount GS5T Amount
Business Transaction Reference Beforse Amount After GST
No. GST (S5) (S$) (S8)

Result of Insurance Enguiry - FBD3TOBC

As ai 10 Oct 2018/08:20:00

Insurancs Co. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
| insurance Enquiry - FBD3T08C

Enquiry Fee 7.00 149 T4@
201B1011114740506684
Sub-Total T.00 048 T4
Total Bafore Rounding 7.00 048 T4
Rounding Differsncs 0,04
Total Amount Payabile TAS
Pmd By
oooooooopocBdd 3 Cracit Carck T45
YisaMasterCarg
Totnl Tas
Casn Change o.00
Tandened Amount TA5
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authorily are good and promptly settied by the payment service
provider | financial institution. Otherwise. the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

Print Receipt OK Save as PDF

LRS-/ VLB, QOV.SOMB/ VIV BCTION COMpPeSilr By TTMNL /LML | I I 120
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Pre L1d Company Registration No. 198607 108R
S AVE 1, M12-28 PAVA LI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SING APORE 408933 TEL { (0651 62863581 FAX : (D65) 62564315
To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 28/02/2018
THIRD DIRECT SE
Vehidle N FBD 3708C (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DMMPHQ17-000570
ehicle No.
SKG 68528 (TP Veh) |Our Ref No.: CCB/EQI18018604/T1hadq2
Date of Accident 10/10/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost % 1,358.90
Loss of Use 2 days
Rental (If any) .9 540.00 3 days
Others: 5 7.45
' $
1.906.35
Final Settlement Sum |[: § 1,906.35
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1)

CARCRAFTERS SINGAPORE PTELTD

i

:$ 1.806.35

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusinal Park, Singapore 408533

TEL 6258 3561 FAX: 8256 4315

Reg No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9507188-R

Affiliated to Federation internationale Dos Experts En Automobile

5 MAXWELL ROAD

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 068110

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Rel CCE/EQI1B018604/T 1haldg2

Date: 28-02-2018

A

Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FBD 3708C - Veh. Inspected SKG 68528
Policy No. DMMPHQ17-000970 Coverage ($) 0.00
Clalm No. Excess ($) D.00
Assign From Assign Date 15M10/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN TIGUAN c.C 1884
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. a0z
Chassis No. WVGZZZENZDWOOOTED Colour SILVER
Odometer 58750 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Madification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/55 R17 MICHELIN 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |235/55 R17 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |235/55 R17 MICHELIN B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |235/55 R17 MICHELIN B mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 10/10/2018 Inspection Date 23M0/2018
Survey held at CARCRAFTERS SINGAPORE PTE LTD
48 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST
#05-155 ENTERPRISE HUB
SINGAPORE 608536
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




’ L” V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
- TEL 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4115
Reg. No; 199607 188R GST Reg No. 18-8607188-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE ND. SKG 6852B
: E | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By
iy P Workshop ($) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LOWER SPOILER CRACKED 250.00 250.00
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE T40.00
LABOUR
1|REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 390.00 =
1|BUMPER GUIDE PIECE LH NOT NECESSARY 28.00
1|BUMPER GUIDE PIECE RH NOT NECESSARY 34,00
11END PANEL NOT NECESSARY 500.00
1|LICENSE PLATE LIGHT NOT NECESSARY 27.00 -
1|REFLECTOR LH NOT NECESSARY 38.00 -
1|REFLECTOR RH NOT NECESSARY 38.00 -
4 |PARKING SENSOR @$160.00 SHORTED (1 PCS 640,00 160.00
ONLY)
' 2 B85.00 410,00
LABOUR
TO REMOVEREFPLACE /REFIT & PANEL REAR PORTICN 1.000.00 300,00
OF REALIGNED REAR BUMPER ,END PANEL LOWER
SPOILER & OTHER AFFECTED AREA.INCLUSIVE OF THE
REPAIR OF REAR BUMPER
TOPUTTY & RESPRAY REAR BUMPER TAILGATE END 1,000.00 400.00
PANEL.& OTHER AFFECTED ACCIDENT AREA
TO CHECK ACCIDENT AFFECTED WIRING SYSTEM & 50.00 30.00
RECOVER
TO REMOVE REFIX REAR SENSDR 50.00 30.00
TO RECODE & DECODE ENGINE MANAGEMENT 100.00 100.00
SYSTEM & FAULT CODE CLEARING AFTER REPAIR
WORKS
2.,200.00 860.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,885.00 1,270.00
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 1,270.00|

Repori'Ref No. CCE/EQI18018604/T1ha3q2

M | fﬁnﬂ

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automotive Assassor
Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES - Thas Repan is mads saisiy inr ine use eng penein of e Clisn named on 1ha iron page of mis Repon




