Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 December, 2018 4:14 PM

To: 'Faisal - CarCrafters Singapore'

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); 'Tony - CarCrafters Singapore'

Subject: RE: FINALISE REPAIR ESTIMATE WITH PHOTO AFTER PAINT SKG6852B
Attachments: SKG6852B Finalise Repair estimate.pdf

Hi Faisal,

COR $1270, 3 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Faisal - CarCrafters Singapore [mailto:faisal@carcrafters.sg]

Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 4:05 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto); Tony - CarCrafters Singapore
Subject: FINALISE REPAIR ESTIMATE WITH PHOTO AFTER PAINT SKG6852B

Dear Taufikh,

Please find attached finalise repair amount and photos after repair.

Please do revert to me your favorable part by part amount with 3 working days repaired.
Appreciate your fast reply.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Md Faisal Bin Masrif

CarCrafters

CarCrafters Singapore Pte Ltd
48 Toh Guan Road East,#05-155 Enterprise Hub
Singapore 608586

Tel: (65) 6267 9916

Fax:(65) 6267 9313

Towing:(65) 6795 5005

Spray Paint & Bodywork Specialist
www.carcrafters.sg




