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"M BH AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

Blk 1. Sector C . Sin Ming Industrial Estate #01-111 /113 / 115/ 117 Singapore 575636
Tel: 6559 R944 / Fax: 6269 2404

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT
FWD SINGAPORE PTE LTD

6 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

#18-01 SUNTEC TOWER FOUR
SINGAPORE 038986

TEL : 6820 B388

ACCIDENT REPAIR ON : 8JU1531Z
MODEL : HYUNDAI AVANTE 1.6
POLICY NO : GAD3354/1

CHASSIS NO : KMHDU41BMAUBS6556
YEAR OF MANUFACTURE : 2009

DATE / TIME OF ACCIDENT : 02/10/2018@08:45HRS
LOCATION : BLK 102 HOUGANG AVE CARPARK

THIRD PARTY VEHICLE NO : FBEMB19M

DATE : 05/10/2018
PAGE : 1 OF 2

Ny rrhnyy,

iz

®-

/%fmb /f é‘ /éh.?v

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS QUANTITY| UNIT PRICE| AMOUNT
1[FRONT HEADLAMP RH 1 Ji | § 480.00
2|FRONT HEADLAMF LOWER BRACKET RH 1 S | § 30.00
3|[FRONT BUMPER 1| B/Aen |5 46140
4|FRONT BUMPER SI0E RETAINER RH 1 $ 2— 19.00
5|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE 1 27§ 47.00
| __6]FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER RH 1 S | 5 25.30
7 |FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH 1 SEyr 44.00
B|FRONT BLUMPER UNDER COVER 1 5 43.20
G|FRONT BUMPER INNER SPONGE 1 Jin | § 113.40
10|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 1 A |5 254.00
11|FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD RH 1] $/  48.00
SUB TOTAL $ 158530
LESS 20% 5 (313.08)
PARTS TOTAL $ 125224

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS QUANTITY| UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT
1|FRONT HEADLAMP CLIPS RH ~n 31§ 3005 9.00
2|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Ae. 10§ 3005 30.00
3|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH CLIPS e, 4§ ano|s 12.00
| 4|FRONT BUMPER UNDER COVER CLIPS 415 apol|s 12.00
5|FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS RH A 415 30018 12.00
PARTS TOTAL 5 75.00
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ACCIDENT REPAIR ON : SJU15312
MODEL : HYLUNDAI AVANTE 1.6

POLICY NO : GAD3354/1

CHASSIS NO : KMHDU41BMAUBSG556
YEAR OF MANUFACTURE : 2009

DATE / TIME OF ACCIDENT : 02/10/2018@08:45HRS
LOCATION : BLK 102 HOUGANG AVE CARPARK

THIRD PARTY VEHICLE NO : FBEMB19M

DATE : 05/10/2018
PAGE:20F 2

LABOUR CHARGES FOR FRONT RIGHT PORTION AMOUNT
1[PROVIDE SKILL LABOUR TO REMOVE ALL DAMAGED PARTS, PANEL BEAT, CUT 2o
AND WELD IF NECESSARY AND ALIGN ALL PANEL AND REINSTALL ALL DAMAGED | §  400.00 /
PARTS
2|PROVIDE SKILL LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY ALL DAMAGED PARTS AND s 30000 | 20z
PANEL AND TO RESPRAY WITH 2K PAINT WITH OVEN SPRAY BOOTH FACILITIES '
3|TUFF KOTE AND ANTI RUST COATING ALL REPLACE AND REPAIR PARTS. ~~|5  B000| X
4|PROVIDE SKILL LABOUR AND WATER PROOF SEALANT FORALLREPLACEAND [ ¢ o000 | X
REPAIR PARTS. '
5|DISCONNECT, CHECK, RESET AND DIAGNOSTIC ELECTRICAL SYSTEM WIRING,
HARNESS, WIRE SOCKETS AND ETC. REMOVE AND REINSTALL DAMAGED PARTS, | §  80.00 |7/
TEST AND RECTIFY FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING.
[ LABOURTOTAL _|§  920.00
TOTAL PARTS & LABOUR § 224724
GST 7% §  157.31
GRAND TOTAL § 240455
ESTIMATE REPAIR DURATION ADAYS
YOURS SINCERELY. Zete,

Az

ESTIMATOR - KIT
TEL : 8405 4058

FAX : 6269 2404
EMAIL : karkit.ngaifa bhauto com sg

SURVEY ATTENDED BY :
NAME /égﬁ‘ﬂ_ .
COMPANY o _J{fé-
DATE v/ o/ ﬂp
TIME /- _;%
T %% 2643
EMAIL




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (e regne 1sssarisen
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408533
Tel 6256-3561 Fax 6844-8805 Email sur@ikkauto com assignments@ikkauto.com
Ta FWD Singapare Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
6 Temasak Boulevard 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
#18-01 Suntec Tower 4 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 038988 Singapore 408933
Atn: Josay Loh Date. 23 Oct 2018

Preliminary Advice

Insured Vehicle No - FEMB14B

TP Vehicle No  BJUSIZ Accident Date 02Moro18
Make . HYUNDAI AVANTE Assignmant Date 121102018
Date of Inspaction 11/10/2018 Est Duration of Repair 2 days
Inspection At BH Auto Services Ple Lid (Sin Ming)

Blk 1 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C, #01/111U113118/117

Singapore 575636

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages ._..front O/S... portion and parts claimed are consistant to the accident

2,247.24
919.18
46 58
96572

Repairer's Estimate (Gross)
Revised Amount

Check ltems (Estimated)
Total

84282

Lump Sum Repair 55

Total Loss Consideration

Mew for Oid Valus
Pre-Accident Value
COE { PARF Rebate
Salvage Value
Margin for Repair

22884

Remarks

{ ) Thevehicle is repairable at our adjusied amouni. We have also confirmed excess and palicy coverage.
Kindly let us have your authonsation,

{ ) The vehicla is unecanomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tendar for the wrack.

{ X ) Other comments We have not authorized repairs



‘Asher Snﬂ {Llilmuto!

From: Josey.loh@fwd.com

Sent: Monday, 15 October 2018 5:16 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: motorclaims sg@fwd.com

Subject: RE: Accident involving FBMB14B & SJU1531Z on 02/10/20718 (Our Ref: 1201800012661)
Hi Asher,

Please proceed. Thank you.

Kind Regards

© ~
asey Lah

Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd
& Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore D3B986

I (65) 6727 5872

E o josayloh@iwd.com

W fwd.com.sg

4

insurance

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Monday, 15 October, 2018 4.55 PM

To: Josey Loh Kah Wal - 5GUser

Ce: Motor Claims 5G - SG Common

Subject: RE: Accident involving FEMB8148 & 51U15312 on 02/10/2018 (Dur Ref: 1201800012661)

Hi Josey,
We refer to the above matter,
Both party reported third party exit from parking lot and collided with our insured vehicle.

We are of the opinion that BOLA 24 shall be applied and liability is not in third party favour



In view of the above, we are intending to reject TP claim.

For your approval/ comments/ instruction.

Thank You.

Best Regonos.

Asher Sng | Cote Hondliet

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 4841-6051 | email! oghensng@ikkaulo.com | lax: &741-4108
ik 51, Payo Ubd indusitiol Pork, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | 5{408733)

From: Mel Kwan [LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 12 October, 2018 3:51 PM

To: josey. loh@fwd.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; motorclaims sg@fwd com; assignments <assignments @ lkkauto com>
Subject: RE: Accident involving FEM8148 & SIU1531Z on 02/10/2018 (Our Ref: 1201800012661)

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your assignment,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 o035 | email: MeiBwan@ kkauto.con | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pova Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenoe 1. #02-35 | S(4089739)

From: josev.loh@fwd.com <josey.loh@fwd.com>
Sent: Friday, 12 October, 2018 10:15 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@lkkauta com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; motorclaims. sg@fwd.com
Subject: Accident involving FBMB8148 & SJU15312 on 02/10/2018 (Our Ref: 1201800012661)

Hi Mei Kwan,

We refer to the above matter and our telephone conversation earfier on.

Please liaise with TP repairer for survey arrangement and create the case in Merimen.
Thank you.

Kind Regards
lesey Loh
Executive, Claims

FWD Sihgapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

2
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ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in errar, please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or store
this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any attachments
at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been scanned for viruses
by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.

ATTENTION:

The emall and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or store
this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any attachments
at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been scanned for viruses
by our malil domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



“Asher Snﬂ [LKKAutnz

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 15 October 2018 5:30 PM

To: BHAS - Jacelyn Loh

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBM 814B AND SJU 1531Z ON 02/10/2018
Attachments: Ol SKETCH PLAN . pdf

Your Ref: SJU 15312
Our Ref: CC4/FWD1B018569/Kea3

SAVEAS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBM 814B AND SJU 1531Z ON 02/10/2018

We attached here with a copy of our insured's accident statement for your easy reference

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client exit from the
parking lot and collided into our insured vehicle.

We are of the opinion that BOLA 524 applied and liability is not in your client’s favor

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client's claim,

Thank You,

Best Regards.,

-

JOsE Honoies

Asher Sng
LKK Auto Consultonts Ple Lid

phione: 484 |-6051 | emoil giherangSilkkouto.com | lax 4741-4108
Blk 51, Pova Ui Inchusirecl Porke LIGE Avenipe #2-2% | 5(408933)



Merimen e-Claims

.«.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Ditect Settlament

Page | of |

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Case  |Naotifed Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Ad] Rpt Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Sratus
|15 02018 S REREe $3700.00 $$700.00 Panding for Survey
Edit ey son Adi ot | Edit Estimates | | view Aot | Cooctt Cuse |

Hain

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

[[Created by adjuster]

Insured:

William Grover Ashlock, 10: S2TH710%H

Main
Clalmant:

TAN SHOU WET ALLEN, D! 51167185C

Vehiche
No.:

D2/10/2018 08:00 - :59

51U15312 Date of Loss:

Claim Type:

Palicy/Cover

TP / 1201800012661 PMMC201B-00002502 (Comprehensive))

Vehicle Reg.
ha.
[ Instired);

Note No.!

Palicy Ne.

FEMB14B Claant:

GADII5A/1

| Encess:

BH Auto Services Pie Ltd (Sin Ming) Bl 1 Sin Ming Tndustrial Estare Sector C, ®#01/111/113/115/117, 575636 Sin Ming - Tel:
6559 B944

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd, (HQ) - Tel: 6727 5700 ... [Handléd by Josey Loh]

Regpalrer

| Handiing
Insyrer:
Claimant’s
Insurer:

| Ad juster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by KENMETH KOMG| ... | Final Rpt due 23/10/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

Thers are na mall for this case.

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7288

'lmlr.l\ll Dunpﬂlmml

ALL ASEOCIATED TASKS=

Due Date  Priority  Type  Task Group Subject
No results.

view All | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | -:m-nml

Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp... 14/11/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SJU1531Z (1201800012661)

[FBME14B]
TP

TAN SHOU WEI ALLEN
Oct 2 2018 B:00AM
[Willlam Grover Ashlock]
BH Auto Services Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 1

View e i 2]

Assessment Reports [IWH-LEI M
Mo | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
(1 |23/10/18 11:35 | Adjuster Immediate Advice 0 | aarm
Photos /Images 3 por page ~1| &
to | Relabel /Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 131118 13:48 | Genersl View 0| aaws | B
2 1311718 1348 | Ganeral View 0 | waaws | 4
3 [1314/18 1348 | General View D) | leadiec | A
4 |13/11/18 13:48 General View _g lad 75 | A
5 131118 1348 | General View D | cadws | A
& (13/11/18 13:48 | General View ) | Loaciec | A
17 1311718 13:48 | Genaral View D | adws | A
8 1311/18 1348 | General View © | ioacwc | B
% 131181348 | Genersl View 0 | wocwrs | A
10 |13/11/1813:48 | Odometer Reading D | aces | A
111 [13/11/18 13:48 | Chassis Number 0 | losdws | B
| o 1
Documentation 1 per page ]
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
1 [12/10/18 15:58 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO FWD DD 12.10.2018. § Load POF
2 |12/10/18 15:58 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
3 15/10/18 16:43 0T GIA REPORT Load POF
4 (151018 17:28 | MANDATE TO REIECT TP CLAIM g Load POF
5 |15/10/18 17:28 | EMAIL WSP TO REJECT TP CLAIM Load POF
& (d310/18 11:30 | EMAIL FROM TP TO WKSP 8 Load POF
7 l23/10/18 11:30 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Aeset | save | prim |

There are na document checklists configurmd.

Show Remarks To: [ Handling lnsurer
Mote Bemacks 808 orivele etiles you Show | 55 ofher perbes

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_do...

14/11/2018



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico res no 198807158
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto com:assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Fila No: CC4/FWD18018565/KEA302

Date: 14/11/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer- FWD Singapore Pie. Lid.  Policy No: PNMC2018-00002502
ﬁﬂ""“‘ Vehicle ¢ 1531z Insured Vehicle No: FEMB14B
Date of Loss:  02/10/2018 Nature of Claim: ™ Claim No: 1201800012881

DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE

Reg No: SJuUis31Z
Make & Model: ::;UNDN AVANTE, 18 ABS AIRBAG 2WD 4DR Engine No: GAFCOUT49193
Reg. Date: 20/117/2009 (Man. Year: 2009) Chassis No: KMHDU41BMALIBIG556
Colour: Metallic Blue Odometar 236021 km
Engine Capacity: 1591 ce
Markel Valua/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured [(S$): Market Valus/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabls): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 19560 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/60 R15
Fronl Lefl Side: Yokohama 4 mm Rear Lefl Side; Yokohama 8 mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama 4 mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama 8 mm
Tha above values represent it remaining fyre nsads depth
\COST OF CLAIMS B Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  DIff %
Paris 1,327.24 504.16 B23.08 62.01
Miscallaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 820.00 415.00 505.00 54,88
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S%) 2,247.24 919.16 1.328.08 59.10
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 700.00
(S%) 2,247 24 700.00 1,547.24 B68.85
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$5) 157.31 49.00 108.31 68.85
Nett Amount (S5) 2,404.55 749.00 1,655.55 68.85
Global Sum Settlament (S5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 11110:2018
Date Inspected: 11110/2018 Inspected At BH Auto Services Ple Lid (Sin Ming)
Blk 1 Sin Ming Industrial Eslate Sector C,
#O1M11M13M1EMT
Singapore 575636
Estimated Period of Repair. 2 Ddays

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 14/11/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE: This repart represents pur findings af the ime and place of inspection stated heren. Such inspection has bean camed ouf to the bast of our
khowladge and abilly but any ather Eabdity under any other drcumstances i hareby axprezsly excluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 14/11/2018



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Page 3 of 4

Reference

Parts; 143
Labour:

Validity:

Part Source: MRM-5G

Repairer's
Print Code: (Unsubmitied, no print-code for SJU15312)

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 14 Nov 2018)

HYUNDAI AVANTE 1.6 ABS AIRBAG 2WD 4DR (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

(Price-denominaled Standard Lisl)

| Further Info: llems/values not in reference catalogue are prefived with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT HEADLAMP RH Serviceable 48000 FL *-FL
2 1 *FRONT HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET RH Serviceable 30.00FL *-FL
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER Bent / Buckled 461 40FL  *461 40FL
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH Serviceable 18.00FL *-FL
5 1 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE Distorted 47.00FL *47.00FL
6 1 *FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER RH Dented 25.30FL *25.30FL
T 1 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH Dislorted 44 OOFL 44 00 FL
8 1 *FRONT BUMPER UNDER COVER *Check 43 20FL *-FL
9 1 *FRONT BUMPER INNER SPONGE Serviceable 113.40FL =~FL
10 1 *FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Repair 254 00FL *-FL
11 1 *FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD RH Serviceable 48.00FL *-FL
12 3 *FRONT HEADLAMP CLIPS RH Mot Necessary 9.00FS *-FS
13 10 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Mecessary 30,00FS  *30.00FS
14 4 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH CLIPS Macessary 12.00FS  *12.00FS
15 4 *FRONT BUMPER UNDER COVER CLIPS *Check 12.00FS *-FS
16 4 *FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS RH Mol Mecessary 12.00FS FS

FeFmnchse pan. S=SpcNett L=ListhemDisc

Sub Total (S§) 1,640.30 619.70

- List Item Discount on L Items 20.00/20.00% (S$) 313.06 115.54

Total Parts [S§) 1,327.24 504.16

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. =)
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Adjuster Repont

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscallaneous ltema solected

Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type

Repairer's

Page 4 of 4

Amount

Labour ltems

1

PROVIDE SKILL LABOUR TO REMOVE ALL DAMAGED New
PARTS PANEL BEAT ,CUT AND WELD IF NECESSARY AND
ALIGN ALL PANEL AND REINSTALL ALL DAMAGED PARTS

PROVIDE SKILL LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY ALL New
DAMAGED PARTS AND PANEL AND TO RESPRAY WITH 2K
PAINT WITH OVEN SPRAY BOOTH FACILITATES

TUFF KOTE AND ANTI RUST COATING ALL REPLACE AND New
REPAIR PARTS

PROVIDE SKILL LABOUR AND WATER PROOF SEALANT New
FOR ALL REPLACE AND REPAIR WORKS

DISCONNECT ,CHECK ,RESET AND DIAGNOSTIC MNew
ELECTRICAL SYSTEM WIRING ,HARNESS WIRE SOCKETS

AND ETC .TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL DAMAGED

PARTS,TEST AND RECTIFY FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING

400.00

300.00

B80.00

B0.00

60.00

200.00

200.00

Q.00

0.00

15.00

Gross Labour Cost [S§)

920.00

415.00

Report was unsubmitted dunng this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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