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VEHICLE NO:GU 1706Y Date
ary PARTICULAR :
1PCS TAILGATE Aedjo> /2. 20 $1,985.30_
1PCS TAILGATE INNER LOCK 02 [J o Jo 328820
1PCS TAILGATE INNER TRIMBOARD 4 /7 $311.30 X
1SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS 4 ' $50.00 X
1PCS TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP  Ton/ e /W1 .05 $266.40.—
1PCS TAILGATE OUTER HANDLE 1 4 E:J}
1PCS TAILGATE REAR WIPER MOTOR  #* -1 ,
1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN RUBBER /744 I¥foc N $229.30.50 5.~/
1PCS REAR BUMPER D ¥ir-Jo $822.10,
1PCS REAR BUMPER BEAM /‘{L,i' SYPRCY $350.00
2PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @$85.00 (e i vy L7 17.00 $170.00 —
1 SET REAR BUMPERCLIPS ) &¢ $50.00
1PCS REAR END PANEL 4.4 326610 $688.50
1PCS REAR END PANEL TOP PLATE, «1 1 1 $215.00 X
2PCS TAILLAMPS @$35000 /5 ¢rs 2120 $700.00 { o
1PCS REAR EXHAUST 1A $988.50
2PCS REAR EXHAUST MOUNTINGS @$30.00 <7 7 [ Y66y $60.00 >
1PCS REAR FENDER N/S Avd [P/ $1,885.00
1PCS REAR FENDER OUTER RUBBER NS et 22470 $385.00_—
1PCS REAR ‘7OKMMH STICKER /L&A1 §12.00 —
1SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR £/« 2"2 $250.00 <
1PCS TAILLAMP HOUSING PANEL IS /5.» #5770 /EE $322.50
$11,079.40
LABOUR CHRAGES:
TO CHECK WIRING $80.00 < O
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR $80.00 1
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS $120.00 £ -,
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR EXHAUST A4 $12000 Y
TO TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM $120.00 £
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING $100.00 £,
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING, CUT & REPLACING PARTS $1.280.00 /.. )
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING $1,500.00 5?{5.5
TOTAL $14,479.40

ML
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PR PARFINMF Rahale Foamilr
.> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type: Singapore MRIC
Cwner 1D: BO54B
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: GU1706Y
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date; 11 0Oct 2018
Vehicle Make: HYUNDAI
Vehicle Model: GRACEHI100M
Primary Colour; Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2000
Engine Na.: D4ABFY0336346
Chassis No.: KMFGD27FP1K484612
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: £180246.00

. Onginal Registration Date: 02 Feb 2001
First Registration Date: 02 Feb 2001
Transter Count: o
Actual ARF Paid: $902.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 30 Apr 2022
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 5
PQP Paid: $24,005.00
COE Rebate Amount: $17,056.00
Total Rebate Amount; $17,056.00
Message

. Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannat be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE
expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.
The information contained herein iscorrect asat 11 Oct 2018

OK
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Hsiao Tnna SLKI{hutn!

From: Jason Fastech Auto <jason@fastechauto.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 10:02 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GU 1706Y *Our Ref: CC6/EQI18018564/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SJP 5934U(EQ) & GU 1706Y ON 10/10/2018]

Without Prejudice
Dear Hsiao Tong,
We are pleased to accept your offer of global sum of $6,200.00(all-in) for my client vehicle's property claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Jason Tang

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405

Hp: 98218445

jason@fastechauto.com.sg

Please note that it 5 a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
clalmant

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, December 15, 2018 1:35 PM

To: Jason Fastech Auto (jason@fastechauto.com.sg) <jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: Your Ref: GU 1706Y *Our Ref: CC6/EQI18018564/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIP 5934U(EQ) & GU 1706Y
ON 10/10/2018]

Your Ref: GU 1706Y Without Prejudice
Our Rel: CC4/EQIN8018564/Upa3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJP 5934U(EQ] & GU 1708Y ON 10/10/2018
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settfiement at a global sum of $6,200.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basls, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on
our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed In any other related matter(s) in

1



respect of the accident. Our offer made In respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter anly. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

settiement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settiement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080933)



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Justin Wong <justinwong@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 October, 2018 3:34 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto), Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJP5934U (01 : EQI - TBA) AND GU1706Y
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI18018564/Upa3) on 10/10/2018

Attachments: Ol GIA - SIP5934U.PDF

Categories: HMEK

Dear Mel Kwan,
Please find our insured’s GIA report and proceed with direct settlement.
Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

g

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road ¥17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110 —
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190 C
ﬂﬂ.ggm;grange_cnm.g

e
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) [mailto;Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, October 19, 2018 2:44 PM

To: Justin Wong <justin.wong@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.coms; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIP5934U (01 : EQI - TBA) AND GU1706Y (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/EQI18018564/Upa3) on 10/10/2018

EQI ref: TBA
LKK REF: CC6/EQI18018564 /Upa3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle GU 1706Y at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed
for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 2000062621

Date :05.11.2018

EQ) Insurance Company Limited

§ Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Attn: Motor Claim Department

ACCIDENT INVGOLVING VEHICLE:  GUIT06Y AND SJP5934U ON 10.10.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: - GUITO6Y | which was involved in
the captioned accident with vour insured vehicle no:  SJP5934U0 | The vehicle owner has requested and authorized

us 1o assist him in presenting histher claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

I} Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) 5 5,564.00
2) Loss OF Use(7days + Isun x $150) $ 1,200.00
3)  GIA Search Fee 3 2.00

s 6, 766,00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice b) Vehicle Registrution Log Card
¢) GIA Report/GIA Search Result d) VC & Driving Licence
¢) Insurance Certificate f) Letter of Authorisation, etc..,

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you.
Yours faithfully,

\!

Allan Tang T‘W \:
For Fastech Auto Ple Lid”



51 LR AVE 1 #00-22 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL < (65) f2303381 FAX - (03] 62504315

Our Ref: CC6/EQL18018564/Upa3
250CT 2018

CHAN CHER HUAT

BLK 812C CHOA CHU KANG AVE 7
#02-631

SINGAPORE 683812

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJP 5934U AND GU 1706Y ON 10/10/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, EQ Insurance Company Lid to deal with the third party
claim against your policy. )

We have received a claim from GU 1706Y against your insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your favour. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and vour NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

M

CHEW HSIAO TONG

Case Handler

DID: 67423197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com

c.C. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)



DATE : ||+l Oct _:..;_'-i-f

A = (.[_ﬁ'ilf"h\-"ll Lu-‘l.-h t{;l

TO : BV Insw

RE . ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. O (70 {] L STEC93ay

ALONG _[PI1E  Aowasd(  (fanny.
ON lL'!rL (.‘u (¥

I'We, Lee  Hony  lee

of (NRIC No,/ROC No.) l* 133¥es 46

of 20T Toau Pusye h Aethh Foy—13<XS S 310401

owner of vehicle no. (xt0 | TC LN in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO

PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle (ol |71 L 1 m my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever

amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal
proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss ol use,
etc. and 1o their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I'We further agree and undertake to mdemmty them against the above-mentioned claim cost
which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner r}‘/‘;’k@\‘
Name of Owner |2 \‘\MB\J KEQ




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158  Fax No: 67458520
Tax.Reg No: 200006262D

EQ Insurance Company Limited

Tax Invoice : 20630

5 Maxwell Road Date 05.11.2018
#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Vehicle N GUIT706Y
Singapore 069110 Make'Model: HYUNDAI GRACE
Accident Date: 10,10.2018
Attn: Motor Claim Department Claim No 1018-20630
Relerence
Palicy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair S8 5.200.00
E.& 0.E. Total : S% 5,200.00
GST @ 7% : S§ 364.00
Amount Due - 88 5.564.00

b

for FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
All lnvoices are subjected to GST




11/10/2018

Involce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: «65 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam lo Spm
G5T Registration No: Ma00017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry
Our Ref No: GR-18-157291
Date of Request: 1nozo018 Your Ref No. Online Purchase
Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 11110/2018
gquw By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
Vahicla No. SJPs83aU
Accident Dale 1071072018
Enquiry Resull
TP Vehicle No, Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. Mo,
SJP5934U EQ Insurance Company Lid 30/08/2018-29/09/2019 6223 9433

Thank You.

The images provided to you ane taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no responsibility for their acouracy o contents and shall be under no |lability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of

or in connection with the reports or their images.

.E is a computer generated document and requires no signatura,

hitps./isingapore. menman com/caimsindex.cmMusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=18412858CFID=42095T 1JACFTOKEN=860... 12



finozo18 Invokce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSURANCE =icie 656224 0010 Fax. +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION

Operating Hours: Manday 1o Friday 8am to 5pm
GST Registration No; M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Cur Ref No: GR-18-157991

Date of Request: 111102018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avanue 6 #0148
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 11/10/2018

uiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
WVahicle No. SJP59340U

Accidenl Date 10102018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amaouni 0.13

Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank Yau.

This is a computer generaled document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official usa:

Diate:

[X] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque

2z

hitps fisingapore. merimen.com/claims/index cfm Musebox=MTRsasliuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=194328548CFID=420957 134CFTOKEN=860.
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Company Registration No. 1996071988

SPUBEAVE |, #0228 FAYA UKL INDUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08030 TEL : 10651 AZSA581 FAX @ (0681 42564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 27/12/2018

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Vehicla N SJP 59341 (Insd Veh) |Your Ref, No. : DMPPHQ18-006746
a- L
o GU 1706Y (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CCE/EQI18018564/Upadq2
Date of Accident 10/10/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost - 5,564.00
Loss of Use % - 640.00 8 days
Rental (If any) '8 ) days
Others: - 2.00
-

6,206.00

Final Settlement Sum |: § 6,200.00 |GLOBAL SUM

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |FASTECH AUTOC PTE LTD

% 6,200.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Uibl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapare 408933
TEL: B258 3561 FAX, 6258 4315

Reg No: 180607T108R G5T Reg Mo 19-8607198-R

Affiflated to Federation internationale Des Experts En Automoblia

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCB/EQI18018564/Upalg2
AT R
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date . 27-12-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPDRE 069110
Code: EOQI
i Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJP 5834U Veh. Inspected GU 1708Y
Policy No. DMPPHQ18-006746 Coverage ($) 0.00 '
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 12/102018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI H100 (M) c.c 2476
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2001
Chassis No. KMFGD27FP1K484612 Colour SILVER
Odometer 390048 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185R15 FALKEN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185R15 FALKEN 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185R15 FALKEN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre [185R15 FALKEN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 10102018 Inspection Date 12(10/2018
Survey held at FASTECHAUTO PTELTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IEST‘IHMT‘ED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR T Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ubl Ave 1 #07-25 Poya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 4086533
TEL B25B 3581 FAX G256 4315

Reg. No: 1B860T168R GST Reg. Mo 16-9607188-R Page Mo 1ol 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GU 1T0BY
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | e O (51 ’*gj
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1| TAILGATE BADLY DENTED 1,985.30 1.285.20
1|TAILGATE INNER LOCK DENTED / JAMMED 28820 105.00
1|TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD NOT NECESSARY 311.30
1|SET TAILGATE INNER TRM BOARD CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED / 2686 40 14500
NECESSARY
1|TAILGATE OUTER HANDLE NOT MECESSARY 385.30
1|TAILGATE REAR WIPER MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 685.00
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED B22 10 425 30
1|REAR BUMPER BEAM BENT 350.00 210,50
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @%85 00 CRACKED 170.00 81.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR END PANEL BADLY DENTED 688 50 36650
1|REAR END PANEL TOP PLATE NOT NECESSARY 215.00 -
2| TAILLAMPS @5350.00 MN/S CRACKED 700.00 22500
1|REAR EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 888,50
2|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTINGS @:530.00 NOT MECESSARY 60.00
1|REAR FENDER W/S BADLY DENTED 1 1,885.00 1.466.50
BUCKLED
1|REAR FENDER QUTER RUBBER N/S NECESSARY 365.00 22500
1|REAR TOKM/H STICKER MNECESSARY 12.00 12.00
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR CRACKED 250.00 250.00
1| TAILLAMP HOUSING PANEL N/S BADLY DENTED 32250 184 50
LESS 20% DISCOUNT - -1,008.30
10,850.10 403320
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN RUBBER (50%) (SN} NECESSARY 22930 146.50
22830 146.50
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING 80.00 20.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR B0.DO0 50.00
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Qty Description of Parts Condition | sUmee B "{‘ﬂ
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS, 120,00 60.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TO TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM 120,00 60.00
TO SURAP RUST PROOFING 100.00 80.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING ,CUT & REPLACING 1,280.00 1,200.00
PARTS
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING 1,500 00 800.00
3,400.00 2.370.00
GRAND TOTAL 14,479.40 6,549.70
i
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,200.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) ¥ g
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CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraisor

DISCLAMER OF LIASILITY TO THIRD FARTIES - This Repor is macs solsly for the she snd banef ol the Cliani nemed o (he frond gags of this Repart.




