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Consuitanis
- Pre Lig Company Registration No 155007 19ER

!"[.I Auto

t

51 URIAVE 1, S02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08033 TEL @ (065) 62303561 FAX @ (0631 62564315

Yourref: D18007343MFSH

Our ref: CS/FCT18018536/Avd3 Date : 15/11/2018

The Motor Claims Department

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCELTD

Dear SivMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SDT 909B

We thank you for your instruction on 11/10/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

29/10/2018 at the premises of M/s PROGRSSIVE C CARE PTE
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5$4,233.05
Revised Estimate Amount : 55450.00
"Check" Items Amount : 8%

Market Value © 3%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value ok

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the

. fi
rear portion .

Comments/Present Status;
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAMN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser



Ms ‘ FirstCa p|tal M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cofeg we 1950001060 CAT Reg Mo H2 OO0LE74-1

& Ralfles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (B5) 6222 3547

Claims & Moter Ueurwriting Dapr: 36 Zobinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel: (B5) 6507 364A Fax: (B5) 6507 3849
wvi mesfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
05-10-2018 Our Ref No.
08-10-2018 Claim Type.
SH7989J Third Party Vehicle.

BLK 3022A UBI ROAD #01-45/48
PEI WEN NG

67415336/ 0 Fax No.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D18007343MFSH

Third Party

SDT2098

67417208

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

PROGRESSIVE GAR Attont
CARE PTE LTD e
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No.

SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

MIL

MNA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2018 9:36 AM

To: "CWS Maotor Claims’

Cc: 'Serene Ler'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007343MFSH/1, SDT 9098
Attachments: SDT 9098 PRELI ADVISED. pdf

Dear Sir/Madam.

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SDT 909B
Date of survey: 29/10/2018
Number of days : 2 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 October 2018 8:55 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007343MFSH/1, SDT 9098

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SDT 909B on 29/10/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 12 October 2018 9:58 AM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=>
Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007343MFSH/1

Dear 5ir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Parlk, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: CW5 Motor Claims [mgilto:cws.mDmrclaims@m5fir5tcaﬁital.c0m.5E]

Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 5:42 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007343MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: - WwWwW.avg.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 October 2018 8:55 AM

To: 'CWS Maotor Claims'

Cc: 'Serene Ler'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007343MFSH/1, SDT 9098
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SDT 9098 on 29/10/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,
veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 12 October 2018 9:58 AM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007343MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in worksheop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclai ms@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 5:42 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007343MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards.

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
i WWW.avE.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: vVeron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2018 10:10 AM
To: ‘Ray’

Cc Peiwen; SUR

Subject: sDT 9098-DOA: 8/10/2018

Dear Ray,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirmed amount $450 @ 2 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



M/S:

Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd

Rk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716
TEL: 6741 5336 FAX: 741 7208  Email. claimsi@ procarcare.com.s¢
GST 2010069490 RCB NO:201006949C

GAN HUI BIN
BLK 175 WOODLANDS ST 13 #08-329
SINGAPORE 730175

ATTN: FIRST CAPITAL

Your

Ref No: TP 1018-5254

Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date: D8/10/2018
TP Veh Reg No:  SH 7989 )

17

20

21

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SDT909B

Description

List Price

REAR BOOT RUBBER

REAR BOOT TOP LOCK

REAR BOOT BOTTOM LOCK

REAR BOOT TOYOTA LOGO

REAR BOOT OUTER CHROME ol
REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP

REAR BOOT GLASS MOULDING

REAR PANEL e

REAR PANEL TOP GARNISH M=t &

REAR BUMPER ~

REAR BUMPER CLIPS

REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER - LH

REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER - RH

REAR BUMPER BRACKET - LH

REAR BUMPER BRACKET - RH

REAR BOOT HYBRID SYNERGY DRIVE LOGO

Special Net
REAR BUMPER SENSOR o

Labour

O KNOCK OUT DENTS ON REAR PANEL: REMOVE,
REPLACE ACCIDENT PARTS

TO RESPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT PORTIONS - PEARI
PAINT

[0 TRANSFER REAR BUMPER SENSOR

[0 CHECK WIRING

Estimate No: ESTI1504147
Date: 09 Oct 2018
Policy No: GA309808
Veh Reg No: SDTY9R8
Make/Model:  TOYOTA VOXY
HYBRID .8V A
Chassis No: ZWRR00269706
Engine No: 2ZR819214]
Reg. Date: 29/12/2017
U/Price  Quantity Price Amount
410,30 | PC 11030 €
609,70 | PC A09.70 4.
#5590 1 PC R5.90 5
Qb D) [ PC G, 90 4
411.40 I PC A11.40 &
78,30 2PC 156.60 *
103,40 1 SET 103,40 »
749,10 | PC T49.10 &
252.00 I PC 252.00 4
91160 1 PC 91160 4
389 10 PC 3890 4
B.T0 | PC 60.70 &
#0770 I-PC o). 70«
3510 1 PC SR 10 &
55,10 1 PC 5510
0.00 | pC oo =
4.057.40
Less 25% 1.014.35 304305
220,00 | SET w2000 ¥
220,00 220.00
400,00 1 JOB M P
SO0.00 1 JOB S0pal 2o
50,00 1 JOB s0.00 «
20,000 1IOB 000 &

G700 G000



Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd

Blk 30224 Ubi Road | #01-43/46 Singapare 408716
TEL: 6741 5336 FAX, 6741 7208 Email: claims i procarcare com.sg
GST 2000069490 RCB NO:201006949C

M/S: GAN HUIBIN
BLEK 175 WOODLANDS ST 13 #08-329 Estimate No:
SINGAPORE 730175 Date:
Policy No:
Veh Reg No:
ATTN: FIRST CAPITAL Make/Model:
Your Ref No: TP 1018-5254 Chassis No:
Claim Type: Third Party Engine No:
Accident Date: OR/A10/2018 Reg. Date:
TP Veh Reg No:  SH 7989 )

Description

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SDT909B

U/Price  Quantity

EST1504147
09 Oct 2018
GA309898
SDTY09B
TOYOTA VOXY
HYBRID 1.8V A
ZWR800269706
27ZR8192141
29/12/2017

Price
55
Tatal

Add GST wr ™

Tetal Amount Payable

Amount
5%

5% 4.233.08
209631

5% 4.5249.36

FOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR FOUR THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED TW ENTY NINE AND CENTS THIRTY SIX ONLY

For Prugress(he Car Care Pte Lid

i

) \ﬁuQ’fﬁ

AlﬁTHgRESED SIGNATURE

Adoan [
?|p 219 [if1g -

¢1£>74



Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-43/46 Singapore 408716
TEL:; 6741 5336 FAX: 6741 7208 Email: claimsflprocarcars. com.sg
GET:201006949C RCE NO:201006545C

M/S: GAN HUI BIN

BLK 175 WOODLANDS ST 13 #08-329
SINGAPORE 730175

ATTHN: FIRST CAPITAL

Your Ref MNo: TP 1018-5254
Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date: DB/10/2018
TP Veh RegNo:  SH 7989 )

- = N L

- =

i TR

& W

Estimate No:

Date:

Policy Mo:
Veh Reg No:
Make/Model:

Chassis No:
Engine No:
Reg. Date:

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SDT909B

Deseription

List Price

REAR BOOT RUBBER

REAR BOOT TOP LOCH

REAR BOOT BOTTOM LOCK
REAR ROOT TOYOTA LOGO
REAR BOOT OUTER CHROME
REAR NMUMBER PLATE LAMP
REAR BOOT GLASS MOLULDING
REAR FPANEL pt b
REAR PANEL TOP GARNISH 2=t ™=

REAR BUMPER -

REAR BUMPER CLIPS

REAR BLUMPER SIDE HOLDER - LH

REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER - RH

REAR BUNMPER BRACKET - LI

REAR BUMPER BRACKET - RH

REAR BOOT HYBRID SYNERGY DRIVE LOGD

N fone

Special Net
REAIR BUMPER SEMSOR | A

Labour
TO KNOCK QUT DENTS ON REAR PANEL, REMOVE.
REPLACE ACCIDENT PARTS

TO RESPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT PORTIONS - PEARL
PAINT

TO TRAMSFER REAR BUMPER SEMSOR
TO CHECK WIRING

UJ’PI‘EL‘L‘

410.30
609,70
35.90
96,90
11140
78.30
103,40
749,10
152,00
a11.60
189
6,70
Ll
50
35,10
(.00

220,00

400.00
300.00

50.00
20.00

2&0}

EST1504147
09 Oct 2018
GA300898
SDT909B

TOYOTA VOXY
HYBRID 1.8V A

ZWRE00269706
IZREI192141
297122017

Cuantity Price Amount
SS Ss
| PC A
| PC 0,20 e
1 PC iy
1 PC Ot
| PC e
3 PC S
| SET —H3Al e
| PC 24040+
| PC T
1PC Ll
10 PC —3gon L
1 PC Ty
| BC T
| PC St
| PC A
| PC — oo
1.057.40
Less 25% 1.013.35 343,05
| SET e e
220,00 220.00
| JOB M 2ov /
110B 590 2o
1JOB 3000 <
| JOB B
' 970.00 970.00

o+ 4£0°



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Awe 1£01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mot 1996071988 GST Reg, Mo. 15-9607186-R

[ Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18018536Avd3n2
e o1 I HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 R A M“W"l”““l“mu
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 7989J Veh. Inspected 50T 2098
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18007343MFSH Excess () 0.00
Assign From  SERENE Assign Date 11/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWVOXY HYBRID C.C 1787
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. ZWRAB002E69706 Colour WHITE
Odometer 17658 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOCoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/85R15 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/65R15 GOODYEAR & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 195/65 R15 GOODYEAR & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/10/2018 Inspection Date 201 0/2018
Survey held at PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 30224 UBI ROAD 1 #01-45/46, SINGAPORE 048716
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
GJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;‘—___ﬂi;_i; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 43135
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R Page No.:1of2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SDT anoBE
b Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =S Mhm?gﬂ .
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT RUBBER NOT NEGESSARY 410.30 5
1|REAR BOOT TOP LOCK NOT NECESSARY 609.70 "
1|REAR BOOT BOTTOM LOCK NOT NECESSARY 85.90
1|REAR BOOT TOYOTA LOGO NOT NECESSARY 96.90 e
1|REAR BOOT QUTER CHROME NOT NECESSARY 411.40 :
2|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP @$78 30 NOT NECESSARY 156.60 .
1|SET REAR BOOT GLASS MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 103 40 :
1|REAR PANEL NOT NECESSARY 748,10 5
1|REAR PANEL TOP GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 252.00 .
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 911.60 :
LABOUR
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @3$3.89 NOT NECESSARY 38.90 2
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER-LH NOT NECESSARY 60.70 ;
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER-RH NOT NECESSARY 60.70 >
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET-LH NOT NECESSARY 55,10 .
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET-RH NOT NECESSARY 55.10 3
1|REAR BOOT HYBRID SYNERGY DRIVE LOGO (NPA) NOT NECESSARY . I
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,014.35 2
3,043.05 d
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR BUMPER SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 220.00 :
220.00 -
LABOUR
TO KNOCK QUT DENTS ON REAR 400.00 200.00
PANEL REMOVE REPLACE ACCIDENT PARTS. INCLUSIVE
OF THE REPAIR OF REAR BUMPER.
;{} H‘ESPHM PAINT ON ACCIDENT PORTIONS-PEARL 500.00 200.00
AINT.
TO TRANSFER REAR BUMPER SENSOR. 50.00 50,00
TO CHECK WIIRNG. NOT NECESSARY 20.00 !
970.00 450.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18018536Avd3an2




T Vdl V4
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Page Mo 2 of 2
[ cRrAnDTOTAL ] 1 4,233.08| 45o.mj
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS l I | 450,00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18018536Avd3n2

tg‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE.AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD BARTIES:- This Report is made salaly for the use and benedid of tha Cliant named on the frond page of this Report,

o sy Ehird party who may reply o6 the Repoen wholly of in 6  third party acting or mglying an this

ol responsibility whats
Regort, In whode or in parl, dogs s0 ak bils or her cwn rish.



