Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Ray <ray@procarcare.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2018 2:00 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SDT 909B-DOA: 8/10/2018

Noted, thank you.
Regards,

Ray LIN

Damage Assessment

Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716
T:+65 67415336 | F:+656741 7208

E: claims@procarcare.com.sg

W: www.procarcare.com.sg

*With effect from 1 Sep 2018, Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd will be rebranded as Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd.
You may now reach us at our new email addresses (@procarcare.com.sg) and our old email addresses
(@progauto.com.sg) shall cease to function with effect from 1 Sep 2018. We look forward to your continued support.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, November 15, 2018 10:10 AM

To: Ray

Cc: Peiwen; SUR

Subject: SDT 909B-DOA: 8/10/2018

Dear Ray,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirmed amount $450 @ 2 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



