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Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reg. No : 201606560M

6 Benal Place Singapore 629927

PRIME GROUP Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

Date: 11.10.2018

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
B Shenton Way #27-01/02

AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SIR3349L MITSUBISHI LANCER (2008)

Ta Supply Nett Parts

1) 1pc Rear bumper 5 815.00¢ ol
2] 1set Rear bumper clip 5 20.00 A —
3] 1pe Rear bumper right reflector 5 2200047
4) '1pc Rear bumper tow hook cover S 21.00 M2~
Sub Total Parts 5 878.00
Less: 10% discount $ (87.80)
S 7890.20 -
losupply S.Nett parts
1) 1pc Rear number plate S }B:ﬁf?s Bt~
2) 1set Reverse sensor 5 170.00 A~
S 208.00 &9
L/charges
1] Toremove & replace reverse sensor, check wiring 5 dﬂ,ﬂy

2 | Toremove rear bumper. Knock rear end panel. Replace rear S Mﬂ Pacd®



bumper. Align & adjsut rear bumper & boot lid.

i) To putty respray painting rear bumper & rear end panel, To polish. S Mgﬂ\)

Sub Total L/charges 5 890.00 X .o
) 1,888.20 (B3g, ¥
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1NEMIA PARFENCDE Rahats Frmilee

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 1D Type Company
Owner ID: 62932
Vehicle No.: SJRI49L
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended Deregistration Date 15 0ct 2018
Viahicle Make: MITSUBISHI
Vehicle Model: LANCER 1.5 MIVEC GLX AT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR
Primary Calour; Red
Manufacturing Year: 2008
Engine Na.: 44910100078
Chassis No.: JMYSRCY2ABUDO7792
Maximum Pawer Output: B0.0 kW {107 bhp)
Open Market Value: $£14.497.00
Original Registration Date: 1% Jun 2009
First Registration Date; 19 Jun 200%
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $14.497.00
ENErRI PARERRL R GIE e — == — T e e e )
PARF Eligibility; Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 18 Jun201%
PARF Rebate Amount: $£7.248.00
T T o008 T o T T e = = == = |
COE Expiry Date: 18 Jun 2019
COE Category: A=Car (1600cc & below)
COE Periad(Years): 10
QF Paid: £1.020.00
COE Rebate Amount $68.00
Total Rebate Amount: $7.316.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 Oct 2018

oK [¥ oo
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Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reg. No : 201606560M

6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927

Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

PRIME GROUP

Date: 11.10.2018

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
8 Shenton Way #27-01/02

AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SJR3349L MITSUBISHI LANCER (2008)

To Supply Nett Parts

1) 1pc Rear bumper S 815.00¢F <
2) 1set Rear bumper clip S 20.00 A# —
3) 1pc Rear bumper right reflector S 22.00 A7
4) 1pc Rear bumper tow hook cover 5 21.00 M
Sub Total Parts § 878.00
Less: 10% discount § (87.80)
S 790.20

To supply S.Nett parts

1) 1pc Rear number plate 5 Wf Bt~
2) 1set Reverse sensor S 170.00 As~
S 208.00
L/charges
1) Toremove & replace reverse sensor, check wiring S 4&[19/

2 ) Toremove rear bumper. Knock rear end panel. Replace rear S W Pacd®)



bumper. Align & adjsut rear bumper & boot lid.

3 ) To putty respray painting rear bumper & rear end panel. To polish. S 901553-00

Sub Total L/charges S 890.00
S 1,888.20
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Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Alice Leong <aliceleong @primeautoclaims.com>

Sent: Thursday, 6 December 2018 3:50 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 10.10.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SJR3349L & SHDS518Z
Importance: High

Categories: clear

Hi Pho Kin,

We agreed 1o your below offer. Please let us have vour DV.
Thank you

Alice Leong
Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
T(65): 6861 0908 | F(65) 65152048
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclmmer

This e-mail (including all attachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it |s sddressed. If you are not an intend reciphent, please reply 1o us immediately and delete this message from your system.
You may not copy or use 1L for any purpose, or otherwise disclose [ts contents to any person

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@lkkauto.com)

Sent: 06 December, 2018 3:43 PM

To: Alice Leong <aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 10.10.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SJR3349L & SHD9518Z
Importance: High

Without Prejudice

LKK Ref: CC4/ASM18018531/R1fa3
Your Ref; SJR 33491

Dear Alice,
We refer to the above matter.

We hereby confirmed settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair SS  1,284.00
2. Loss of Use (560.00 x 3 days) SS  180.00
S5 1,464.00

Please duly sign the DV attached and return for payment processing.
1



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e ——————————————————— e —

From: Poh Kin (LKKAUtD)

Sent: Thursday, 6 December 2018 3:43 PM

To: ‘Alice Leong'

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 10.10.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SJR3349L & SHD9518Z
Attachments: DV SJR 3349 pdf

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

LKK Ref: CC4/AsM18018531/R1fa3
Your Ref: SJR 3349L

Dear Alice,
We refer to the above matter.

We hereby confirmed settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair SS  1,284.00
2. Loss of Use (560.00 x 3 days) SS  180.00

SS 146400

Please duly sign the DV attached and return for payment processing.

Your prompt action is very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

Fr —— A
E{H i Save Che Earthe Print only when pecessary:

Trus e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intanded recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you recelved this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof. and inform the
sender that you have delated the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



124472018 Claim Portal

<« Pls proceed DS with quantum as proposed

Type
© Question

Message

https:/ivp.smartclaimes. axa.com sg/claim-portalhimilfindex-vendor-service-requests himil/service-requests/view-message/7serviceRegquestNumbe... 11



11/262018 Claim Porial

LEK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD (TP) = Mery

« <S8MO0YZU> |IA with mandate uploaded

Type
© Question

Message

Dear Peter, we refer to the above matter. Liability; Insured driver collided into the rear of third party vehicle.
Liability is down against our insured. send letter to Ol via E-mail to notify TP claim and excess amount on
23rd November 2018 We hereby seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer M/s "Prime Auto Claim
Service Pte Ltd “ s as follows: - 1)COR(w/gst): $1.284.00 + 2) Loss of Use (3days x $60.00): $180.00 =Total:
$1,464.00. **2days recommendation for repair. ="All the relevant documents had been uploaded in SMART
CLAIM. For your approval please. PohKin - 26/11/2018

hitps:/ivp smartclaims.axa.com. sgiclam-portalhtmifindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/ service-requesis/view-message/ 7sarviceRequasiNumbe... 11



Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reg. No : 201606560M

, 5 Benoi Place Singapore 629926

PRIME GROUP Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

Date: 22.10.2018

Our Reft SIR33490L

AXA Insurance (S) Pre ltd Without prejudice
No. 8 Shenton Way #27-01 By fax only
AXA Tower Fax: 6880 4838

Singapore 068819

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT ON 10.10.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. SJRIZL & SHDISIRZ

We are on behalf of M/S Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Lid owner of vehicle
SJR3349L in their third party claim against your insured / driver of vehicle SHD9518Z

As & result of the said collision, our client’s vehicle has been damaged and our client has
been put to loss and expenses, particulars of which are as follows:-

1. Cost of repair $ 1,284.00
2 Loss of remal @$60 x 3 days (Incl. | Sunday) S 180.00
Total S 146400

We enclased herewith copy of our Invoice 2692 & Letter of authorization enclosed for
vour retention. For an amicable settlement, plese let us have your reply the soonest,

Regards

Yours faithfully,

Alice L.

Encl.



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e ——————————————————— e —

Fram: Poh Kin (LKKAUtO)

Sent: Friday, 23 November 2018 2:16 PM

To: ‘claims’

Cc: ‘carrisalee@ava-ins.com’; 'icewong@ava-ins.com’; ireneng@ava-ins.com’;
'foonghon@ava-ins.com’; Admin A

Subject: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SHD 9518Z AND SJR 33491
ALONG AYE TOWARDS CITY ON 10.10.2018

Importance: High

23/11/2018

Trans-Cab Taxi

Singapore

Dear Sir/Madam,

Our Ref: CC4/AXA18018531/R1fa3
Your Ref: SHD 95187(D.0.A: 10/10/2018)

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SHD 9518Z AND SJR 3349L ALONG AYE TOWARDS
CITY ON 10.10.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by
your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party Property Damage claim against your
policy.

We have received a claim from M/s Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd, acting on behalf of the owner of SJR
3349L against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had collided into the rear
of Third Party vehicle SIR 3349L. As such, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party in accordance to the procedure.

We also wish to advise that there is an excess of $55,000.00 attached with Third Party Claims. Please be
informed that you shall be liable for the excess following any settlement of the third party claim.

AXA shall keep you informed of the third party claim settlement and thereafter kindly let AXA have the
excess payment in your cheque payable to * AXA Insurance Pte Ltd”, Please indicate your vehicle
registration number and the date of accident on the back of the cheque.

Notwithstanding the excess being applied and/or received by AXA for the above subject matter, AXA
expressly reserves all their rights under the policy to refund the excess payment in the event that there
arises any known policy breach and or exclusion material to coverage.

AXA shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take
conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us

1



“within 10 days from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to AXA and
acknowledged by AXA,

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following if not provided
at AXA's reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to
keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim,

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior
knowledge and consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons
in connection with this accident, please forward it to AXA immediately. You may email it to cst@axa.com.sg
/ pohkin@lkkauto.com or deliver it by hand to our Customer Care Centre.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the
final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2132 or email us at
pohkin@lkkauto.com. Please quote our claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Best Regords,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2132 | emall: pohking® [kknuto.com | fax: 6741-3108
Alk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

[ ]
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LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To: PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE. LTD.

Re: ACCIDENT ON 10.10.2018 INVOLVING SJR33491 & SHD9518Z
ALONG AYE CLEMENTI ROAD TOWARDS CITY

I/ We. M/S Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Lid hereby authorized you to carry out repairs
of the damage caused to my / our vehicle no. SJR3349L in the above accident.

1/ We further also confirm and agree that all sums of money to be recovered by vou on my/ our
behalf shall be paid 1o vou. I/ We hereby also authorise the third party insurer (o release to you

such sums of money recovered on my / our behalf.

Signature (Campany s stamp if applicable)
Name: PRIME OAR QEnTAL X [AXI CIVICES T LTO

NRIC: 1445062932

L



M redefining / insurance

CLAIM REF ¢ S8MO0YZU
INSURED : TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

W'HWWMMMMHWW
accept the sum of dollars [one thousand for ¢ xty-four only| (5$ 1,464.00) paid 1o us/me
by AMA INSURANCE PTE LTD as I‘uII Iml ﬂn!t uﬂhmlﬂt of I“ claims of whatever kind including
damages for personal injuries and damages to property that we/l may have against the said AXA
INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured or the driver of motor vehicle no, SHD 9518 as a result of an
accident on 10™ October 2018 of which we/l were/was the driver/ owner/ hirer/
passenger/rider/pillion/ insuref of motor vehicle no. SJR 3349L

We/| hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SHD 95182 in connection directly or
indirectly with the sald accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/| arefam the person(s) entitled to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made In
respect of this settlement.

It is understood and agreed that payment herein s made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SHD 95182

Datedthis | 2018

Claimant’s Signature

NRIC no./ Company Stamp

Occupation/ Business

Address

Telephone No.

Witness's Name

Witness's Signature

Witness's NRIC No.

AL ingurance Pre Li (Compary Reg Ne. 1999035124

B Shenion Wy, #24-01 AXA Tower. Singaoore 068811
Customer Cemire #8101

Tel +85 GEAD 4RRR Fax: +55 6338 2572 Webnlls: www. Ban 2om 5]
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TAX INVOICE
Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

& Bangi Place Singapora 620827
Tel: GEBY 0008 Fax: 6515 2948
GST Reg No: 2016068560M

FRMEGROUP  pan No. 20160B560M
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THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[\Fnhlnln No: }SHD 95182 {insd veh)| Model: ITSUBISHI LANCER 1.5
ISJR 3349L (TP veh)

Date of Accident: 10/10/2018

Global Sum Settlement | | [ ] Yes I [X] No

Repair Estimate 5 2.020.37

Final Repair Cost s 1,284.00

Loss of Use 5 180.00 3days at $60.00 per day
Rental (if any) 3 days

LTA [ GIA Search Fee s 0.00

Others: | s| u.nu]

Final Setilement Sum ] 1,464 004

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registerad? [1 YES [X] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No - BOLA Scenario No
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: PRV o cenario No

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (") (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply

Ramarks

Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown

1) |PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD % 1.464.00
i
/
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2611212018

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill {if any)




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1-201-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL 6256 3561 FAX G256 4316

Reg MNo: 188B0T188R GET Reg Mo 18-9807188-R

Affiliated to Federation internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

Ref CC4/ASM18018531/R1fa3q2

R TOWERaIOAP R 0081 oo zonzoe NN
ATTN.PETER Code: ASM
1. Palicy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 95182 Veh. Inspected SJR 3348L
Policy No. VPX/P1680520 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No, SBMO0YZL Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 12110/2018
r Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI LANCER 1.5 c.c 1499
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. JMYSRCYZ2ABUDOTTS2 Colour RED
Odometer 126482 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/80 R18 WEST LAKE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R18 WEST LAKE B mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR POR'IEI-
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 10/10/2018 Inspection Data 1211072018
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD
6 BENQI PLACE
SINGAPORE 629927
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 2 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubv Indusinal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: B258 1561 FAX: B258 4315

Reg. No: 18060T168R GST Reg. No. 16-8607188-R Fage No 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, SJR 3349L
. Our
it Descripoon of Bats Workshop (8)| (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (COMNSISTENT) DEFORMED B15.00 B15.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (COMSISTENT) NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|REAR BUMPER RIGHT REFLECTOR (COMSISTENT) CRACKED 2200 22 00
1|REAR BUMPER TOW HOOK COVER (CONSISTENT) MISSING 21.00 21.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -B7 B0 -B7 BD
780.20 78020
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) (CONSISTENT) BENT 38.00 35.00
1|SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN} (CONSISTENT) NOT WORKING 170.00 170.00
208.00 206,00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR . CHECK 40.00 4000
WIRING
TO REMOVE REAR BUMPER .KNQCK REAR END 400,00 200.00
PANEL REFPLACE REAR BUMPER ALIGN & ADJUST
REAR BUMPER & BOOT LID
TO PUTTY RESPRAY PAINTING REAR BUMPER & REAR 450,00 300 00
END PANEL .TO POLISH
B90.00 54000
GRAND TOTAL 1.BB8.20 1,535.20
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,200.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18018531/R1fa3q2
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MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS HO LEONG CHUAN
Automolive Assessor Auwtomotive Assessor
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