Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 2:05 PM

To: charns@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Your Ref: SKE 2380H *Our Ref: CC4/11118018524/R1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD

4692K(Ill) & SKE 2380H ON 04/10/2018]

Your Ref: SKE 2380H
Our Ref: CC4/1118018524/R1PA3Q2

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement on a 50% liability basis for a global sum of $ 1,140.00 (all-in).

Kindly confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 April 2019 12:45 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [Spam-pop3] Your Ref: SKE 2380H *Our Ref: CC4/11118018524/R1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 4692K(lIl)
& SKE 2380H ON 04/10/2018]

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong
Please find attached for your necessary action.
COR: $1872.50

LOU @ $ 100 X 5 days: $500.00
LTA: $7.45



Total: $2379.95
Please confirm

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charns@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Sunday, 18 November, 2018 10:01 AM

To: Charn's Customcraft

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [Spam-pop3] Your Ref: SKE 2380H *QOur Ref: CC4/11118018524/R1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD
4692K(IIT) & SKE 2380H ON 04/10/2018]

Without Prejudice
Hi,
Thank you for your video.

We are prepared to offer 50% towards your client’s claim as both parties were changing into the same lane.
We are of the view that BOLA S19 is applicable.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 2 November 2018 10:25 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com>




Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [Spam-pop3] Your Ref: SKE 2380H *Our Ref: CC4/11118018524/R1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 4692K(l11)
& SKE 2380H ON 04/10/2018]

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong
As requested

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charns@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 24 October, 2018 4:26 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft (charns@singnet.com.sg)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: [Spam-pop3] Your Ref: SKE 2380H *QOur Ref: CC4/11118018524/R1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 4692K(III)
& SKE 2380H ON 04/10/2018]

Your Ref: SKE 2380H Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/11118018524/R1pa3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 4692K(lll) & SKE 2380H ON 04/10/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear as our insured driver reported that your client encroached into his
lane and resulted the accident. Kindy refer to the below accident statement for your easy reference.
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We would like to request a copy of your client’s video footage as stated in his GIA report for our necessary
action.

Appreciate an early reply.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)






