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Charn's Customcraft

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 15 August, 2019 4.00 PM
To: Charn's Customcraft
Cc: Admin A
Subject: FW: Your Ref: SKE 2380H *Our Ref: CC4/l118018524/R1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SHD 4692K(II) & SKE 2380H ON 04/10/2018]
Attachments: LETTER OF DISCHARGE {DV) (GLOBALSUM) SHD46952K .pdf
A
- A0

Your Ref: SKE 2380H
Our Ref: CC4/11118018524/R1PA3Q2 Q\% O\V\ .
Without Prejudice \N\L\ W ‘(’ V’ on .

(save as to costs)

Dear Rina, W A
This is a gentle reminder. SW oA \ w ) a’

Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return back with all the documents to us kXK below for our necessary action: -

Y av
¢ Original LOD e b;gtxo( e vonses/
e OriginalDV—"""_ cop
Original Final Repair Tax Invoice 7 .

Original Letter of Authorisation

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consuitants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@Ikkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 14 June 2019 11:14 AM

To: Charn’s Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKE 2380H *Our Ref: CC4/11118018524/R1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 4692K(11l) & SKE
2380H ON 04/10/2018]

Your Ref: SKE 2380H
Our Ref: CC4/11118018524/R1PA3Q2

Without Prejudice
{save as to costs)
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

Co. Reg. No. 198703792k | GST. Reg. No. M2Z-0078806-X

64 | Cecll Street | #04 | #05 | #06-02 | 108 Building | Singapure 049711

Office {65) 63476100 Email  insure@iii.com.sg

Fax

DRISCHARGE YOUCHER
lli-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: TP/ MCT18100113
Claimant Ref : SKE 2380H

(65) 62244174 Website www.ili.com.sg

We/l, CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT ("the workshop") hereby confirm that we/l have reached an agreement

with the appointed Surveyor of India International Insurance Pte Ltd

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTO (name

of Surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$ _1.140.00 _(giobal sum) (et fammmmmm—— b
worionioimbimmm——(goanoitdoed, vehicle no. SKE 23804 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred

on 041022018 (date) at _ALONG PATERSON RD

vehicle). This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 1211072018

We/l confirn that we/l are/am authorized by the owner

(location) involving vehicle no. SHD4692K  (insured
(date) at “the workshop”.

CHAN YUEN YEE ALEXIA EVE ("the third party

claimant™) of vehicle no. SKE2380H to make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle

the matter on hisfher behaif in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third

party claimant".

Wefl further confirm that well will indemnify india Intemational Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, loss and/or expense that

they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a

further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to cost of repairs and/or rentat and/or loss

of use pursuant to the damage to _SKE2380H  (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

Wefl confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of all claims of “the third party claimant”

pursuant to the accident and that further this setlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability

basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any

dispute arising out ofthe same.

We/l authorize you to pay the total amount of S$ 1,140.00

to CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT

Dated this .........day of ... A\K....ccooocoiiiien. 20 19

CLAIMANT: VoM
o) N
b1
Signature: u(‘ )h
Signed by "the workshopl @ i
Name:

NRIC: CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT
Block 1010 #01-105

Address:
Bukit Merah Lane 5
Sing
Nationality Te|:62717054/62733304

Fax: 62736876
Occupation: £ ail-charns@singnet.com sg

WITNESS:

Signature:

Name:

NRIC:

Address:

Nationality:

Occupation:

Signed by appointed Surveyor
LKKAUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

199607198

51 UB1 AVE 1, PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK

#02-25 SINGAPORE 408933




