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LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

Sector A, Block 21, Sin Miog Industrial Estate i) 1-56/58/60 Singupore 375679, Tel: 6453 B110 Fax: 6459 G267
RCB Noo |1994607592C
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"Our services include the latest and reliable CAROLINER MARK IV repair bench. draw-aligner and the support

dolly system to provide accuraie re-alignment and speedy repairs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO
Deluxe oven heater for re-spraying all motor vehicles,”
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:;

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Business
1853X%

GBB9308U

No

20 Dec 2018
VOLKSWAGEN
CADDY 1.9TDI
Black

2009
BLSA87080
WV1ZZZ2KZAX018574
$31,457.00

31 Aug 2010
31 Aug 2010

0

$1,573.00

No

-

$0.00

30 Aug 2020

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$29,389.00

$4,977.00

$4,977.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Dec 2018

NUpSIVTLa. gov.sg/tavriscnan/enguire HenateHyFubhcHetoreUaraginput /- UNL: | HON_IU= a0 i n
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Service Request Details

Claim
SAMODOXR1

Reference
Naone #

Loss Date
October 2, 2018

Request Date
October 4, 2018

Due Date
October 11. 2018

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD(TP)

Type of Lass
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perfarm service

Claim Portal

T 1op™

ok N
Ty ¥

LMM i‘hﬂ"\&'

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
GBEY208U

Make
TPVD VOLKSWAGEN

LEL]



I D Claim Portal

~ Madel
) " CAlDY

Service Address

45 MEI HWAN DRIVE, ,, 568379

Primary Contact/Insured

LOH LI FAH LOUISA

45 MEI HWAN DRIVE, 568379, Singapore
96939388
MUTUAL1@SINGNET.COM.SG

Claim Handler

LOH Cynthia
6568804843
cynthia loh@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Messages Invaices History Documents Assesement Metrics Notes

mmmmmm.mmmmmmnmmmemummmmmmm?m el



71972019 Claim Portal

« - Mandate |A> - SSMOOXR LA I INVO VING
SDQ 8063D OI & GBB 9308U(TP) O 0/20

Type
@ Question

Message

Liability: 100%. Insured driver turned out from minor road and collided with third party, Inform Ol about third
party claim, Agreed to settle at best and aware NCD issue, We seek your mandate at $1,330.95(if claim LOU)
-$£1.438.95(if claim LOR), TP-Mandate |A had been uploaded in Smartclaims. Kindly let us have your
approval/instruction. Hsiao Tong - 09 July 2019

hup:.__-’.'-.rp.|mar'|:lmms.a.r.a_mm_sg.'cl.ndnhpMsUhtmlJindexwundnr-an-mquuh.hhnhlfsawwmlmw-mmmgnﬁnmmﬁiqumﬂumbuﬂ?‘3. 11
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Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 09/07/2019

Survey Details:

Date of loss 02.10.2018

Date of appointment 04,10.2018

Date of survey 20.12 2018

Location of survey LA HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR FTELTD
Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Third party

Vehicle number GEB9308U

Make and Model Volkswagen Caddy (1894cc)

Date of registration 31.08.2010

Excess

Market Value/ Book Value 5 12,000.00 |(est)

Parf/COE Rebate 3 4.977.00 |(est)

Nett Value/ ERV 5 7.023.00 |(est)

Repair details:

Initial Estimate B 1,169.83 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 287 .85
Check items (estimate) NIL
Labour 5 650.00
Supplementary NIL
Total 5 937.85
Lump Sumlif applicable)

[Number of days for repair |




- - Cammpasitamnts
i W - o b Comprary Wegiaralios Mo 860071 EER
1T AN R b3S A I S SRR PR SN AT M s L ik AR ERRD AN ieeS) GISRATIE
Remarks:
Mandate:
Liability(TP) 100%
Propased repair cost (w/GST) 5 1,00350 | 5 1,003.50
Loss of use {4days x $80.00) 5 320.00 NIL
Loss of rental (4days x
5100.00)(w/GST) MNIL|S 428.00
Loss of income NIL NIL
LTA/GIA search fees 5 745§ 7.45
Others NIL NIL
Proposed Total 5 1,33095 | § 1,438.95




Hsiao Tuna {LKI{Autu!

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 July 2019 2:23 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: New message for service request 73579, vehicle number GBB9308U

/7119 2:10 PM*** Message Hi Hsioo Tong. COR-pls propose lump sum as vehicle more than 3 yrs LOR/LOU -
propose at $80 per day for 4 days. LTA - 37.45 - proceed. Tks - HO Winnie

—Original Message—

From: winnie.ho@axa.com.sg [mailto:winnie hoBaxa.com.sal

Sent: Tuesday, 9 July, 2019 2:13 PM

To: admin-d@/kkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 73579, vehicle number GEBF308U

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number SBMOOXR 1,

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ fo view the message in Vendor Portal.
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided
for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message. please nofity the sender
immediately.



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 5:02 PM

To: Jenny Lim

Cc Guo Qiang (LKKAuta)

Subject: RE: Finalisation - GBB 9308U / Volkswagen Caddy *LKK REF:
CC4/ASMT1B018523/Gpal

Without Prejudice

Dear Jenny,

As spoken earlier, for COR, we have our principal instruction o otter at L/sum $750.00(before GST) wilh 02
repair days.

Kindly confirm and forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation fo act.
rental recelpt) to us [LKK) for our necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed f inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settiement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materlally affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-9197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Jenny Lim .

Sent: Saturday, 6 April, 2019 11:21 AM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Finalisation - GBB 9308U / Volkswagen Caddy

Dear Sir
For your confirmation, please:

« Pars: $ 319.83
. L&P: $ £50.00
Total. _§ 965.83/2 days

Supporting document and photographs are enclosed for your reference.
Thank you.

Kind regards.



Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & £07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267
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Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

Fram: Jenny Lim <jenny lim@laihuatcom.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 17 October 2019 5:18 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalisation - GBB 9308U / Volkswagen Caddy *LKK REF:
CC4/ASM18018523/Gpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong

We refer to the above matter

We are agreeable to your offer to settle our client's claim as provided therein.
Please let us have the discharge voucher.
Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Dnive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110
Fax: 64556267

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2019 10:55 am

To: lenny Lim <jenny. lim@ laihuat.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalisation - GBB 9308U / Volkswagen Caddy *LKK REF: CC4/ASM18018523/Gpa3
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GS5T) S 80250
2. Loss of Use (2days x $80.00) $ 160.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 200

Total | 5 964.50

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of llability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/ar the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims."



Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 5:02 PM

To: Jenny Lim <jenny. lim@lalhuat.com.sg>

Cc: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) < ng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalisation - GBB 9308U / Volkswagen Caddy *LKK REF: CC4/ASM18018523/Gpa3

Without Prejudice
Dear Jenny,

As spoken eariier, for COR, we have our principal instruction fo offer at L/sum $750.00(before GST) with 02
repair days.

Kindly confirm and lorward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill. cuthorisation fo acl.
renfal receipt) to us |LKK) for our necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event af new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhti@[kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, po2-25 | S(408933)

From: Jenny Lim [mailto:jenny.lim@lalhuat.com.sg]
Sent: Saturday, 6 April, 2019 11:21 AM

To: Guo Qlang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Finalisation - GBB 9308U / Volkswagen Caddy

Dear Sir
For your confirmation, please:

= Pars: § 318.83
o L&P: $ 650.00
Total: § 969.83/2 days

Supporting document and photographs are enclosed for your reference.



Thank you.
Kind regards

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #404-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267
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LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

# s 160 Sin Ming Deive #4001, 904-02 & WI7-03 Singapore $75722 Tel! 6353 8110 Fax: 6459 6267
GST Noc M2-01 28608 3
UTEN, 1994075920

TAX INVOICE
EST No. .....: ESTD0D20405 GST Reg No ... M2-0128609-3
Back to Flowers Page = A of 1
Number .. .. . ... " INVD022802
Yourrel. .................. TP-SDQ 8063D AXA
Job No. .... 5 ... 69879
Ol s aann A 157004
Payment .. o
Attn o Date e veanin . 1782018
Vehicle No ... GBB 9308U
Vehicle Model = Volkswagen Caddy
Accident on . : 2/10/2018
Quantity Unit Description Unit price Disc. pct Amount
1.00 To supply and replace parts, labour charges 750.00 750.00
for repairing, knocking, weiding and to
respray paint
Sub-Total 750.00
GST 7.00% 52.50
Total Ss 802.50

tiamnatidn CAROLINER MARKIV i, it enBRIBFfakn TRASHEANARSAN KRS N,

B, B h Rk i® SAICO Deluxe = & &2 4

"Our services include the latest and relinble CAROLINER MARK [V repair bench, draw-aligner and the support
dolly system to provide accurate re-alignment and speedy repairs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO
Deluxe oven heater for re-spraying all motor vehicles.”
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LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

Sin Ming Autocity
160 Sin Ming Drive #04-01/#04-02/#07-03 Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110 Fax: 64596267
UEN: 199407592C

Your Ref: SDQ 8063D 26 September 2019
Our Ref: GBB 9308U - 2018/JL

AXA Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd WITHOUT PREJUDICE
8 Shenton Way

#27-01

AXA Tower

Singapore 0GBE11

Atteniion. Motar Claims

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GBB 9308U AND SDQ 8063D ON 02/01/2018 ALONG T-
JUNCTION OF BRIGHT HILL DRIVE AND SIN MING AVENUE

We refer 1o the above matter wherein your insured's vehicle no. SDQ 80630 was involved in an accident
with our client's vehicle no. GBB 9308U.

As the accident was caused by your insured's negligence, our client is now claiming for the following losses:

+ Repar cost £ B02.50 (include GST)
« |Loss of use $ 200.00 (2 days x $100 per day)

s LTA searchfea 5 2.00
Tolal 51.004 50

Relevant documents in suppart of our client's claim are enclosed for your reference

Please do not hesitaie to contacl Jenny Lim al lelephone 64533757 or email jenny.im@laihual com &g
should you need any additional information

Meanwhile. we look forward to receiving your affirmative response soon enouah.
Thank you.
Yours faithfully
W
-
LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD

encs



y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

2 S mam 51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 18-8607188-R
Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automablle
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref - CC4/ASM1B018523/Gpa3q2
A TONERSINGAPORE s ooe: oo [N
ATTN.WINNIE HO Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SDQ BOG3D Veh. Inspected GBE 5308U
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SEMOOXR1 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 04/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN CADDY c.c 1898
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No, W\VIZZZ2KZAX018574 Colour BLACK
Odometer 163965 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Meodification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/85R15 NEUTON B mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 NEUTON 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |193/83 R15 NEUTON & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 NEUTON & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5 i ‘General Information
Accident Date 02/10/2018 Inspection Date 2011272018
Survey held at LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
180 SIN MING DRIVE #04-01/02
SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. | Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NOCRMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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1 V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-y 51 Ubi Ave 1 #0125 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933

TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg No. 19-09807188-R Fage No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBB 9308U 4
- 'Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition S
o | i Workshop ()| (5
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAIL LAMP RH (N) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 288,90 286.90
1|REAR SLIDING DOOR RAIL COVER RH (N) MISSING 30.83 30.93
(CONSISTENT)
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -31.98
319.83 287.85
LABOUR
TO KNOCK DENTS ON REAR FENDER RH AND RENEW 350.00 250.00
OF PARTS
TO SPRAY PAINT (INCLUDING REAR BUMPER). 500.00 400.00
850.00 £50.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,169.83 937.85
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS ~ 750.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) | = ;
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18018523/Gpadq2
XING GUO QIANG HO LEONG CHUAN

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

Auvtomotive Assessor

OISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report /s made sclely for i uss snd bensflil of the Cliant nemed on the lrent pags of this Repor.
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