Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 3:47 PM

To: 'Eileen Chua'

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ADVISE LIABILITY-Fw: Request for survey of our client - SGL5148D accident with
AXA Insured - SHF666C on 28.09.2018 THIRD PARTY CLAIM *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM18018522/wa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your Ref: SGL 5148D
Our Ref: CC4/ASM18018522/Kwa3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident Involving Vehicle SGL5148D and SHF666C on 28.09.2018

We refer to the above matter

Kindly check and advise if your client is still interested to pursue with his third-party claim against our principal M/s
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please respond and let us know within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we shall have no other option
but to submit our report to our principal for closure.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Eileen Chua [mailto:ahlimmc@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 12 October, 2018 2:34 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>



Subject: ADVISE LIABILITY-Fw: Request for survey of our client - SGL5148D accident with AXA Insured - SHF666C on
28.09.2016 THIRD PARTY CLAIM *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18018522/wa3

Hi Vivian,

The Taxi SHF666C are not suppose to turn right from the gantry. As the arrow show going straight at the
gantry. Vehicle B is liability for the
wrong flow of traffic and cause the collision.

The Taxi should go all the way to the behind open car park and turn out from the car park and go to the
pick up point at the lobby.
Please see attached photo.

Please kindly advise the liability.

Best Regards,

Eileen Chua

Ah Lim Motor Company

No. 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind. Park 2A

#01-09 AMK Autopoint S(568047)

Tel: 64831244 Fax: 64836170

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, October 11, 2018 7:01 PM

To: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) ; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) ; Admin A ; assignments
Subject: RE: Request for survey of our client - SGL5148D accident with AXA Insured - SHF666C on 28.09.2016
THIRD PARTY CLAIM *** | KK REF: CC4/ASM18018522/wa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we are currently pending verification for direct settlement.

Fyi, OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.



Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

Qs Fw . gted b fered

Circumstances of Accldent

On 28.09.2018 at about 1740hours, | was heading straight along Changi South Avenue 2, Medtronic Lobby to pick up my
passanger. Suddenly | fell an impacl Vehicle B (SGL51480) which drive aul from my right withoul ehacking Tor oncoming vehicle
and hit onto my taxi front right portion.

Please provide us evidence i.e. video/ scene photo and arrange for TP survey.
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vivian at 6841 8625.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 4 October, 2018 2:26 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Request for survey of our client - SGL5148D accident with AXA Insured - SHF666C on 28.09.2016 THIRD
PARTY CLAIM

Dear all,

Pls assist to arrange survey of our client’s car SGL5148D accident with AXA Insured - SHF666C on
28.09.2016 THIRD PARTY CLAIM



Pls assign OIC and advise on liability. Car is not in the workshop. Pls request surveyor to contact us to
arrange for survey.

Thanks

Regards

Kee Mui Hong

Ah Lim Motor @ AMK

No. 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A
#01-09 AMK Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 64831244 Fax : 64836170



