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MS @FirstCapital

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapone JMBSED
Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (BS) 6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited co®eq

B JUSIIQI0GE  G5T ey Mo M2 -0O0LETS §

LIzt & Hater Usdermriting Dept: 36 Roinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel: (B5) 6507 3648 Fax: (65] 6507 3849
winw mstirsteapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

08-10-2018 Our Ref No
08-10-2018 Claim Type
SHC8388L Third Party Vehicle

21 Bulim Drive Bulim Bus Depot
SHARIFAH

BRIT1747! 98482243 Fax MNo.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE: NO EST.

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

. D1B007355MFSH

. Third Party

. 5G5025J

. 68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

TOWER TRANSIT Attent] NIL
SINGAPORE PTE LTD Silosais
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

SEREME

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,




Shirlei Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Sharifah Nusaybah Binte Syed Jamil Binshahab <sharifah@towertransit.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2018 5:10 PM

To: Rasul (LKkAuto)

Cc: Subramanian Kasi; Wu Tzu Ying

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Inspection - Accident Involving SG5025) & SHCB399L D.OA:
08/10/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Rasul,

We confirm COR @ 51,200.00 / 2 days of repair.

Thank you.

Sharifah Nusaybah (Ms)
Senior Executive, Claims

Maobile +65 9848 1243
Office  +65 6817 1747
Email  sharifah@towertransit.sg

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Lta
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170

TRANSIT Registration nember 20141941 7K

Tower Transit Singapone
Best Workplace
Culture & Engagement
HAM Awards 2017

Buruness of the Year
Brtish Expertise
mterngtional Awarnds 2017

Winnes, Customer Engagement calegory
15th Annual Busingss Awards
British Chamber of Commerce Singopore

Disclaimer: This emall and any attached files may be coin

communicatad to or by any other rsan. If yoru nave recened this emal

emall are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit

From: Rasul (LKKAuta) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent; Thursday, 15 November, 2018 5:01 PM

To: Sharifah Nusaybah Binte Syed Jamil Binshahab <sharifah@towertransit.sg>

Cc: Subramanian Kasi <Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg>; Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>
Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Inspection - Accident Involving SG5025) & SHC8399L D.0.A: 08/10/2018

Hi Sharifah,

As spoken,



finalised amount for this case is $ 1,200.00 / 2 days of repair
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #0z-25 | 5(408933)

F SN

RERER W Shve the Larthe Print only when necessary

From: Sharifah Nusaybah Binte Syed Jamil Binshahab [mailto;sharifah@towertransit.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 14 November, 2018 4:00 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Subramanian Kasi; Wu Tzu Ying

Subject: Pre-Repair Inspection - Accident Involving 5G5025] & SHC8395L D.O.A: 08/10/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Rasul,

Please see attached GIA Report, repair estimate and after-repair photos as requested.
Please finalise on the cost.

Thank you.

Sharifah Musaybah (Ms)
Senior Executive, Claims

Mabile +65 9848 2243
Office  +85 6BIT 1747
Email  sharifah{@towertransic.sg

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd

21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
Registration number 201413417k

www towertransit.sg

Tower Trandit Group
temational

Bunaness of Lhe Year

British Expertise b
international Awards 2017

Tower Transit Singapore
Best workplace
Culture & Engagement
HAM Awords 2017

Tower Tranut Sngapare
Winner, Customer Engagement category
ith Annugl Business Awards

Brivich chamber of Commerce Singopore

Desclalmer: This emall and any attached filas may ental, privileged and intandad salely for the i
communicated to o by any othor parscn I wiou iz cenped this amail by arror slpasa dolete i and notify the T I T B
mail are ot Aacezsarily the viows of Tower Transit



From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

sent: Wednesday, 10 October, 2018 6:26 PM

To: Sharifah Nusaybah Binte Syed Jamil Binshahab <sharifah@towertransit.sg>

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <ewsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; QUR REF : D18007355MFSH ; YOUR REF: 5G5025)

Dear Sir/Madam
PRI Request For $G5025) Accident Involving SHC8399L On 08-10-2018 AT 10:15:00HRS.

Please find below details for your reference

« Claim number : D18007355MFSH

« Insured vehicle number : SHC8399L

« Accident date : 08-10-2018

« Third-party vehicle number : 5G5025]

« Assignment type : WITHOUT PREJ UDICE

« Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
« Officer-in-Charge : SERENE

Ps: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Mator Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

DISCLAIMER: This email and any attached files may be confidential, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed,
acted upon, filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email in error please delete it and natify the sender
immediately. If you do not wish o receive general email communications, or you wish to change/update your email details, please amail
greyiftowertransit.co uk to tell us. The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit




Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew®Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 October 2018 9:28 AM

To: ‘Serene Ler: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007355MFSH/M
Dear Serene.

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SG 5025J on 12/10/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 10:38 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007355M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Mator Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)
Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 6:26 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007355M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.



Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWWw.avg.com




ESTIMATED ACCIDENT REPAIR COST

 rowes

—-.___-

TRANSIT
EMGIMEERING

ACCIDENT TIME BUS REGISTRATION
REPORTED 1045HRS NUMBEER SG5025)
ACCIDENT DATE 8-0ct-18 BUS TYPE (5D,/DD) (#]8]
BUS CAPTAIN NAME BAHTHIAR BIN MD HASSAN BUS ROUTE NUMBER
EMPLOYEE NUMBER BLIS ADVERTS [Y/N) N
SECTION 1: PARTS & CONSUMABLE ITEMS (MATERIAL COST)
Part No. Part or Item Description Quantity Tatal Cost
7% G5T 50.00
FINAL TOTAL COST %0.00
SECTION 2: ASSESSMENT / REPAIR f SPRAY PAINT (LABOUR COST)
LABOUR ITEM |PLEASE SPECIFY IF ITS ASSESSMENT, REPAIR OR SPRAY PAINT) TOTAL COST
TO REPLACE/REPAIR THE DAMAGED PARTS (INCLUDING SPRAY PAINTI NG) l,'}qj.b 51 00
7% G5T £112.00
FINAL TOTAL COST £1,712.00

PAGE 1




TRANSIT

ESTIMATED ACCIDENT REPAIR COST @ ENGINEERING

A 4

SECTION 5: REPAIRS TO BUS ADVERTISMENT VINYLS/PANELS [ADVERTISEMENT COST)

TOTAL ADVERTISEMENT REPAIR COST A

SECTION 6: RECOVERY OF ACCIDENT BUS (TOWING COST)

TOTAL TOWING COST -

SECTION 7: NUMBER OF DAYS UNDER ACCIDENT REPAIR [LOSS OF USE CO5T)

Date In For Repairs 13/10/2018

Date Out From Repairs 15/10/2018

BUS TYPE ($D / DD} s Mumber of Days Under Repair 2
LOS5 OF USE COST SB00.00

SUMMARY

SECTION NO. CO5T

1 £0.00 WIOOG%

2 51,712.00
s | 3.

A - |l‘tb{t¥€ [(J{{'r

5 SE00.00

ESTIMATED ACCIDENT

2,512.0 \
il sl Rusery Al Fpr

PAGE 2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
54 Ukl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408%33
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607T198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Intarnationale Das Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCIBO1B454/R 1sd3nZ
oL 1Ty HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 D, aieane IH"N'”M"N""N
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 8398L Veh. Inspected §G 5025
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim MNo. D1B00T355MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From  SERENE Assign Date 10M10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLWVO BSTL 9.4L c.C 9364
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. YVIS4PE2EGAITET2E Colour GREEN
Odometer 165382 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |275/70 R22.5 MICHELIN 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |275/70 R22.5 MICHELIM & mm
R/H Rear Tyre 27570 R22.5 (D) MICHELIN 878 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |27570 R22.5 (D) MICHELIN B8 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date 08102018 Inspection Date 12110/2018
Survey held at TOWER TRANSIT SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
21 BULIM DRIVE
SINGAPORE 548170
Sa. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED OM A'WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CYIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

lEST1M.ﬁ.TED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




' Pl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- mam m 54 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
G TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 199607188R GST Reg. Mo, 19-0607163-R Fage No.1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. 5G 5025J

: : Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition
ty P Workshop ($)) ($)
LABOUR
TO REPLACE/REPAIR THE DAMAGED PARTS 1,600.00 1,200.00
{INCLUDING SPRAY PAINTING).
1,600.00 1,200.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,600.00 1,200.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 1,200.00)
Report Ref No, CS/FCI18018454/R1sd3n2
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

GISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use snd benefit of the Client

W.HMWWMUM:M_WW
Eeporl. in whole or in part, does S0 at his or her own mek

mamad on the front page of this Report.

acting or realying on this



