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AR, B B P L

51 UBI AVE 1, #801-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (65) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18007354MFSH Date: 16/10/2018
QOur Ref: CS/FCI1B018418/Utd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO_SLG 26815
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

11/10/2018 at the premises of M/s Kah Motor and have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount o 7.731.09
Revised Estimate Amount ' 5 4. 888.92
“Check” Items Amount : 5% (.00
Market Value 1 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value : S§
Nett Value : 8%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the
o/s ¢ portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Marcus
Automotive Assessor



MS@FirstCapital

MS First Capital Insurance Limited comes Mo 1350000060 GST Rey Mo 42 00016759
B Raffies Quay 421-00 Singapore 048580

Tel (65) 6222 2311 Fax: [B5) 6222 3547

Chalms & Motor Undemwiting Deps: 26 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: (65} 6507 3848 Fax: (BS) 6507 3849

www msfirsteapltal. com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

09-10-2018 Our Ref No. D18007354MFSH
06-10-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHAT7B27X Third Party Vehicle. SLG2681S

BODY REPAIR & PAINT CENTRE 8 MANDAI ESTATE
JESHURUEBEN RAQ THOMAS (RUEBEN)

68465672/ 80721766 Fax No. 63651949

DIRECT SETTLEMENT: EST. COR - §8272.27

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN.
BHD.

MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. MIL

JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

wssao g




Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 October 2018 10:58 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments
Cc: ‘Joanne Yong Lai fong’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007354MFSH/1
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SLG 2681S.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle 5LG 26815

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315
Blk 51 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 4:26 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong Lai fong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007354MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer arrange on 11/10/2018.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 4:11 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong Lai fong
<jopanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007354MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 4:08 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Pre-Invoice Of Vehicle No: 5LG26815 For Finalising
Attachments: 1085_001.pdf

CSIFCI18018418/Utd3

From: Jeshurueben Rao Thomas <jeshurueben@honda.com.sg=>
sent: Tuesday, 23 October, 2018 3:55 PM

To: Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=

Subject: Pre-Invoice Of Vehicle No: SLG2681S For Finalising

Dear Marcus,
We enclosed the total final repair costs of...

Vehicle No. SLG26815

Final Repair Costs (include GST) $4,998.83

Repair Period*(Working Day) 6 days

*Note: Repair period does not include Sunday And Public Holiday.

Please examine the above information carefully. If no discrepancy is reported within 7 days (exclude Sunday and
Public Holiday) from the date of this email, the information will be considered as correct. Thereafter, no adjustment
will be made.

Thank You

Warmest Regards

Jeshurueben Rao Thomas (Rueben) -
Bodyshop Service Advisor

Kah Motor Body Repair Centre

15, Ubi Road 4

Singapore 408610

Tel : 68465672

Hp:90721766

ODYSSEY

EXECUTIVE LLIURY. FAMILY COMFORT,

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this

1



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 1

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
8756E

S5LG26815

No

11 0ct 2018

HONDA

JAZZ 1.5VTIR CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
White

2016

L15B31190416
JHMGK5850HX200666
96.0 kW (128 bhp)
$17,528.00

26 Sep 2016

26 Sep 2016

0

$12,528.00 b LY/

Yes

25 Sep 2026
$9,396.00

25 Sep 2026

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$52,503.00

$41,769.00

$51,165.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 11 Oct 2018

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput ?FUNCTION _1D=F030...

11-Oct-18



Used honda jazz Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page 1 of 3

scCarMART.COM Login  Sign up
New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Farum Resources

M ], W

CONNECTING CAR BUYERS & SELLERS. CONNECT
We'll handle your loans, insurance & other paperwork for FREE. ELLLUR \)

Post an Advertisament Up To $0% Loan Available! 1 Owner With 53000km Done

Sek i yoursell Advertise it at just

%58 until it's SOLD!

Ful-Anceconings, Roed Tex TH
March 5014, Trade In Availatle
Call For Viewing
Cardt Pt ltd 5t

Past an Ad Adlvartiser Login Waiys of Sedling
Browise by Category [~] wBack {12) Next = St try Diaste Posted o [70 resunsjpage v |
22 vehicles horcla jare fadvanoed Search W Submig e
ke Maociel Proe Dpreciation Rexy Duabe Eng Cap Mikssgs Wt Typs Skatus
Search Selection homia jarz vy Ay 2016 My Any Arvy Availatile
Honda Jarz 1.54 RS $65,800 $7.890 fyr 20-Mary- 2016 1,458 o 35,000 lom Hatchback Available
$0 Do Payment Availabiel Balioon Scheme Avaisbliel We Are SGCARMART Premium Deser 2015-20177 Buy With Confidence! o Hidden Cost! Low
Midpage! 100%, Acoicentt Fres! In Mouse Loan O Bank Loan Avsia e
B8 Motor Trading
Posiect: | 1-0c-T08H  Tags: A1 Monda lazx, D006 henda jasr Honds Jarr, oo gae, Honda, lare, jerr, Ueed Honda
Honda Jazz 1.34 SE4,B00 §7,720 fye 27-Jun-2016 131Bex . Hatzhback Avadlahibe
40 Down Payment Avaiabiel Balloon Scheme Available! W Are sgCarMart Premmium Desler 20152047 Buy With Corfidence! o Hidden Costl Low
Milgage! 100% Accident Freel In House Loan O Bank Loan Awitan,, WLl
B8 Malor Trading
Posterd: 11-Con- 2008 Tags: MeLh Honda Jazz, 2016 honds ez, Honda lasz, honds jarr, Bonds, S, e, Uised Hoida
Honda Jazz 1.5A RS #68,800 SEO10 fyr CE-Aug-2016 1498 oo 35,650 lom Hatchback Available
ik
Lucky Regitration Date. O8/08/ 2016 Single Cwner Unk WIth Low Mieage Done. Condition Like New Car. Buy With A Peace OF Mind Wikh 5 Years Or e
Uinkmged Warranty By Kah Malor + Free Sarvicing For 3 Ye. R
i Pomte®: 10-0c-0ER Tagse 2016 Honda Tazs, 3000k honda ez, Honda larz, honda pare, Honda, lace. jarr, Used Honda

Fleobie Viewing Time e
Posted: 30 0o 2008 T

By, ez, Lisied Hohda

HILE Honda Jaze, 2006 honda jerr, Honda Jaa, honds jars, Honda

Fabelous Pandemic LMB Monoblock 207 Rim
I Mo scratches. Looks like brand rer. Comes with receipt
iome inf abioul this product

Honda Jazz 1.54 RS £70,666 £8,200 v 25-Jut-2016 1,498 ¢t 27,000 km Hatchbark Awailabbe

High Loan Awilablel 1 Owner, Kah Mobar Unit, Serviced And Maintained By Kah Mator, S Years Warranly From First Ragistration And Comes With &
Kimn Mileage Fres Servicing, Definitely Worth Buying This .

Honda Jazz 1.5A RS 573,000 S8, 160 fyr 20-Dec- 2015 1458 cx - Halchback Availabin
Wil Kept, First Owner, Low Mileage, Family Jnd Car, Careful Lady Drver, Kah Motor Servicing. Direct Owrer, Mo Traffic Offence. Mo Bad Reoord.

Crestive Ao

Posied: OR-Cet- 2018 Tags: 7016 Honde Jax

16 honda jarr, Honda Jazz, bonds jacr, Honda, Jaes, jaes, Lsad Honda

Honda lazr 1.5A RS 468,800 £8,160 fyr 24-Jun-2016 1,498 oo 24,200 iom Hatcnback Available

Lo Mileage. 5 Years Agent Warraaly Iact Buy 'With A Peace Of Mind From Vantage Pre-owned, A Member Of The Sime Darby Group. Completa
With Qur Comprehenseve 72-paint Mechanical Inspection. Trade Ins.,

varfiage Pre-Chmed

Prsted: DE-QCU-POIA  Tags: 2016 Honoa lary, JOLh honda jezz, Fonda Jaee, honda jare, Honda, 1oz, |aag, Used Honda

£ Dirive Awiay] Only § Owner) Low Milsage OF Dnly 25000kms Traveled! Fully Mamtained By Kah Mobor! Agent Unit With 5 Years Linlimited Mieage:
‘Warranty! High Trade In And [n House Financng Available!...

H Honda Jazz 1.54 RS 564,800 %8, 190 fyr 15-Jan-2016 1,458 oz 25,009 km Hatehiback Availabie

Posted: BA-0ct-2003 Tags: 7006 Honda Jaz, 2016 honda jarz, Honda lea, honds jagz, onda, Mgz, jaer, Usid Honda

Honda Jarr 1.54 RS 67,800 $8.150 Jyr 18-May-2016 1438 oo 42,000 km Hatchbac: Availalle
[ ¥y

hitps://www sgcarmart.com/used _cars/listing. php?MOD=hondatjazz& PRC=0&DEP=... 11-Oct-18



v HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)
Service and Body Repair

Tel: +85 6841 2838

Wabsite: www. honda.com.sg

For 24-hours Roadside Assistance, Call 28203838

Q! ATION

GST Reg No.: M200050223
Company Ref. No.: S60FC1380G

Customer - MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANGCE Document No. . SOT18004307 Fage 1
36 ROBINSON ROAD Date : 10. Oct 2018
#16-01 CITY HOUSE Customer No. - WZF002
SINGAPORE 068877 Svc Advisor : RUEBEN THOMAS
RegistrationNo . SLG26B1S Engine Mo : L15B31190416
Chassis No : JHMGKSB50HX 200666 Date | Time + 10. Oct 2018 9:58:59 AM
Maodel + JAZZ 1. 5VTIR CVT 17YM Surveyor Name -
Owner's Name - CHWA MANG LENG Survey Date d
Ins Policy No. : Authorisation Date
Date of Accident  : B/10/2018
0% GST Amount
Item Description gty UnitPrice Disc% _ Amount AMOU nt incld GST
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT (W/NOD: |
OWNER: CHWA MANG LENG
OWNER INSURER: TOKIO MARINE INSURANCE
ACE DATE: 06/10/2018
SURVEYED BY:
DATE:
REF NG:
TP INSURER: MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
TP VEH: SHATE27X
04631-TAS-300ZZ  PANEL SET R.SIDE - 1 223.30 25 167,47 X 1172 179,19
B7510-TEA-N10ZZ  PANEL COMPR RR.DOOR 2%/4 A 1 70340 .~ 25 527,55 .~ 3603 564 48
87825-T5A-003 TAPER RRDOOR SASH L 1 1540 25 1155 081 12.36
71800-TSB-003ZM  GARN ASSY R SIDE {l{fmﬂ?_&”f 1 a0 2524 Caoggr— 2180 30181
42700-T5A-N91 DISKALUMINIUM WHEEL 16X8) w7 f?.“f ¢ 1 81960 25 61470 ¥ 4303 £57.73
Sum ltem  1631.08 11418 1.745.27
BO-WHEEL ALIGN X4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT X4 1 180.00 18000 1260 192,60
Sum Ext. Service 180.00 1280 192.60
BOSUN SUNDRIES 1 5000 A AD 50.00 3.50 53.50
BOJSE BODY JOINT SEALANT 1 100.00 /]~ )( 100.00 7.00 107.00
BOBC BODY UNDERSIDE COATING (N} 1 10000 14 A 100.00 7.00 107.00
BPOOR APPLY BODY UNDERSIDE COATING (N) 1 25000 A1 W 250.00 1750 267.50
BOMISC1 RESET VEHICLE SMART ENTRY SYSTEM (N} 1 320.00 32000 2240 342 .40
BKDRZIR Egﬂ?s"tl'r'ﬁ & TRANSFER ITEMS TO NEW RR R DR. 1 350,00 aﬁn_mk/’ 24 50 474.50
BMI03D T EETALL R CGMFAT’;‘E”T 1 3soo0 2 U7 3000, 2450 37450
BKSP12R CUT OFF & RENEW R SILL PANEL. STRAIGFI-T?FEN ALIGN 1 240000 [ [ Lo 2400.00 -+ 168.00 2568.00
S :s;;?m PAINTING ON REPAIRED G; EE{:MGED AREAS. 200000 / O%LJ 2000.00, 140,00 2140.00



| HONDA
KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.

(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

Service and Body Repair
Tel. +55 6841 3638
For 24-hours Roadside Assistance, Call 95203838

Website: www honda.com.sg

QUOTATION

(35T Reg No.: M200050223
Company Ref. Mo S60FC1380G

Customer . MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE Document No, : SQT18004307 Page 2
36 ROBINSON ROAD Date « 0. Oct 2018
#16-01 CITY HOUSE Customer No. « WZF002
SINGAPORE 068877 Svc Advisor - RUEBEN THOMAS
Registration No - SLG2BE1S Engine No : L15B31190416
Chassis No + JHMGKS5850HX 200666 Date | Time : 10. Oct 2018 9:59:59 AM
Model + JAZZ 1 8VTIR CVT 17YM Surveyor Name
Owner's Hame - CHWA MANG LENG Survey Date
Ins Policy Mo. . Authorisation Date
Date of Accident  : 6/10/2018
0% GST _ Amount
Item Description Qty Unit Price _ Disc % Amount Amount incld GST
Sum Labor 582000  414.40 6.334.40
Survey By Mereu( AK'CLC‘L
Date & Time ;,r//,f J/; f (/3. Total Amount 773108 54118  B.27227
Excess e y, Total {Inclusive of GST) 827227
Status vy ﬁ%{#’(
Signature .ré—'-'" ‘.’J&-é_r (.‘J/’l—"f i 4 f%d,{/cﬁ.-" 'r_,;j
f
A
{:/" W/;r

[ o

Printed on 10/10/2018 10:31:56 AM
This &5 @ computer generalad invoice No signaturs |s requinad

Pan prices ane subyecied 1o change withaul nolica

Tha abowe eslimated cost of repair do net include any unforesean damages

GST Amount is calculaled from individeal inals)



v HONDA
KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.

f).‘_% i Li]} Da 1%

AT AR CUS CHUA

(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

370 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408881, Tel: =85 6841 IBBI Fac +65 6741 5022
285 Alexandra Road Singapore 159937. Tel 465 6479 5458 Faw: +65 6471 5460

. eae U
(¢ ) SERVICE PRE-INVOICE

G5T Reg No., M200050223
Company Ref. No.: S60FC1380G

wo: 6 pays

Customer: WZFO02Z /| MS FIRST CAPITAL Document No: SVO1B0BOATY
Chassis No: JHMGKEA50HX 200666 Printed By: JESHURUEBEN
License No: SLG26815 Order Date: 15. October 2018
Mileage: 17320 Order Time: 1:14:09 PM
Engine No: L15B831190416 Service Advisor: RUEBEN THOMAS
ITEM DESCRIPTION QT  UNIT DISC% AMOUNT T
TP DIRECT SETTLEMEMNT {JINC:71418)
OWNER: CHWA MANG LENG
OWNER INSURER: TOKIO MARINE INSURANCE
ACC DATE! 061072018
SURVEYED BY: MARCUS (LKK)
DATE: 117110/2018
REF MO: D1800T354MFSH
TP INSURER: MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
TP VEH: SHATE2TX
BT510-TSA-N10ZZ PANEL COMPR.RR.DOCR 1 70340 25 527.55 38,93 SEt 48
RETA25-TSA-003 TAPER.RR.DOOR SASH 1 15.40 25 11.55 0.81 12.36
71800-T58-003ZD GARMISH ASSYR.SIDE 1 353.60 25 27270 18.08 291.78
SUM PARTS: 811.80 56.83 BEB.B3
BOSUN 0872 1 20,00 20.00 1.40 21.40
SUNDRIES
BOMISCA 0E26 1 320.00 320,00 22.40 342 40
RESET VEHICLE SMART ENTRY
SYSTEM (M)
BKDR2ZR EXT-¥J i 350.00 380,00 24,50 374,50
REMOWVE & TRANSFER ITEMS TO NEW
RR R DR, ADJUST
& ALIGN RR R DR.(M)
BMIDID EXT-Yd 1 250.00 280.00 17.50 267.50
REMOWVE & INSTALL RH INNER
COMPARTMENT LININGS
GARNISHES.(N)
BKSP12ZR EXT-¥J 1 1,120.00 1,120.00 78.40 1,198.40
CUT OFF & RENEW R SILL PANEL.
STRAIGHTEN ALIGHN
S|DE FLOOR PAMEL & REMEW CAMAGE
PARTS.
BPD4R EXT-YBH 1 1.800.00 1,800.00 126.00 1,926.00
SPRAY PAINTING ON REFAIRED OR
REPLACED AREAS (4P)
SUM LABOUR: 3,860.00 270.20 4,130.20
TOTAL SGD 4 871.80 327.03 4 938 83
Total Payable (SGD) 4,996.83

GET Amount = calculsted from indivioual lina[s}



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607T198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSCON ROAD

Ref CSIFCIB018418/Ud3n2

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 088877 Coa.: sesatigio ” ”li“”lﬂllmmm
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHATEZTX Veh. Inspected 5LG 26815
Policy No. Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. D18007354MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANMNE YONG Assign Date 10/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA JAZZ (A} €.C 1458
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2018
Chassis No. JHMGHKS850HX 200666 Colour WHITE
Odometer 19337 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |1B5/55 R16 DUNLOP 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre 185/55 R16 DUNLOP 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/55 R16 DUNLOP 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 18555 R16 DUNLOP 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  06/10/2018 Inspection Date 11/10/2018
Survey held at 15 UBI ROAD 4
Repairer KAH MOTOR.CO.SDN.BHD
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: & Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607196-R Page No. 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLG 26818
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§)) 5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|PANEL SET, R SIDE (SN) TO REFPAIR SEE 167.47 -
LABOUR
1|PANEL COMPR.RR DOOR [SN) DENTED / BENT 827 55 B27.55
1| TAPER.RR DOOR SASH (SN) NECESSARY 11.55 11.55
1|GARN ASSY R SIDE (SN) DEFORMED / 309.82 27270
WARPED
1|DISKALUMINIUM WHEEL 16XEJ (CUT)(SN) NOT CONSISTENT 614.70 -
WITH THE IMPACT
1|SUNDRIES (SN) MECESSARY 50.00 20.00
1|BODY JOINT SEALANT [SN) NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
1,781.09 831.80
LABOUR
WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY 180.00
BODY UNDERSIDE COATING. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 ]
AFPPLY BODY UNDERSIDE COATING, MOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
RESET VEHICLE SMART ENTRY SYSTEM. 320,00 320.00
REMOVE & TRANSFER ITEMS TO NEW RR R DR ADJUST 350.00 350.00
REMOVE & INSTALL RH INNER COMPARTMENT LININGS. 350.00 250.00
CUT OFF & RENEW R SILL PANEL STRAIGHTEN 2,400.00 1.120.00
ALIGN.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF PANEL SET.R
SIDE.
SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR REPLACED AREAS. 2,000.00 1,800.00
(4P,
5,950.00 3,840.00
GRAND TOTAL 7.731.09 4,671.80
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | [ a671.80]
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CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report i made sobely for the use and benefit of the Cliant named on the front page of this Report.
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