Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 November, 2018 3:24 PM

To: Cindy Tan

Cc: xiaogui_060887 @yahoo.com.sg; Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO. SFY 7502U, SLV 5913A & SJK 2840C ALONG

STEVENS ROAD TOWARDS SCOTTS ROAD ON 7 OCTOBER 2018 AT 1810 HRS [Our
ref: KSG/4817/2018/L/ct]
Attachments: Notice to Clt Ins.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Cindy,

Noted with thanks.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LSES

" Save the Larth Print only whern necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Cindy Tan [mailto:cindy.tan@kannansg.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 16 November, 2018 3:00 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: xiaogui_060887 @yahoo.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO. SFY 7502U, SLV 5913A & SJK 2840C ALONG STEVENS ROAD TOWARDS
SCOTTS ROAD ON 7 OCTOBER 2018 AT 1810 HRS [Our ref: KSG/4817/2018/L/ct]

Dear Sirs,
Please find enclosed our letter to AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd dated 16 November 2018.

Our client denies liability for the accident. Please do not prejudice our client’s claim or settle the 3" party claim
without our client’s prior confirmation.

Regards
Cindy Tan
M/S KANNAN SG

Advocates & solicitors
50 Chin Swee Road



#08-03 Thong Chai Building
Singapore 169874

TEL: (+65) 6429 0253
FAX: (+65) 6223 1660
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IMPORTANT: THIS E-MAIL IS INTENDED ONLY FOR THE USE OF THE ADDRESSEE AND MAY
CONTAIN CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION AND/OR MAY BE COVERED BY PROFESSIONAL
PRIVILEGE. IT MUST NOT BE READ, USED OR DISCLOSED BY ANY PERSON OTHER THAN THE
ADDRESSEE(S) NAMED. IF YOU HAVE RECEIVED THIS E-MAIL IN ERROR, PLEASE NOTIFY US
IMMEDIATELY BY TELEPHONE (COLLECT INTERNATIONAL CALL IF APPROPRIATE) AT (+65)
6429 0252 OR BY E-MAIL AND DELETE THE E-MAIL IMMEDIATELY. THANK YOU.
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