Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 1:55 PM

To: KKLau; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CC3/CTI18018387/K1fa3; Your Ref: T1018/ SH 9329B/

WT(st) - SNM18D04842C02/1

Categories: clear

Dear Mr Lau,
Please proceed with the 4 cent additional payment.
Thank you.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided
for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: William Tan Thoo Seng [mailto:williamtan@cdge.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, January 02, 2019 1:39 PM

To: KKLau <kklau@Ikkauto.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Re: Our Ref: CC3/CT118018387/K1fa3; Your Ref: T1018/ SH 9329B/ WT(st)

Without Prejudice.
Dear Mr Lau

For your information, we had spoken with Poh Kin. He told us that he has a problem with your Principal on
the offer on the LTA search fee at $7.45, instead of the standard $7.49.

Kindly assist to resolve this issue with your Principal. and settle this matter at $4,495.06.

Thank you.

Best Regards



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 24 December 2018 12:35 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBH 7281T (Ol
SNM18D04842C02/1) and SH 9329B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18018387/K1fa3) on
09/10/2018

LKK REF - CC3/CTI118018387/K1fa3
CTI REF — SNM18D04842C02/1 (GBH7281T)

Dear Poh Kin

We refer to your email of 18 December 2018 pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $4,495.02.

We await your payment advice to enable Boon Sen to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.chtaiping.com

ANNIUFRSARY
In Singapore since 1938

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, December 18, 2018 9:04 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBH 7281T (Ol: SNM18D04842C02/1) and SH



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 18 December 2018 9:04 AM

To: ‘Claims Dept of CTI'

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; ‘alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com'’

Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBH 7281T (Ol : CTI -
SNM18D04842/C01) and SH 9329B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18018387/K1fa3) on
09/10/2018

Attachments: LKK Adjustment Report.pdf; LKK Inspection Report.pdf; LKK Resurvey Photo- before

paint.pdf; LKK Survey Photo.pdf; TP LOD_SH 9329B.pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: ~ CC3/CTI118018387/K1fa3
Your Ref: SNM18D04842/C01

Dear Sir/madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING NOS. GBH 7281T (Ol) AND SH 9329B (TP) ALONG JUNCTION OF SIMS
WAY AND SIMS AVENUE ON 09/10/2018

We refer to the above matter.
Liability: Insured collided into the rear of third party vehicle. Liability is down against our insured.

We did clarify with Insured(Mr Houng/Owner) the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any)
would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd" at
$ 4,495.06(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (I/B/I) | $4,423.57 ($4,134.18 +7% gst) S 4,075.07(53,808.48 +7% gst)
2. Loss of Rental S 345.00($115.00 x 3 days) S 287.50($115.00 x 2.5 days)
3. Loss of Income S 150.00 ($50.00 x 3 days) S 125.00 ($50.00 x 2.5 days)
4. LTA search fee 5 7.49 S 7.49
Total | $ 4,926.06 S 4,495.06

**3 days recommendation for repair
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.



COMFORIDELGRO

ERINC
Our Ref T 1018/ SH 9329B /WT(st) ENGINELR%Q{«
Your Ref :
Date ; 19-Oct-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept
59 Loyang Drive 4th Flir
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508969
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079909
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SH 9329B YOUR INSURED GBH7281T
AND OTHER ON 09.10.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicle No : SH 9329B which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving GBH7281T
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER’S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 4,075.07
2 3 days Lossof Rental@ $ 115.00 per day 3 346,00+
3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) $ -
4 LTA Search Fees $ 7.49
5 GIA / Police Report Fees $ -
6 Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees $ -
Sub Total : $ 4,427.56
HIRER'S CLAIM
7 3 days Loss of Income @ $ 80.00 per days 3 240.00
Total Claims : $ 4 667.56
We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -
a) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs : 6 pcs.
b) LTA search slip/s of : GBH7281T
c)  GIA/Police report/s of : SH 9329B
d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
() Traffic Compound ( ) Towing/Medical bill/receipts ( ) Certificate of Insurance
(X ) Photograph/s of Accident Scen ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record ( x) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

William Tan
CDGE Claims Department
Tel: 6214 8737 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : wiliamtan@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.
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COMFORIDELGRO

7 N
ACCREDITED
CERTIFICATION
BODY 2 &

SAC o AT




