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51 UBI AYE 1, 80115 PAYA UKI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAX : (005} 02564315

Your Ref: D18007368MFSH Date: 07 November 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18018378/Aqd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SLC 4786G .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 10/10/2018 at the premises of M/s MG SOLUTION. and have the following to
report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount ;88 14.600.10
Revised Estimate Amount k] 5.500.00 (Lump Sum}
“Check” Items Amount :S% -
Market Value 1 55 -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 53 -
Nett Value h -
Description of Damage: p—
The vehicle sustained damages ——
at the o/s portion. i | I ,-a Frons
e —— )
offsade

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser



MS () FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coRee b 1950001060 G5T Reg Mo H2-0O0LET6-9
B Rallles Quay $21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (B5) 6222 3547

Clalms & Motor Undsrwsiting Dept: 36 Robinsan Rozd #LE-0L Dty House Singapore DEBATT
Tek (5] 6507 3048 Fax: (556507 3649
wiww, mafirstcapital.oom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed

Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

10-10-2018 Our Ref No. D18007368MFSH
26-09-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCT136K Third Party Vehicle. SLC4788G

23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 AAS KAKI BUKIT CENTRE#02-03
MS HONG

67444165/ 0 Fax No. 67444604

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: PENDING OUR DRIVER'S VF TO DETERMINE
LIABILITY

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
N

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop
Cc : TP Sclicitor

Officer Incharge

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD Attention. NIL
A TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 12:08 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc: ‘Lurene Jaw'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007368MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18018378Aqd3.pdf

Dear Lurene,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLC 4786G.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: b250-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 2:37 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Lurene Jaw' <Lurenelaw@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE; SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007368MF5H/1

Dear Lurene,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLC 4786G on 10/10/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: hz56-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 3:04 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Lurene Jaw' <Lurenelaw@ msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007368MFSH/1

Dear SirfMdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: fash-4315
1



ﬂtiau_than (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAUtD)

Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 2:37 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’; assignments

Cc: ‘Lurene Jaw'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007368MFSH/1

Dear Lureneg,
please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLC 4786G on 10/10/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Casc Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: fi256-3561 | email: sigwsci@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 3:04 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Lurene Jaw' <Lurenelaw@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007368MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKE Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: bas56-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims [maiIm-.cwsmrJmn:laims@msfirstcamlal.mm.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 2:56 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; Lurene Jaw <Lurenelaw@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007368MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CW5 within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,



MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing) #02-03 Singapore 415933

o s |
o

Tel: (+65) 6243 |

Fax: (+65) 6243 1376
Reg. Noi 201427944N

TO . FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED DATE . 10/10/2018
ATTENTION : MOTOR CLAIMS DEFT JOB TYPE : T/P CLAIM
ESTIMATE REPORT
VEHICLE DETAILS
VEHICLE NO . SLC4786G . a
}:' 160 Clutim
MODEL . TOYOTA SIENTA 1.5A
CHASSIS NO R
WST 110 /0L ke —
ACCIDENT DETAILS DATE : 26-Sep-18
TIME : 12:00HRS
THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR | CONTACT JACK LI
CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS
UNIT LIST TOTAL LIST
SIN DESCRIPTION QTy ol e )
1|FRONT BUMPER | (A— 1 |8 1420008 142008 T °
2| FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH_~'* 1 |S 55.00 [ § 5500 | —
3|[FRONT BUMPER FOGLAMP HOUSING RH st 5~ | 1 |§  28820$ 288.20 | A’
4{FRONT HEADLAMP RH Ceelied, 1 |3 866.70 | § 866.70 |
5|FRONT HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET RH  AL€ e 1 |s 88.00 | § 88,00 |+ .
slERONT FENDER RH € Retedt I E 410.00 | § 41000 | 7
7] FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING RH e “~—eh 1 |s  19500]s 19500 |~ o
8|FRONT kNUBLE ARM RH pead 1 |s 567.60 | S8TE0 |~
| 3 "N s 9
o|FRONT KNUCLE BEARING RH ¥ & #ﬁ‘ v o I 294.40 | § mm“tul
— .
10|[FRONT WHEEL HUPRH  /o© - 1 |s 40100|S guart?“}S?
11|FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER RH  &et— 1 |'s 480,80 | § 480.80 | -
T N
12|FRONT LOWER ARMRH 2ot 1 |s sessols  _seaw 5%
13|FRONT STABILIZER LINKAGE /vt ¢ 1|5 198.20 | § 198.20 |
14|FRONT TIE ROD END 7 1 |s 11530]$ 11530 |
‘fn\l—f’ ¥
15|FRONT STEERING RACK AND PINION 1 o 1 |s 27410|s 270410 "
18|FRONT DRIVESHAFT LH lJI 1 3 1,468.30 | & 1,468.30 A
17lFRONTDOORRH ¥ 2ated 1 |s 1233903 123300 | =
18|FRONT DOOR HINGERH ~ pag Loner Be X 2 |8 88.70 | § 17746 | §8:7¢
19|ROCKER PANEL RH e o 1 |s 9z000(s a2000 | .
]

5¢0¥ 3
4263 272



=

TOTAL PRICE $  12,546.80
LESS 25% s 3,136.70
SUB TOTAL PRIGE  § 9,410.10
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
SIN DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT SINETT | TOTAL SINETT
1|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS(SET)  Alte $ 18 20.00 | § 20.00
2| FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIPS{SET) Al i |s 20.00 | 3 20.00
3|WHEEL RIM &t 1 |5 1200005 1,200-00 |
4|WHEEL RIM TYRE A ple 1 ]s 550.00 | § 550.00
Popf fnsmlactian - }ﬁ ; 9o TOTAL $  1,790.00
Pt
CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING ( FRONT)
PANEL BEATING, REMOVAL AND >
1|REPLACING PARTS 5120000, vV
7
2|70 SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA s1,20000] o
3| TUFF COAT $25000| -
4|WIRING CHECK $250,00]
o
T -
5[ TRANFER FRONT DOOR MECHANISM s12000] 52
Fa
TO REMOVE AND REFIX FRONT | B
6|UNDERCARRIAGE sesopo| 21V
|
7|WHEEL ALIGNMENT s10006] €0
TOTAL $3,400.00
%10
ESTIMATE REPORT
TOTAL PARTS COST : § 11,200.10 ,4 (_J(\an |
TOTAL LABOUR COST : § 3,400.00 NEJ
TOTAL REPAIR COST : § 14,600.10
SURVEYOR
CONTACT NO : EAX
PART BY PART / LUMP SUM G P :
NO OF DAYS LKK Auto Consultants hence notify ?
the Repairer of the foliowing: x5
» To resurvey bafdrefalier spray painfing ' ﬂ D
s To display damaged panis) ouring resurvey TI@MJ Q:%'
o Parts prices Subject ta can:inakon f e
# Third party Z,_.l v&y 15 on a “Withou! Prejudice” bass bl C: > 5”:'

= No illegal modification|s) 1s aliowed
= Supplernentary itemis) must be resurveyed and
is subject 1o final approval from insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repaires
Sagnature;
Date:

& .f j‘\f-\



TEO HIN TYRES

- 11 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 1
; #01-01 EUNOS TECHNOLINK
SINGAPORE 415939 onCy 1y Aansa
TEL:67455711 '
Werk Order: ROO3187
Company: MG SOLUTION
Licenza: SLC 4786 G
Date 9.10.18 16:61

Factory Japan 2017.0.2 : Toyota : Sienta : P170 Series : NHP170G

Front: Left Front : Right

Actual | Before | Specified Range | | Actual | Befors | Specified Range |

0°53 - 0°65" 0°35° Camber L. - | =0°55" 0°36'
| 4760 | 4°06' 6°36' Caster { 4°61 | 4°05' B°3F |
06T | 0°02 0709 Toe 0°0370°0% |
12°67" =l —— SAl 12°50' } i
13°61° —= included Angle 9°68" | _ |
i | | Tuming Angle Diff. - | |

Front
| Actual | Before | Specified Range |
Cross Camber 3°46 -0°30' 0°30"
Cross Caster -0°01 -0°30" 0°30"
Cross SAl o°o7r
Total Toe 1749 -0°08' 0°17"
Cross Turn Diff. = |
Rear: Left Rear : Right
Actual | Before | Specified Range | Actual | Before | Specified Range
-1°30' B -2°10" -0°40° Camber -1°48' -2°10" -0"40'
0721 -0703' 0*14' Toe | 0702 =0°03" 0*14' |
Rear
Actual | Before | Specified Range |
Cross Camber | 0*16 | -0°45" 045"
Total Toe 0°23 | | -0°06'0°2%
Thrust Angle o110 |
Axle Offset Omm | |

ViAnAligs 14.1 B1482 Internatonal 01702 Hed20



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 1996507188R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

38 ROBINSON ROAD

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref :  CS/FCI18018378/Aqd3n2

Date: 13-11-2018

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 7136K Veh. Inspected SLC 4786G
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. C18007368MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 10M10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTASIENTA c.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. NSP1707021683 Colour WHITE
Cdometer 28712 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
i Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 BRIDGESTONE & mim
R/H Rear Tyre |1B%/60R15 BRIDGESTOMNE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |1B85/60 R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE /S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
b; General Information
Accident Date  28/08/2018 Inspection Date 10M0/2018
Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
(SOUTH WING) #02-03B
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE
SINGAPORE 415833
5a. Remarks
ADAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REFPORT
E)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b, Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days
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Adn BE B
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLC 4786G
. Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | oo e op (9) {st
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER TORN 1,420.00 679.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH NECESSARY 55,00 55,00
1|FRONT BUMPER FOGLAMP HOUSING RH CRACKED 288.20 288 20
1|FRONT HEADLAMP RH CRACKED 866.70 866.70
1|FRONT HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET RH NOT NECESSARY 88.00
1|FRONT FENDER RH DENTED 410.00 410.00
1|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING RH DEFORMED 195.00 195.00
1|FRONT KNUCKLE ARM RH BENT 56760 485.00
1|FRONT KNUCKLE BEARING RH NOT NECESSARY 294 .40 s
1|FRONT WHEEL HUP RH DAMAGED 401.00 355.00
1|FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER RH BENT 489 80 489 80
1|FRONT LOWER ARM RH BENT 563.80 458.00
1|FRONT STABILIZER LINKAGE NOT NECESSARY 198.20 s
1|FRONT TIE ROD END NOT NECESSARY 115.30 -
1|FRONT STEERING RACK AND PINION NOT NECESSARY 2,794.10
1|FRONT DRIVESHAFT LH NOT NECESSARY 1,468.30 -
1|FRONT DOOR RH DENTED 1,233.90 1,233.90
2|FRONT DOOR HINGE RH @$8B 70 LOWER BENT 177.40 88.70
1|ROCKER PANEL RH TO REPAIR SEE 920.00 .
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -3,136.70 -1,401.08
9.410.10 4,203.22
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|SET FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|WHEEL RIM (SN) cuT 1,200.00 800.00
1|WHEEL RIM TYRE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 550.00 :
1|DOOR INSULATION (SN) NECESSARY 300.00 250,00
2,090.00 890.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18018378/Aqd3nd




TEL: 8258 1561 FAX: 6256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Lbi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. Mo: 188607T198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No.2 of 2
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | SR {EJ} “1]
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING REMOVAL AND REPLACING 1,200.00 600.00
zﬁRTS.iNCLUSIUE OF THE REPAIR OF ROCKER PANEL
TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA. 1,200.00 BOO.OO
TUFF COAT NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
WIRING CHECK 26000 30.00
TRANFER FRONT DOOR MECHANISM, 120.00 80.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIX FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE 280.00 22000
WHEEL ALIGNMENT 100.00 80.00
3,400.00 1.810.00

GRAND TOTAL 14,900.10 6,903.22
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18018378/Agd3n2

) ;K ‘g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report Is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
F part. Any third party acting or replying oo this




