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ASSIGNMENT
Fri Date: Vieh No: S‘HFE’}? X__ Yo Ragn: ’2/_{_:( = _’.2'6,(%
—— Type: M.Car | M.Cycle | Bus | Van | Loy [ ﬁ Prime Mover |

[a]¥] 41 PL‘_‘I‘SJ’ TP RES/OD RES | EVA I INV [ MV
To Inspect Vehicle No:

at Workshop mis ms-« Co!b S

of

Inswred:
Palicy Mo,

Clzims Ma.

Sum Insured:

(Client's Record)
Make of Veh:

(Policy Candition)

Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | OIS

repair at the time of inspection.

Va

Bal or Market Value: —{/ B
IDAC Accident Rport:, Consistent? @ Yes or No
GlA | PR Seen: ;s Cansistent? : Yes or No
Est. Repairs: 2 _ days Res.: Yes or No
Lum Sum: 3Val: Yes or No

1y

CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS
Vehicle: 1IN/ QUT
Date:

Truck | Trailer or

e MR Y [l o (T35
Celour " { { AT Insured ] Std [ NI NA
Sp.Reading = TIRadio: Insured | Std | NI | NA
Eng/Na: . - .
oo VFIABC yxAu C 275 H

Gen, Cond: Gépd | Fair | Poor | Burnt
Steering: Ingfgler | Jammed | Leaked | Burnt o
Brake: tn@er [ Jammed [ Leaked | Burnt or

Madi : I SIRim | STD A/Rim or
Tyre Size:  Fi m&,ﬁ (LE;
TR ,.F_,:"

BS/DUN[EXNOVA | GY | FS/LIZA | MIC | OHTSU | FIR | SUMI|

TOYO ! YOKO or -ty

Front Rear

i % 0 RiBal. ; mm

L/Bal. - 5 . mm Ligal, —6— N mm

oA ool oS ~lo &
Survey held at w[s 2} ¢ fun

Des. of Damages : Frt / I /S | NJS | UIC | Rooftop or

_ Person Conlacled:

Date /Time |  Adtion / Instruction

- - — RECEIVED Z © U1 2010 - a
f
DatafTime, File Fass to? : Preli. Report Days Of Repair: 2 A
o - I:i Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: __""_ Survey Fee N '.7_@.1. "-,EQ,
OatelTime, File Return ta? ; Transpariation 50
2 _,q\m_..__w Add Fee:| |[sitelnsp ($ ) §+RS__SI ' B
D.Int&wiew C Prolos 7 | _'~5
Report Format: Cws :|-Tech s (5 ) ™
Lump Sum /1BJ: (S ouSel ) Jweersna 5 ) ¢ . -
TOTAL E:] i\'ts
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51 URLAVE 1, #0528 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL FARK. SINGAPTIRE #8933 FEL : (068 63563561 FAX = (0651 A2564315

Your ref: DI8007223MESH
Owr ref: CS/FCIIR2018354/Gvd3 Date:; 10/10/2018

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

M/s First Capital Insurance Limited

Dear SirMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SHF 579X

We thank you for your instruction on 3/10/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
SM10/201 at the premises of M/s  TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTELTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :5$39,933.69
Revised Estimate Amount :583,095.34
"Check” ltems Amount :58102.12
Markel Value 55

LTA Reimbursement Value 5%

Nett Value :S§

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

KING GUO QIANG (HE SIER DIH2)
M.MATAL AMSAE-A
Auntomotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg ko 19504001060 G487 Bep Mo M2 DO0IGTA-S
6 Raffles Quay #2100 Singapore 048580
Tel: (6516222 2311 Faw (B5) 6222 3547

Claims & Moter Underwniting Cept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 Oty House Singapore 058877
Tel: (B5) 6507 3648 Fax: (65) 6507 3849
il s ficg1capital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type
Appointed

Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

02-10-2018 Our Ref No. D18007223MFSH
29-09-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHD7026P Third Party Vehicle. SHF579X

MNO. 2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63
CANDY KONG

62876668/ 0 Fax No. 62571330

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 684168315
M,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use {based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

TRANS-CAB AUTO
SERVICES PTE LTD
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. MIL

KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated latter, no signature required




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuta)

Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 11:10 AN

To: 'Ng Wai Yin'

Cc ‘Candy Kong'; claims@transcab.com.sg; SUR
Subject: RE: SHF 579X-DOA: 29/9/2018 -- AAD1870-018

Dear Wai Yin,
Noted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 11:04 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Candy Kong' <candy.kong@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SHF 579X-DOA: 29/9/2018 -- AAD1810-018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Veron

We confirmed COR $2,450.00 (before G5T).
Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

+## please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

ﬁ- TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
N Ii No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 567111

— T Main Line: (65) 4287 6666 Fax Line: [65) 6287 7764
ca Website: www franscab.com.sg

aived it by mistake, ple:
ents 1o anyone, |
)




_From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 12 October, 2018 11:19 AM

To: claims@transcab.com.sg; Candy Kong <candy.kong@transcab.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SHF 579X-DOA: 29/9/2018

Dear Candy/Calvin,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Offer Lump Sum $2450/- @ 2 working days.

Kindly check and confirm.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

glk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Auenﬁ 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 4:42 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’

Cc: KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007223MFSH/1, SHF 579X
Attachments: SHF 579X PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHF 579X
Date of survey: 3/10/2018
Number of days : 2 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: B256-43135

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 October 2018 12:22 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: KARENTAN @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007223MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 5 October 2018 12:16 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMSEMSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG; KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007223MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

1



Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

' AVG. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: WWW.AVE.COM
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Company

Owner |1D: 3878K

Vehicle No.: SHF579X

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 10 Oct 2018
Vehicle Make: RENAULT

Vehicle Model: LATITUDE 2.0L DCI AUTO D/AB 4DR
Primary Colour: Red

Manufacturing Year: 2014

Engine No.: M9R8839C001563
Chassis No.: VF1ABL15AUC278418
Maximum Power Qutput: 127.0 kW (170 bhp)
Open Market Value: $19,998.00
Original Registration Date: 20 Jun 2014

First Registration Date: 20 Jun 2014
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $12,498.00

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 19 Jun 2022

PARF Rebate Amount: $9,373.00

COE Expiry Date: 19 Jun 2022

COE Category: A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 8

PQP Paid: $57,338.00

COE Rebate Amount: $26,459.00

Total Rebate Amount: $35,832.00

Please note that the 8-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle
must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan
(if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Oct 2018

OK

nttps: el ita. gov. sgitaivriacionienguire Hebate Sy Hu plicHetareliereginput LN | IUN_IUSHUIUaUUE T 11



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry
> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Yehicle Owner Particulars
Ohwner 10 Type:

Cwner 1D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Vehicle Madel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Mo

Maxirmum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibality:

PARE Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Categary:

COE Period(Years):

PCP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Page 1 of 1

Company
3878K

SHFS7%X

Yes

010ct 2018

REMAULT

LATITUDE 2.0L DCI AUTO D/AB 4DR
Fed

2014
MORBEIGCO01563
YF1ABL15AUCZ27B418
127.0 kW (170 bhpl
$19 998.00

20 Jun 2014

20 Jun 2014

o

£12.498.00

Yes
19 Jun 2022
$9.373.00

19 Jun 2022

A - Car upto 1500cc & 97kW [130bhp)
8

$57.338.00

$26,638.00

$36,011.00

Please note that the B-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle

reaches its statutory lifespan [if applicable). whichever is earlier.
The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Oct 2018

httns://vel Ita.cov.se/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDereglnput ?FUNCTION _ID=F03040...

01/10/2018



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1810-018

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel Mo. ; 62B7 6666 Fax No.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHF 579X
Vehicle No.: SHF 579X~
Chassis No: VF1ABL15AUC278418
Vehicle Make: RENAULT
Vehicle Model: LATITUDE
Date of Accident : 29.9.2018
Third Party Insurer : FCIL
PART LIST
1 BUMPER COVER REAR .~ &£ 3 1,108.46
> 1BUMPER LOWERREAR .~ (A 3 768.84
3 1 BUMPER BRACKET CTRREAR 'K /U/V $ 11347
4 1 BUMEPR BRACKET SIDE RH REAR X $ 135.97
5 1 BUMEPR RETAINER RH REAR X $ 4499
6 1 BUMPERREFLECTORRH X A 5 4361
7 1 BUMEPR BRACKET SIDE LH REAR 7~ g 135.97
8 1 BUMPER RETAINER LH REAR XK $ 4499
9 1 BUMPER REFLECTORLH X T $ 4361
0 1eumpereeamrear x ~ P L 6 77752
11 1 BUMPER BEAM BRACKET LH REAR X $ 225.95
12 1 BUMPER BEAM BRACKET RH REAR A $ 225.95
13 1 OUTER PANEL REAR (End Panel) X $ 1,471.77
14 1 OUTER PANEL REAR (End Panel)TRIM Wi $ 404.56
15 1 TAILLAMPRH X $ 552.55
16 1 TAILLAMP PANEL RH X S 986.70
17 1TALLAMPLH X $ 552.55
18 1 TAILLAMP PANEL LH K $ 986.70
19  1BOOTREAR X $ 2,872.68
20 1 BOOT FINISHER $ 470.06
21 1 BOOT WHEATERSTRIP X $ 323.05
22 1 BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP LH $ 493.35
23 1 BOOT REFLECTOR LAMPRH A $ 49335
24 1 BOOT BADGE 'RENAULT' K $ 225.36
25  1BOOTBADGE ¥ $ 225.36
26 1 BOOT STRUT LH $ 276.08
27 1 BOOT STRUT RH $ 276.08
28 1BOOTHINGELH Y $ 367.84
29 1 BOOT HINGE RH * / $ 367.84



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1810-018
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel Mo. : 6287 6666 Fax Mo. : 6257 1330
CO./G5T Req. No. 200101 962606
SHF 579X
30 1 BOOTINNER TRIM X $ 586.45
BOO T 168.13
31 1 BOOT SWITCH X AN $
32 1 BOOT LOCK 3% g 202.67
33 1 BOOT LOCK CATCH X $ 74.40
$ 16,046.87
10% $ 7.44
$ 16,039.43
Specical Nett o
1 1SET PARKINGAD ~~ P $ 700,00 22€
> 1SET REAR BUMPER CLIP .~ A& $ 66.00
3 1SET BUMPER BRACKET CTRcLIP X $ 33.00
4 1SET BUMPER BRACKET SIDE CLIP RH RR /( 3 10.00
5 1SET BUMEPR RETAINER RH CLIPRR X $ 20.00
6 1SET BUMEPR BRACKET SIDE CLIP LHRR < N 10.00
7 1SET BUMEPR RETAINER CLIPLHRR X $ 20.00
8 1SET BUMPER LOWER REAR RIVET $ 22.00
9 1SET BUMPER LOWER REAR CLIP 3 66.00
10 1 EXHAUST MOUNTING REAR X $ 17.82
11 2 REAR WINDSCREEN SELANT Y $ 80.00
12 1 WINDSCREEN MOULDING X $ 100.00
13 1 REAR WINDSCREEN INNER SPONGE SEALX $ 100.00
TOTAL $ 1,244.82
TOTAL PARTS $ 17,284.25
—————————————— ————}
LABOUR
Putty And Spray Painting Of The Affected Portion. $ 3,000.00 2&e

Panel Beating, Knocking And Straightening The

Necessary Portion, Remove And Renewal Of Parts,

Adjust And Realign The Same

$ 2,200.00 Qoo



L}

Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1810-018
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111

Tel No. : 6287 6666 Fax No.: 6257 1330

CO./GST Reg. No. 2010196266

SHF 579X

To Rust-Proofing Of The Affected Areas. $ 17000 X AL

To reinstall rear bumper parking sensor. $ 170.00 (éd

To transfer of bootlid fittings, attachments and

perform water seepage test. $ 170.00 X
To repair and realign rear exhaust pipe. $ 170.00 A
To drop rear exhaust box, renew the same, to repair

and realign centre exhaust pipe. $ 170.00 X
To transfer of rear end panel fittings, attachment and

perform water seepage test. 1 170.00 a(
To transfer of rear windscreen fittings and conduct

water seepage test. $ 170.00 -’Y

To check steering geometry and computer wheel
alignment $ 220.00 X

AN S TOTAL § 6,610.00
WO"’F L [ "“(\5 Over All Total $ 39,033-69
. AN T e
U""fw— Efm M (LUMP SUM) I
A(}'&E\' \rtp-‘\f "Jl\/\uj _ Rﬁpélr_my! .-10 Dfﬁ




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: B258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 19060T198R GST Reg. No. 1%-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI1801B354/Gvd3n2
31801 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 S il I“IW"M'W”H'IN
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 7026P Veh. Inspected SHF 575X
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18007223MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 05102018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model REMAULT LATITUDE c.c 1985
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. VF1ABL15AUC278418 Colour RED
Odometer = Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI & rmm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60R16 GITI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/80 R16 GITI & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/09/2018 Inspection Date 05/10/2018
Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
NO.2 ANG MO KIO ST 63
SINGAPORE 569111
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

2 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6266 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Req. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No, 19-8607198-R Page No:1of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, SHF 579X
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|BUMPER COVER REAR DEFORMED 1,108 46 1,108 46
1|BUMPER LOWER REAR cuT 768 B4 TEE.84
1|BUMPER BRACKET CTR REAR NOT NECESSARY 113.47
1|BUMPER BRACKET SIDE RH REAR MOT NECESSARY 135.87 -
1|BUMPER RETAINER RH REAR NOT NECESSARY 44 899 -
1|BUMPER REFLECTOR RH NOT NECESSARY 4381
1|BUMPER BRACKET SIDE LH REAR NOT NECESSARY 13597 -
1|BUMPER RETAINER LH REAR NOT NECESSARY 4499 -
1|BUMPER REFLECTOR LH MOT NECESSARY 43.61 1
1|BUMPER BEAM REAR BENT 77752 777.52
1|BUMPER BEAM BRACKET LH REAR NOT NECESSARY 22595 -
1|BUMPER BEAM BRACKET RH REAR NOT NECESSARY 22595 -
1|OUTER PANEL REAR (END PANEL) NOT NECESSARY 147177 -
1|OUTER PANEL REAR (END PANEL) TRIM MOT NECESSARY 404,56 s
1|TAILLAMP RH NOT NECESSARY 552.55 -
1| TAILLAMP PANEL RH NOT NECESSARY 886.70 -
1| TAILLAMP LH NOT NECESSARY §52.55 -
1|TAILLAMP PANEL LH NOT NECESSARY 886,70 -
1|BOOT REAR NOT NECESSARY 2,872.68
1|BOOT FINISHER NOT NECESSARY 470.06
1|BOOT WEATHERSTRIP NOT NECESSARY 323.05 -
1|BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP LH NOT NECESSARY 493 35 -
1|BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP RH NOT NECESSARY 493.35 -
1|BOOT BADGE "RENAULT" NOT NECESSARY 225.36 #
1{BOOT BADGE NOT NECESSARY 22536 -
1|800T STRUT LH NOT NECESSARY 276.08 =
1|BOOT STRUT RH NOT NECESSARY 276.08 -
1|BOOT HINGE LH NOT NECESSARY 367 84 -
1|BOOT HINGE RH NOT MECESSARY 367 .84 -
1|(BOOT INMER TRIM NOT NECESSARY 586.45 -
1|BOOT SWITCH MOT NECESSARY 168.13 -

Report Ref No, CS/FCI18018354/Gvd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 62568 3561 FAX; 6256 4315

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18018354/Gvd3n2

Reg. Mo: 199507198R GST Reg. No. 10-9807198-R Page Mo, 2of 3
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§)) $)
1|BOOT LOCK NOT NECESSARY 202 67 -
1|BOOT LOCK CATCH NOT NECESSARY 74.40 2
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -1,604.69 -265.48
14,44217 2,388 34
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET PARKING AID (SN) DAMAGED 700.00 200.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN} MNECESSARY 66.00 G6.00
1|SET BUMPER BRACKET CTR CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 33.00 -
1|SET BUMPER BRACKET SIDE CLIP RH RR (SN} NOT NECESSARY 10.00 -
1|SET BUMPER RETAINER RH CLIP RR (SN} NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|SET BUMPER BRACKET SIDE CLIP LH RR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 10.00 -
1|SET BUMPER RETAINER CLIP LH RR (SN} NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|SET BUMPER LOWER REAR RIVET {SN) NOT NECESSARY 22.00
1|SET BUMPER LOWER REAR CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 66.00 “
1|EXHAUST MOUNTING REAR (SN) NOT MNECESSARY 17.82 -
2|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT {SN) NOT NECESSARY B0.00 -
1|WINDSCREEN MOULDING (SN} NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN INNER SPONGE SEAL (SN) NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
1,244 82 266.00
LABOUR
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 3,000.00 200.00
PORTION
PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE 2,200.00 200.00
NECESSARY PORTION, REMCVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.
TO RUST-PROCOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS. NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
TCO REINSTALL REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSOR, 170.00 40.00
TO TRANSFER OF BOOTLID FITTINGS ATTACHMENTS NOT NECESSARY 170.00
AND PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO REPAIR AND REALIGN REAR EXHAUST PIPE. MOT NECESSARY 170.00 =
TO DROP REAR EXHAUST BOX RENEW THE SAME, TO NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
REPAIR AND REALIGN CENTRE EXHAUST PIPE.
TO TRANSFER OF REAR END PANEL NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
ay i Workshop ($)) ($)
TO TRANSFER OF REAR WINDSCREEN FITTINGS AND  |[NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
CONDUCT WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER NOT NECESSARY 220.00 -
WHEEL ALIGNMENT
6,610.00 440.00
GRAND TOTAL 22,296.99 3,095.34
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,450.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/FC118018354/Gvd3n2
XING GUD QILANG ADRIAN LING WAI PING

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made salaly for the use and benedl of tha Client named on e front page of this Reporl.
Mo llability of responsioility whatsoever, in contact o i

raply on the Repor wholly o

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A.M.

MATAI

npart. Any third pany scting of fepiving on this




