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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 October 2018 5:48 PM

To: 'Tan, Rachel'; SUR

Subject: RE: Market value request - SGQ2212U (CLMOMVP000000862)

Dear Rachel, 

 

The MV of SGQ 2212U is $69K-$70K(est) as at Sep’18. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 1:29 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; claims@ajaxinspection.com; edna.lee@a-pac.sg; rta@rta.com.sg; 

sharon.kho@priorityservices.sg 

Subject: Market value request - SGQ2212U (CLMOMVP000000862) 

 

Dear Sirs 

 

Please assist to provide the market value for the above mentioned vehicle. 

 

Date of accident: 25/09/2018. LTA rebate details attached.  

 

Thank you in advance 

 

 

Regards 

Rachel Tan 

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company 

Tel: 6804 7846  
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