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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 11:54 AM

To: LKK Valuation; OH Vale

Cc: sam.chan@axa.com.sg; HO Vincent; KKlLau
Subject: [AXA]: Assistance required: To effect MV for SQ96)
Attachments: attachment 1.pdf

Hi Valuation Team, q (?/ I OO

Please get back to AXA Vale.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Olivia Lau | Admin Manager

LKK Auto Consultanis 9,()‘0((\
phone: 6256-3541 | email: oliviclgu@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: CHAN Sam [mailto:sam.chan@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Sunday, 16 September, 2018 6:09 PM

To: motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>; KKLau <kklau@Ikkauto.com>; Jimmy Lee
Priority Svc <jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg>; frankie@fta.com.sg; Autoprobe - Mr Tay <bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg>;
AutoProbe Admin -surveyor <admin@autoprobe.com.sg>; ricky@rta.com.sg; patrick.soo@a-pac.sg; Olivia Lau
(LKKAuto) <olivialau@Ikkauto.com>; nick@Ibs-auto.com; elson@rta.com.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg;
collin.wong@a-pac.sg; benson@Ibs-auto.com

Cc: OH Vale <vale.oh@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Assistance required: To effect MV for SQ96)

Dear Partners,

Please assist to provide Ms Vale Oh with the Market Value for this case.
DOA: 05/08/2018 4"'

Thanks in advance for your help.

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If
you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this
message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC

Owner D 0139

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No: sQ96)

Wehicle to be Exported: No

Intended De-registration Date: 07 Aug 2018

Vehicla Make: BM.W,

Vehicle Model: BMW I3REX LED NAV
Primary Colour: Silver

Secondary Colour: "Blue

Manufacturing Year: 2014

Engine No. 2714012061W20K06A
Chassis No.: WBY1242070V247631
Maximum Powrer Output: 125.0 kW {167 bhp)
Open Market Value: $45,578.00

Criginal Registration Data: 29 Jul 2015

First Registration Date: 29 Jul 2015

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $25,810.00 { ’L (i
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 28 Jul 2025

PARF Rebate Amount: $19,357.00

intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 28 Jul 2025

COE Category: B - Car above 1400¢cc or $7kW {130bhp)
COFE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: £58,109.00 (. yrd. [~ .
COE Rebate Amount: $40,520.00

Total Rebate Amount: $59,877.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Aug 2018

hitps:/viLlta,gov.sg/lta/vil/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNC LION_ID=rusu4u...  uriv 0/201



