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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 September 2018 9:27 AM

To: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); LKK Valuation

Cc: CHAN Sam; HO Vincent; KKLau; OH Vale

Subject: RE: [AXA]: Assistance required: To effect MV for SLS9756B
Hi Olivia,

The correct handler is AXA Kitty. Please let us have your market value.

Best Regards

Kitty Teo | Specialist, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Email:kitty.teo@axa.com.sg
/g,7o

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 Press 3

4 A

: redefining /insurance

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 19 September, 2018 9:10 AM

To: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; OH Vale <vale.oh@axa.com.sg>

Cc: CHAN Sam <sam.chan@axa.com.sg>; TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>; HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>;
KKLau <kklau@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [AXA]: Assistance required: To effect MV for SLS97568

Hi Valuation Team,
Kindly get back to AXA Vale.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Qlivia Lau | Admin Manager

LKK Aute Consultants a,ogtr‘
.,‘,-f“‘-l

prone: 6256-3561 | email: giivialcu@lkkauto.com | fox: 6741-4108 /D‘/)e’ 0(

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933) "”.\{1—‘\




;ack to OneMotoring

nquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Business
Owner 1D: 2500K
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SLS9756B
~ Vehicle to be Expoﬂéd: No :
Intended Deregistration Date: 18 Sep 2018
Vehicle Make: MAZDA :
Vehicle Model: MAZDA3 SEDAN 1.5 AT LED EUS
Primary Colour: G'rey
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine No.: P520471450
Chassis No.: JMBBN22A8J0181524
Maximum Pawer Output: 88.0 kW (118 bhp)
Open Market Value: ' $19,1'?4.00
Original Registration Date: o Oé{ 2017
First Registration Date: 12 Oct 2017
Transfer Count: ' 0
Actual ARF Paid: $14,174.00 7 g ‘367
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes ;
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 11 Oct 2027
PARF Rebate Amount: ' $10,630.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 11 Oct 2027
COE Category: A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): ; - 10 ' -
QP Paid: ' $42,902.00
COE Rehate Amount: $38,881.00
Total Rebate Amount: : $49,511.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Sep 2018
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