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l’!l‘! Auto

! -— = Consultanis

Edm Bm B Pte Lid Company Registration Mo, 198607198R
S1UBLAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 208933 TEL : (651 62563561 FAX @ (065) 62364315
Your Ref: D18007336MFSH Date: 11 October 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCLIB018290/R 1sd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SLK 16057 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 10/10/2018 at the premises of M/s Car Life Auto Engineering Services and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 8§ 5,154.02
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 3.894.20
“Check” Items Amount 1 5% 200.00
Market Value 53
LTA Reimbursement Value + 55
Nell Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 5 Days

Yours faithfully,
Mohammed Rasul
Automotive Assessor



MS@FirstCapital

M35 First Capital Insurance Limited coeeeno <o [t
B Raffies Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Ter {65) 6222 2311 Fax [65) 6222 1547

Clabims & Motwr Undeawiting Dept: 35 Robdnsan Road R1EDL Ly Hovse 5 oEary
Tek [B5] BR0T 348 Fax: [65) 6507 3840
wvw. msfirstcapital.rom.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
08-10-2018 Qur Ref No. D1BO07336MFSH
0D6-10-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHA2819C Third Party Vehicle. SLK16052

BLK 1002 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 # 01-75
MA,

62733810/ 0 Fax No. 62787522

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

CAR LIFE AUTO
ENGINEERING Attention. NIL
SERVICES
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Carlife <autolife_sin@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 3:22 PM
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SLK 1605Z DOA 06/10/2018

Hi Ms. Shirley Hiew

Thank you for recommendation, we are agreeable to figure shall proceed to send LOD to First Capt.

Regards
Tan

On Tuesday, 26 February 2019, 9:41:28 am GMT+8, Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com:= wrote:

Dear Mr.Tan,

Please confirm final fig $ 3,894.01 @ 5 days of repairs.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)



ShirIeE Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auta) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 3:17 PM

To: '‘CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Carene Ler SUR: Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007336MFSHN
Attachments: SLK 1605Z - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Serene,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLK 1605Z.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: Sur@lkkauto.corm | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 5:31 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007336MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed repairer agreed survey on 10/10/2018.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Erom: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 5:18 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007336M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
www.avg.com




CAR LIFE AUTO ENGINEERING SERVICES

c/o: workshop address: BLK 1002 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-75 SINGAPORE 159719
E-mail : autolife_sin@yahoo. com.sg
Tel: 6273 3810 Fax: 6278 7522

Date :  08-Oct-18
Address : PERIATHAMBI SENTHILMURUGAN Reference : TP 1174110118
BLK 2 HOLLAND AVENUE Vehicle No : SLK 16052
#09-90 Make/Model : TOYOTA WISH
SINGAPORE 271002 Insurance Co. : CHINA TAIPING
RE : ATION FOR REPAIRS TO 1605Z FOR P LAIMS.
PARTS REQUIRED Qry AMT §
1) REAR BUMPER 1 $ 1,355.80 V£~
2) REAR BUMPER RETAINER 1 $ 69.30 Ao~
3) REAR BUMPER BRACKET 1 $ 52 65A8
4) TAILGATE 1 $ 144714 —
5) TOYOTA LOGO 1 $ 64.70AL
6) "WISH" ENBLEM 1 $ 6240/
7) TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIPE 1 $ 286.70A8 —
LIST PRICE TOTAL $ 3,338.69
LESS DISCOUNT 25% $ 834.67
LIST PRICE TOTAL AFTER LESS $ 2,504.02
7 o
8) REVERSE SENSOR $ Oo 20V
9) WINDSCREEN SEALANT 1 $ 50.00 Age
NETT PRICE TOTAL $280.00
TOTAL PARTS COST | $2,784.02]
LABOUR AND MISCELLANEQUS CHARGES
1) TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR BUMPER, TAIL GATEAND  § 1,;ooﬁ;:-
TO PANEL BEAT & ALIGN END PANEL AND OTHER (6 DAYS)
AFFECTED AREAS.
2) TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER TAILGATE $ gooﬁ 6w
(INNER & OUTER) AND OTHER AFFECTED AREA. ( 4 PANEL)
3) TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS $ 39006 (3o

AND CHECK FOR WATER TIGHT.

4) TUFF KOTE $ 3;3{9- 6 o

5) TO REMOVE AND REWIRE NEW REVERSE SENSOR. $ }aeﬂa o

| A
'y \ \\\Q\ \ 1’_5 3



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapcore 408833
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No; 199607188R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

CS/FCI18018290/R1sd3n2
owe: orszos | [
Code: FCI2

.
)

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SHA 2619C Veh. Inspected SLK 1605Z
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18007236MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SERENE Assign Date 08/ 0/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWISH 1.8X c.c 1767
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. ZGE206029436 Colour GOLD
Odometer 13673 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/85 R15 YOKOHAMA, & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/55 R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  08M10/2018 Inspection Date 10/10/2018
Survey held at CAR LIFE AUTO ENGINEERING SERVICES
BLK 1002 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 # 01-75 SINGAPORE 159718
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLK 1605Z

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-860T198-R

Page No.:1of 1

- Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 1,355.80 1,355.80
1|REAR BUMPER RETAINER NECESSARY 69.30 69.30
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET NECESSARY 52 65 5265
1| TAILGATE BENT 1,447.14 1,447 14
1|TOYOTA LOGOD NECESSARY 84.70 64,70
1|"WISH" EMBLEM NECESSARY 62.40 G2.40
1| TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIPE NECESSARY 286.70 286.70
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -834.68 -834.68
2,504.01 2,504.01
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SEMNSOR (SN) SERVICEABLE 230.00 -
1|WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50,00 50.00
280.00 50.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR BUMPER, TAIL GATE AND 1,200.00 500.00
TO PANEL BEAT & ALIGN END PANEL AND OTHER
AFFECTED AREAS.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER, TAILGATE 800.00 600.00
(INNER & OUTER) AND OTHER AFFECTED AREA.
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS AND 300.00 120.00
CHECK FOR WATER TIGHT.
TUFF KOTE. 350.00 £0.00
TO REMOVE AND REWIRE NEW REVERSE SENSOR. 180.00 60.00
2,830.00 1,340.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,614.01 3,894.01
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 3,894.01

M

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18018290/R15d3n2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

DMSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sclaly for the use and benafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
Mo Eability of respansibliity whatsoever, in contact or tor, ks actepted to s R :

Ihird Sarty Wi m

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser
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