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Company Roglstration Mo, 190607 108R

51 UBLAVE [, #02-25 PAYA URT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 6253361 FAX i68) 62364315

Your ref: YN 6264X/SL/pl

Our ref: CS/EGI18018256/Avd3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s: ERGO INSURANCE FTE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

DATE: 25/2/2019

Without Prejudice

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SLU 2519E

We thank you for your instruction on 9/10/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned

vehicle on 9/10/2018 at the premises of

M/s MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check" Ttems Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle susiained damages at the
n/s body

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOEAMIRTE,AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

: §87,341.20

: 552,600.00 (LUMP SUM)

: 5%

1 5%

1 5%

1 5%
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto) ‘

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 5:56 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)’

Cc; SUR

Subject: RE: YMNG264X / TP : SLU2519E/LKK / DOA ; 05/10/2018
Attachments: SLU 2519E PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLU 2519E
Date of survey: 9/10/2018
Number of days : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 9:25 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YN6264X / TP : SLU2519E/LKK / DOA : 05/10/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLU 2519E on 9/10/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D {LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 10:47 AM
To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments

1



cassiénmentﬂ@Ikkaum_cum:a »
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>=
Subject: RE: YN6264X / TP : SLU2519E/LKK / DOA : 05/10/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5(408033)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey Report@ergo.com.sgl
Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 9:16 AM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM' <ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM>

Subject: Ol : YNB264X fTR: SLUZ519E/LKK / DOA : 05/10/2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey, both
TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be the “Single
Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

ADDRESS : 23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 (SOUTH WING)
#02-03B VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE
SINGAPORE 415933

PERSON TO CONTACT : MSHONG®@ 6243 1373

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM
Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain
estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle

is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey. Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee Pei L
Claims Azsistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.



£ Temasek Boulevard. #04-01 Sumec Tower Five
Singapore 030285

DID.; +65 58258194

Tel © +65 6829 9195

Fax : +B65 6829 9247

ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Eurcpe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in mara than 30 countries and congentra
Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of lhe world's leading nsk carmers

WA, 8100 COM 50
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 9:25 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: YN6264X / TP : SLU2519E/LKK / DOA : 05/10/2018
Dear Pei Li,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLU 2519E on 9/10/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 10:47 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YN6264X / TP : SLU2519E/LKK / DOA : 05/10/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 9:16 AM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM' <ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM>

Subject: OI : YN6264X / TP : SLU2519E/LKK / DOA : 05/10/2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”,



Please assist to conduct this survey from MG SOLUTION PTE LTD,

ADDRESS © 23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 (SOUTH WING)
#02-03B VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE
SINGAPORE 415933

PERSON TO CONTACT . MS HONG@ 6243 1373

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE ~ : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain
estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before
vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards,
Yee Pei L
Claims Assistant {Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

& Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 0389835

DID.: +65 6A29 5104

Tel = +65 6R2S G148

Fax  +G5 6B20 9247

ERGO

ERGC is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Eurepe Warldwide, ERGO iz representad in mare than 30 countries and concentrales
an Europe and Asla ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the warld's leading risk carriers
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Yee Pei Li ———————— - -

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Sent: Tuesday, October 09, 2018 9:16 AM

To: ‘admin-dElkkauto.com’

Ce: ‘ASSIGMMENTSE LKKAUTO.COM'

Subject: O : YNG264% / TP SLU2519E/LKK / DOA 05/10/2018

Attachments: YN6264X - SASpdf; SLU2519E - SAS.pdf, SLUZ519E - PRS FORM.pdf 51 U2519E -( PRE

[SNPECTION) | YOUR RF - YNG264X -DOA ON 05/10/208

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair
Survey, both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

_—_——-—ll

ADDRESS . 23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 (SOUTH WING)
#02-03B VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE
SINGAPORE 415933

PERSOMN TO CONTACT ¢ MS HONG @ 6243 1373

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVELIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle. Obtain estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct

a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep
us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of
the survey status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg,

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was
provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.



Date: 09,10.2018 Seqt via Fan -
Cur Reterence YN 6264%/5L/pl -
¥our Relemence SLU 251SE

Email

mg3solution@gmall.com
To! MG SOLUTION PTELTD J

Pre-Repal ay [PRS) Ack ladgemeant

Yehicle For Inspectian: SLU 2519E
Insurad s Vehicle: ¥ 6264K
Date Of Accident: 05.10.2018
We acknowhedge receipt of your request for PR3 on: 08.10.2018
In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from
the list below and Indicate your selection in the box marked *. * LKK
AlS Automaobile Inspaction Services Ple Ltd LBS LB.5 Auto Consultants Pte Lid
FTa FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd LKE LKK futo Comsultants Pte Lid
145 Infiniti Appraisal Service 3 Priority Services
IPE 1P Enights Pte Ltd VAl Vicom Lid

v Your request for inspection does not have your client’s cost of repair estimate, kindby forward a copy

Your request for inspection does not have your client’s Gl re port, kind by forsand 3 copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon wpon receipt of estimate

Cur Insured’s driver has not reparted the accident 10 us todate

vV lothers  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM

Prepared by: & ,"} Pei i 6829 9194 claim o, COMMLS
Slgnature: FAX : 6829 9247
Assessor use only: Workshop use only:

Asses w on:
Assignment Date; Date:
Assignment Time: Time

Inspecion
Remarks: D Vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Workshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Note: Our inspection is on o without admission to Hability bosis.




MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing) #02-03B

Vicom Inspection Centre, Singapore 415933
Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376
Reg. No: 201427944N

TO
ATTENTION
ESTIMATE REPORT

VEHICLE DETAILS

: ERGO DATE

: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

Vecon

: 08/10/2018

JOB TYPE : T/P CLAIM

VEHICLE NO . SLU2519E
MODEL . HONDA CIVIC 1.6L A
r -t G ;] 1 fd-f)
f 4 ) (8
CHASSIS NO me
ACCIDENT DETAILS DATE : 5-Oct-18
TIME : 13.20HRS
THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR | CONTACT JACK LI
CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS
UNITLIST | TOTALLIST
SIN DESCRIPTION ar| “eeice eyl
L _2¢y -
1|FRONT DOOR ks 1 |s 1280308 128030 44
=1 _¥9¢
o|rear poor At 1 |s 128030|s  fespas|” O
3|REAR DOOR HINGE 3et 2 |3 88.60 | $ 17720 |~
4|REAR DOOR CHECKER Brplcea 1 |s 1ess0|s (C19850] §—
-
5|REAR DOOR LOCK ~ “2nryd. 1 |s 260408 260.40 |~
6|REAR DOOR CATCH  Frrpletn At on 1 |8 8020 | 8 80.20 | A
7|REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP /¢ 1+ |s 100508 190.50 | *
8|REAR DOOR INNER BOARD A 1 |s 5889053 s88.00 |
, ] il
olrerroooroutersTRP M= Bt | 4 |5 1s030]s 180.30 | %
10|REAR DOOR OUTER HANDLE 74~ & ° 1 |s 19140/ 191.40 |7
11|REAR DOOR OUTER HANDLE END_7e¢- 1 |s  103sols  (lozed) =%
12| REAR DOOR POWER WINDORMOTOR & #4¢ | 1 | § 420008 “420.00 |
o
13|REAR DOOR POWER WINDOR REGULATION' 1 |$  35000]% 350.00 |*
TOTAL PRICE § 530150
LESS 20% $ 106030
SUBTOTALPRICE §  4,241.20
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS AR22. (O

IR T
rjaJ'r.]':ﬂ £0

3

AT



SIN DESCRIPTION QTy | UNIT SINETT | TOTAL SINETT
1|FRONT DOOR INNER BOARDS(SET) Alee 1 |8 20.00 | § 20.00
- TOTAL 5 20.00
CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING (REAR)
PANEL BEATING, REMOVAL AND T
1|REPLACING PARTS $ 120000 4
4
2|TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA s 120000 | 4 500
=
3|TUFF COAT $ 250.00
A
4|WIRING CHECK s 180.00
REMOVE AND FRONT AND REAR DOOR
5|MECHANISM $ 250,06 | /6O
i
TOTAL $3,080.00 Eohde.
A d’l Cam,
ESTIMATE REPORT
TOTAL PARTS COST  : § 4.261.20 Pl
TOTAL LABOUR COST : § 3,080.00
0% Gy
TOTAL REPAIRCOST : § 7.341.20 7
APPROVED DETAILS
SURVEYOR 3’{“1 33264
CONTACT NO / -
b L[S 26k
PART BY PART / LUMP SUM J
NO OF DAYS
LKK Aulo Consullants hence notify
the F%era ar ,. the following:
pfore after spray painting
5} Eurvay
. ‘ P . udice” basis
® Mo i I|r nal modification(s) 15 allow

& Supplementary nemis) mas? be resurveyed and
i subject to fin u| approval fram Insur anchﬁmuun,’

Acknowiedged by Repaires
Signature:
Dt




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: B256 3561 FAM: G256 4315
Reg. Mo. 199607188R GST Reg. Mo 19-9807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref © CS/EGI1B018256/Avd3n2

[

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 26-02-2018
SINGAPORE 038285
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YN B254X Veh, Inspected SLU 2518E
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. YNG264X/SLpl Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From  YEE PEILI Assign Date 09/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDACIVIC c.c 1687
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. MRHFC5650HTOD0640 Colour GREY
Odometer 7165 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/50 R18 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/50 R16 HANKOOK & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/50R16 HANKODOK & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/50 R16 HANKOOK, & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  05/10/2018 Inspection Date 08/10/2018
Survey held at MG SOLUTION FTE LTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
(SOUTH WING) #02-03B
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE,
SINGAPORE 415833
5a. Remarks
ATHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, SLU 2513E

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapare 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-9807198-R

Page Mo.:1 of 2

e Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | 8 mmp%‘}} ESJ}
REPLACEMENT QF PARTS
1|FRONT DOOR DENTED 1,280.30 B5B.00
1|REAR DOOR DENTED 1.280.30 BG5.00
Z2|REAR DOOR HINGE @388.60 BENT 177.20 177.20
1|REAR DOOR CHECKER BROKEN 198.50 59.00
1|REAR DOOR LOCK DAMAGED 260.40 26040
1|REAR DOOR CATCH MOT NECESSARY 80,20 -
1|REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP MOT NECESSARY 180.50
1|REAR DOOR INNER BOARD WOT NECESSARY 588.80 -
1|REAR DOOR QUTER STRIP DEFORMED 180.30 1B80.30
1|REAR DOOR OUTER HANDLE DAMAGED 191.40 191.40
1|REAR DOOR OUTER HANDLE END DAMAGED 103.50 3500
1|REAR DOOR POWER WINDOW MOTOR MOT NECESSARY 420,00 -
1|REAR DOOR POWER WINDOW REGULATION NOT NECESSARY 350.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,060.30 -531.26
4 241 20 2125.04
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT DOOR INMER BOARDS (SN) MECESSARY 20.00 20.00
20.00 20.00
LABOUR
PAMEL BEATING REMOWVAL AMD REPLACING PARTS. 1,200.00 400.00
TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA. 1,200.00 500,00
TUFF COAT MOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
WIRING CHECK. 180.00 30.00
REMOVE AMD FRONT AND REAR DOOR MECHANISM, 250.00 160.00
3,080.00 1,080.00
GRAND TOTAL 7.341.20 3,235.04

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18018256/Avd3n2
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Page No..2 of 2
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,600.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No, CS/EGI18018256/Avd3n2

% 2‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE.AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is nade solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the frant pags of this Report.




