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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January 2019 3:13 PM

To: 'Motorsurvey'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for  SDD 5288K - DOA: 06/10/2018     Our Ref: SDD 

5288K/BT

Attachments: LKKAdjustment1a_1.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; LKKInvoice1.pdf; photo.pdf

Dear Kah Leong. 
 
Please be informed that our survey report already submitted to you on 7/1/2019 
 
In case you still do not received we now forward a soft copy to you.   
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Tan, KahLeong <KahLeong.Tan@awac.com> On Behalf Of Motorsurvey 

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January 2019 3:06 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for SDD 5288K - DOA: 06/10/2018 Our Ref: SDD 5288K/BT 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

We refer to the above OD assignment. 

 

Please advise if the survey report is ready for submission as we received the OD repair bill. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards 

Tan Kah Leong 

Claims Group 

Global Markets 

 

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd 

60 Anson Road #08-01 MapleTree Anson Singapore 079914 

T: +65 6423 0867 

F: +65 6423 0864 

E: kahleong.tan@awac.com 
W: www.awac.com 

 

From: Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com>  

Sent: Monday, 24 December, 2018 1:17 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; Tan, KahLeong 
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<KahLeong.Tan@awac.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for SDD 5288K - DOA: 06/10/2018 Our Ref: SDD 5288K/BT 

 

Dear Veron  

 

Please proceed to finalized amount of $3,776.35 inclusive of check items subject to excess of $1,000 

 

Thank you.  

 

 

Best Regards 

Ben Tang 

Claims Analyst 

Claims Group 

Global Markets 

 

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd 

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914 

T: +65 6423 0816 

F: +65 6423 0864 

E: ben.tang@awac.com 

W: www.awac.com 

 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 24 December 2018 10:55 AM 

To: Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com>; Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; Tan, KahLeong 

<KahLeong.Tan@awac.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for SDD 5288K - DOA: 06/10/2018 Our Ref: SDD 5288K/BT 

 

Dear Ben, 
 
Final amount $3776.35 (inclusive confirmed check items) before excess $1000  
 
 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 16 October 2018 10:45 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; Tan, KahLeong 

<KahLeong.Tan@awac.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for SDD 5288K - DOA: 06/10/2018 Our Ref: SDD 5288K/BT 

 

Dear Veron  
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We refer to above matter.  

 

Please proceed to authorize repair $3,754.30 and check items $2,874.90 subject to verification.  

 

Thank you.  

 

 

Best Regards 

Ben Tang 

Claims Analyst 

Claims Group 

Global Markets 

 

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd 

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914 

T: +65 6423 0816 

F: +65 6423 0864 

E: ben.tang@awac.com 

W: www.awac.com 

 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 15 October 2018 5:02 PM 

To: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; Tan, KahLeong <KahLeong.Tan@awac.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for SDD 5288K - DOA: 06/10/2018 Our Ref: SDD 5288K/BT 

 

Dear Kah Leong, 
 
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SDD 5288K  
Date of survey: 15/10/18 
Number of days : 3 days 
 
We have Not authorise repair. 

 

Kindly let us have your approval please.  
 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 11:00 AM 

To: 'Motorsurvey' <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for SDD 5288K - DOA: 06/10/2018 Our Ref: SDD 5288K/BT 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 
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Thank you for the assignment. 

 
BEST REGARDS, 

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Tan, KahLeong [mailto:KahLeong.Tan@awac.com] On Behalf Of Motorsurvey 

Sent: Monday, 8 October 2018 3:12 PM 

To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: OD survey assignment for SDD 5288K - DOA: 06/10/2018 Our Ref: SDD 5288K/BT 

 
The above captioned accident refers.  Please conduct an "OWN DAMAGE" survey on the following: 
 
 

Insured Vehicle : SDD 5288 K 

Policy Number : AVPCSB0317351802 
Account 
Code:  

A458SD0 

Policy Excess : $ 1,000.00  

Voluntary Excess : $ NA (No waiver) 

Sum Insured : Market Value with COE & PARF 

Make / Model : B.M.W.435I Gran Coupe M Sport A/T / 2014/2015 

Name of Workshop : Performance Motors Limited 

Contact Number : 9116 5200 

Person to Contact : Chua Kee Sin 

Estimated Cost of repairs :       $ 12,397.45 

( x ) 
Please take photographs of the front windscreen area from inside to ascertain whether the 

insured vehicle is equipped with a car camera.  (Compulsory) 

( x ) Please revert with your preliminary survey report with photographs 

Remarks    

 
 
Regards, 
 
Claims Division 

The information contained in this e-mail and any attachments hereto is confidential. If you are not the 
intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate any of this information. If you have received this e-mail 
in error, please immediately notify the sender by reply e-mail and permanently delete the original e-mail 
(and any attachments hereto) and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this e-mail and any attachments 
hereto are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which 
it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
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responsibility is accepted by Allied World Assurance Company Holdings, GmbH or its subsidiaries or 
affiliates, either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
 

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  

 


