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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: HO Winnie <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 8 October, 2018 2:13 PM

To: Admin A

Cc: PEREZ Jessebel

Subject: P2126314 / S8M00XRQ TPPD Claim

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
Save as to Costs 
 
Hi LKK, 
 
Please follow up with TP workshop. 
 
Thanks & Regards 

  
___________________________________________________ 

Winnie Ho, Senior Admin Assistant, Motor Claims Department 

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg  

Email: winnie.ho@axa.com.sg 

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741  / Fax: (65) 6880 4838 
 

 
Please consider the environment before printing this message 

____________________________________________ 

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the 
intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately 

 

 

From: PEREZ Jessebel  

Sent: 08 October, 2018 2:10 PM 

To: HO Winnie <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg> 

Subject: P2126314 / S8M00XRQ TPPD Claim 

 

Dear Winnie, 

 

TP claimant chasing for the settlement. 

Was advised that surveyor’s report was submitted last Friday. 

 

For your kind assistance and necessary action. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 
Jessebel Perez 
Specialist, GI Call Centre  
 
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 
8 Shenton Way #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811  
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customer.care@axa.com.sg  
Tel: 1800-880-4888 (Within Singapore) / (65) 68804888 (International) 
Fax: (65) 6880 4283 
Website: www.axa.com.sg 

 
 

 

-----Disclaimer----- 

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are 

not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have 

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this 

message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other 

entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  


