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/= CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD.
1 Kb Bk & #01-11 Autobay @ Kakl Bukit Singapore 417883
SiiMotor
. VEA DD BT
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave & - 05/10/2018
#01-43
Singapore 417883
Accident date: 04/10/2018
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: SLC9496K AUDI Q7 3.6 A '09
CHASSIS: WAUZZZ4L69D028832
S/n Qty Items U/price Amount
1 1 RearBootlid ¢ ¢ $4,292.65 ~
2 2 Rear Boot Lid Hinge $115.05 $230.10 -
3 2 Rear Boot Lid Shock Absorber $87.35 $174.70 ¢
4 1 Rear Boot Lid Emblem Logo $93.65
5 1 Rear Boot Lid Q7 Logo . $72.30
6 1 Rear Boot Lid 3.6 Logo §72.30
7 1 Rear Boot Lid Quattro Logo $72.30
8 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Lock $160.00-
9 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Rubber $145.85
10 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Trim Board : $1,261.00
11 1 Rear Boot Lid Windscreen Seal I $100.00.-
12 1 Rear Boot Lid Windscreen Moulding $155.00
13 1 Rear Bumper : $2,250.85 -
14 10 Rear Bumper Clip \ 56.50 $65:00
15 2 Rear Bumper Side Retainers - $45.10 $90.20
16 2 Rear Bumper Side Reflector + o7 Fiied $269.90 $539.80 .
17 1 Rear Bumper Lower o ¥ $791.00
18 1 Rear Bumper Lower Cover - 5353.85
19 4 Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor . 117 5 Dby 5194.75 $779.00
20 4  Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor Holder Seal Rubber . $6.50 $26.00
21 1 Rear Bumper (aale Guide. (leed $285.00 «
22 1 Rear Bumper Reinforcement £& .4 $993.55 -
23 1 Rear End Panel Assy ¢ il $974.30 -
24 1 Rear End Panel Top Garnish $314.45
25 1 Rear End Panel Lock Sensor  ~ ¢ $164.75
26 1 Rear End Panel Buzzer Sensor Switch "+ 7 $125.25 ~
27 1 Rear Exhaust i $2,791.55
28 1 Rear Centre Exhaust NP ren $1,433.15 4
29 1  Rear Exhaust Chrome Pipe , $348.55 $348.55 -
30 1 Rear Exhaust Aluminium Cover L $462.55
31 4  Rear Exhaust Mounting i $84.05 $336.20 -




Subtotal :- $19,688.80

Labour charges

To remove & refit rear windscreen $150.00 &
Gum $50.00
To remove & refit boot lid auto lock motor $280.00
To remove & refit reverse sensor sz}}o,an’;u'
To remove & refit cushion & trim board $380.00
To remove & refit rear & centre exhaust 538/0100 (v,
To check wiring _ smg.{]h 39
g4 ] 7
Tuff kote $150.00
Towing fee $100.00 ~
-
Panel beating SZ,,B“MDU
B
Spray painting 51.5007:103—"'0
:_Ih_h'r‘_',.. i ;.':.. suiias M 2 nobify
st baars - Subtotal :- $5,490.00
o NOERR 1 ot FEANE, LR Total:- $25,178.80
LRty - ' ; . B
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

hiips

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owmer 1D Type

Owner 10

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo,

Vehicle te be Exported
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Makes

Yehicle Moded

Primary Colour:
Manutacturing Year;
Engine No.:

Chassis No

Manimum Power Output:
Open Market Value
Cwriginal Registration Date
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibllity:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount!
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount

Total Rebate Amount:

Foreign |dentification Mumber
Fri9M

SLCRAR6K

Mo

04 Det 2018

AL

Q7 316 F5I AT ABS DVAB 4WD
G/DS-LINE 7S

Grey

2008

BHKOP?517
WALIZZZAL69D02RE32
2080 KW (274 bhpl
§71.44300

1¥ May 2009

1% May 2009

F]

£71.44200

Yoy
18 May 2019
§35721.00

18 May 2017

E - Open Category
10

£7.789.00
$46500
§356,186.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 Oct 2018

lofl

OK

vrllta gov sg/ltavrl action/ enquireRebateByPublicBefore. .

4102018, 5:38 PM
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Hsiao TunE (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 1:27 PM
To: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. Hsiac Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Chew Motar; Admin A
Subject: RE: SLC9496K CLAIMING SLU5348S DOA 04.10.18 CPL ™" LKK REF:
CC6/AIG18018179/Apa3
Attachments: SLC9496K CLAIMING SLU53465 DOA 04.10.18 CPLPDF
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Diear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/AIG18018179/Apa3 Hsiao Tong - 6742 3197

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

hank v,

Pest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 666 0055 | emall MeiKwani@ [lanto com | i 67403108

Bk 51, Paya Ubs Industnial Park, Ut Avenue 1, #o2-25 | Slqu8y31)

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 1:10 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Chew Maotor <admin@chewmaotor.com>

Subject: SLC9496K CLAIMING SLUS346S DOA 04.10.18 CPL

*Without Prejudice®
Dear Motor Claims Department,
Enclosed LOD and supporting documents for your reference

Please kindly advise officer in charge and hope to receive offer soon,
Thank you.

Reagards,
Chiloe



g
siiiMotor

| Kokl Buklt Ave & Bl C #01-41
Auloboy@Kokl Bukit 5{417883)
Tel: 4509 5545 Fox:. 4509 5547

CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD



Our Reference CM1811-0127 / SLC9496K f‘
Your Reference SLUS34R5

07" November 20108 ﬂrtijMator

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
AIG Bullding CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD
Ih Shentnn Waw #017-16
Singapore 079120

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLCI496K & SLUS346S ON 04.10.2018 ALONG SEMBAWANG ROAD AT 16:00HRS

We are instructed by ALEXIS TOMOE GIRIN to claim damages and losses against you in connection with
the above-captioned road trathc acodent which ouwr chient’s velicle SLC9496K damaged by vehicle
SLUS34BS driven by your ingured at the material time

We are informed that the sid acoident was caused by your msured's neghgence As o result of the
accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and our client has bean put ta loss and expenses particulars

ul sl ate as Tulluws. -

= Hepair Costs s 5.900.00
~  Loss of Kemtal lor U5 days s 200 .00
= |LTA Fees 2 - 78
~ Total 5 B, 807.45

e ol

A copy of each supporting documents are enclosed for your perusal

~ GIARepont
- Invoice
» LTASearch Receipt

Please let us have your cheaue for the sum of $6,807.45 made pavaole to us. CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD
within the next 14 days

)
Yours Sincrrrlvj"

'ﬂﬁb‘?
*

/ﬁigb‘km
CHEW METOR PTE. LTD.

0R




Assignment

lo: ChewMotorPleltd  (Warkshap)

In consideration for your sgreement to repair my motor vehicle registration no g LCOJ'UOF G_K
aml 10 defer demanding for payment of the cost of repair, Lwe the undersigned do herebs

wrevocably assign absolutely to you all the procesds of my our clamm =i including dnmages, mieres,
costs i expenses Hncluding legal costs  disbursements pavable on o party and party basis which
are 1o be paid o the parties so entitled including soliciiors, vehicle appraiscrs and vher expens

comsuliants),

I'We further confirm that pavmen o vou only or w any person authonsed by vou 1o receive
payment shall consutute s good and effectual discharge of the abligations by any party ol the

aforesaid proceeds of my our clinmis)
I'We authorise you expressly o give notice of this assignment w the purty concemed.

I'We confirm that by this assignment, | we shall not be entitled in law 1o receive any payment. 1 a

chegue 15 sent o me'us, Pwe shall retum same 10 the sender as | we amoare preciuded from

Sescpling by payaawnt

Dated this 04 ayor MO0 oy |6

Sigmaure "

~Name ; Al ToWALQ (1N vy
1D N, - 6;]?q:HqM_
Address

Witness Signature 1/0\

WimessName - Clagy YA Yinh
Witness 1D pEE2LL | H

Witness Adidress




Hsiao TunE SLI{KRuta!

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com>

Sent: Monday, 19 November 2018 10:12 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc Chew Motor

Subject: Re: SLC9496K CLAIMING SLUS3465 DOA 04.10.18 CPL *** LKK REF:
CCE/AIG1B018179/Apa3

Without Prejudice

Hi Hsiao Tong

We accept your offer as 56,500

Please send us the discharge voucher for close case,thanks.

Regards,

Chloe
G~

CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD.

On Sun, Nov 18, 2018 at 12:43 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Hi,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose setflement ot a global sum of $56.500.00{all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.



“Kindly note that this negotlation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of fiability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
Inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of llability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Hondler

LKK Auto Consultunts Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-3108

Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 1:27 PM

To: Chew Maotor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmaotor.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <ch I m>
Cc: Chew Motor <admin@chewmotor.com>; Admin A in-a auto.com>

Subject: RE: SLC9496K CLAIMING SLUS346S DOA 04.10.18 CPL *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG18018179/Apa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"

SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -



LKK ref Officer in charge

CC6/AIG18018179/Apa3 Hsiao Tong - 67423197

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | 5(408933)

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 1:10 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Chew Motor <admin@chewmotor.com>

Subject: SLC9496K CLAIMING SLUS3465 DOA 04.10.18 CPL

*Without Prejudice*
Dear Motor Claims Department,
Enclosed LOD and supporting documents for your reference.

Please kindly advise officer In charge and hope to receive offer soon,
Thank you.

Regards,

Chloe



CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD.



Hsiao Tnna !LKKAuto]

From: Chew Motor Pte. Ltd. <claims@chewmaotor.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 10:37 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc Chew Motor

Subject: Re: SLC9486K CLAIMING SLUS3465 DOA 04.10.18 CPL *** LKK REF:
CCB/AIG1BD18179/Apa3

Attachments: image001.jpg; SLC9496K DV.pdf

Without Prejudice

Hi Hsiao Tong

Enclosed signed discharge voucher for close case.

For Ez Swift Car Rental & Leasing Pte Ltd their vehicle rental agreement as their rental receipt as well,thanks.
Hope to receive your payment soon,thanks.

***please highlight to AIG , payment under "Chew Motor Pte Ltd" ***

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
e i——

CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD.

On Tue, Nov 20, 2018 at 9:10 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Wwithout Prejudice

Hi Chioe,

Thank you for your occeptance.

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and retumn together with the following document 1o us(LKK) for our
necessary action: -



-" UU Auto

g Coniutonis
& s as n P g

) UL AVE 1, #1125 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408913 TEL : (0651 02503561 FAN 1 (103) 62504315

Our Ref: CC&/AIG18018179/Apa3
300CT 2018

HOO KUAN YEW
3 SIN MING WALK
#08-23

SINGAPORE 573575

Dear SirfMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 53465 / SLC 9496K/ OTHERS ON 04/10/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third

party claim against vour policy.
We have received a claim from SLC 9496K against your motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein vou and/or vour authorized driver had amongst
other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the
appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with
third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) will be with held for
the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AIG
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

mﬁlhﬂ TONG

Case Handler
DID: 6742 3197
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: chewht@lkkauto.com

cc.  AlG Asia Pacific insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Depi)



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

Chew Motor Pre Lud
Kok Buki Avenuc o
Blk 1 #1111
Singupore 417853

[hedr Sir.

Accident on - E'ul v hP- 160U

Involving Vehicles ILtW""IEK . ,N.u S-';{l" Lg _
Along — iﬁﬂﬂhmm LGQC{ =

SLCayqsr

[I'We, the tegistired owner/drmver of vehiele registration
have mvolved i the abose accuden

I'We herehy authorize Chew Motor Pre Ltd wo commetee repanrs of the saad velucle forthwith

I'We agree 1o assign the whole proceeds of my vur comprehensive thid pars eladin 1o you amd our
solicior, - tov et i oy onir Behiall i resprect ol the
above manter. And i appheable. mviour solicuors shall accepr this as my our revocable auibority 1o
pay the amount as deemed compensated direct o vou after dediuction of thelt costs o g Solictor and

whient bisis
I'We underntke 1o co-operate fully with vou and our solicnors o ensure than clivim is suceessiul

I'We also authorize vou 1o sign all discharge vouchers indemnity forms and all necessary papets in
relation with the above elim o my our absence.

Yovrr binal eoopesration in this matter il b mnch apprseiared

Yours iruly,

{
M
o .L-”“i. U~—
Owhier™s Signature

(Company s stamp i applicable) .
Name ! 7‘_‘_3’_____1_‘“'_!‘_\1_&5‘1_" hian
NRICNG @ ",ﬂq}\_%m

Dire \"uﬂ\l-m



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD (“the workshop™i hereby confirm thar we!l have reached an
agreement with the appointed survesor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD name of survevor) with respect to the amoum ¢laimed for
586,500.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no, SLC 9496K that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which ocourred on 4/10/2018 (datch along SEMDAWANG ROAD luvolving vehicle mw's SLU

53468

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on D5/1/2018 (date) at “the workshop™

We/l confirm that we/l areiam authorized by the owner ALEXIS TOMOE GIRIN (“the third
paiy clihinainy of velildle no. SLC 94%0RK make the clolm as sel oul In the above paragraph ond
we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his‘her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We'l
enclose herein the letter ol authority given by “the third party claimant”

We/l funther confirm that we/l will indemnify AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid for all damages.
loss and/or expense thm they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant  atter the above sid agreement lodges o turther claim agaimst the tormer tor any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining 1o costs of repairs andior rental andior loss of use pursuant 1o the
damage to SLC 9496K (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimam™ pursuant 1o the accidemt and that further this settlement is reached on o
witheut pigjudive and without adossion ol lisbalivy Lasis.

This agreement is subject 1o the appheation of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated thie ;h (day) of \ imonth) 20 12 {vear)

S Lwp

Siened by appoi Curvesor Signed by “the }furk.\lmn" {with chopi

/



(e CHEW MOTOR PTE. LTD.

SHiMotor }_

TAX INVOICE

AlG ASIA Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Invaice No CPI1811-0127
718 Shonton Way, Diata 07 .Mew. 18
AlG Bulliding, #09-16
Singapore 079120 Date of Accident 04-Oct-18
Vehicle No SLC9A96K
Client ALEXIS TOMOE GIRIN lodel Type Audl Q7
Deseriptions Amount —E

Lump Sum Repair Cost 5.900.00

| Total 5.900.00

(SGD) Dollars: FIVE THOUSAND AND NINE HUNDRED OMNLY
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EZ-SWIFT

CaAN FFNTAL B LFARING

W

UEN; 201724540N

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

EZ-SWIFT CAR RENTAL & LEASING PTE LTD

I ok Buki Avenos B Blk A& 801- 1) AutobayEuak Bukt Singapore 417883

Tel G506 5545 P 8533 9084 (losh) / 9234 8567 (Lester)

- h
L Caudbe L

Iy =

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

De Sointe Movie 0'agneaux
GaIBYRLO

Hame

NRIC/Pgspon No

VeHicl No

'E.-IlLL-‘i-Jr-'

18 ms ondur

Mon-Walyer Excece

M -

Al

Fhratnn

T A — - irf,
— -

O O
s SR

= = v
Legurdi B Qe urwil W by L ——

Total Charge(5GDS):

Address: B4 ey WL oate & e out GRWUE (B 000
U B 0dlg Dt & Time (N: 1A\ 12 (0 110
DI'IVIHE Licence No: Lhargeable Hates Amount
Date of Birth: r,'h\w,“q:[q 0% Days ®ls \fu "EUU
Tial I Mabils, _1'1.1Il|\_,_|"", Weca by [ |-
Manths [ *'.:
Vehicle Chechlist |
- —— ”'; _14 . Depaut SGDS
0 0 jf‘ q. Subtolal G

Quo/-

PETROL LEVEL ["Rates does not include Petrol)
out | E |1/B|1/a|3f/8|1/2|5/8|3/4\7/8| F
IN E|1/8[1/4)|3/8 |12 |5/8|3/a|7/8] F

Mileage Out Mileage In

Additional Remarks

'I- L.]Mn.' 3

Payment Records:

Cash J MNets / Credit Cards

Reforeance:

Staft.

| Hirer's Signature:

i
W

| hiave read and agree to the terms and condition on both sides of this rental agreement

NOTE:
HIRER ANDVOR DRIVER 15 LIADLE FOR ALL PARKING. TRAFFIC VIDLATIONS

AN ADMINIETRATIVE CHARGE WiLL BE LEVHD UPDN AN THAFEIC VIDLATIONS RLDIECTED
VEMICLE 15 STRICTLY FOR SINGADGRE USE ONLY AND MAY NOT DIRVE OUT OF SINGARCRE



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlane
(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Case  |Notified 1&: Submitted | Ad) Assigned | Adj Apt ]iﬂd] Submitted | Irs Auth'ed Status
oy |8 0%t 2018 | e $$5,000.00  $$5.900. m’"‘"""
Edit feg Edit Adj Rpt I tmmmmu_l_ | View Rpk Caccil Ciea I

Claim Details

[Created by adjuster] |

HOO KUAN YEW (HE GUANGYOU), [D: 582703000 |
ALEXIS TOMOE GIRIN, ID: GI139719M

Claimant:

Vehice Reg. ~T04/10/2018 15:00 - 59
No.: SLC9496K Dane:of Lost: |[u:mm and 18 Days Fram LTA Rleg Date (Man ¥r)]

Claim Type: | TP / 190139929356 Policy/Cover | 1700090955 (Comprehensive)

Vehicle Reg.

No. SLUS3465S m::n GAZ66167

(Insured): | )
Excess:

Repairer: | Chew Motar Pte Ltd (HQ) BLOCK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6, #01-43, 417883 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 67479241
Handiing AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 ... [Handied by Chan, Klan-Meng]
Insurer: Kianmang.Chianl@aig .com

Claimant's i
Insurer: AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7288

Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 17/10/2018)

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  Camgase Case il |
There are no mail Tor this case.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View Al | Search Taska | Create Now Task | _cComplete ||

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done? |
Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.conv/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp... 28/11/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

*SLC9496K (19013992935G)
[SLUS3465]
TP
ALEXIS TOMOE GIRIN
Oct 4 2018 3:00PM
[HOO KUAN YEW (HE GUANGYOU)]
Chew Motor Pte Ltd

upioad Documents | _upioad Photos | _Compose Mew Lener | _upioad video | _upioad Audi_| View [View n Browser %]
Letters/Correspondances B Lperpage V]
Ne | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |(Dramt) Third Party Express Settlement — Payment Breakdown 0 Edit
Fhetos/Images 1 par page =
No |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid (HQ) Thumbmnall | Print
1 |27/10/18 13:58 | General View 0D wurs | A
1 |27/10/18 13:58 | Chassis Numbar 0 wcoaws | A
1 |27/10/18 13:58 | General View D | s | &
& |27/10/1813:58 | Geners] View 0 v | P
5 |27/10/18 13:58 Ganeral View D wuws | 4
B |27/10/18 13:58 | Genersl View D | tadws |
7 |2710/1813:58 | General View 0 | e | 4
B |27/10/18 13:58  General View 0 wurs | F
{8 |27/10/18 13:58 | General View O | toaiws | &
10 |27/10/18 13:58 | General View O | losws |
11 |27/10/1813:58 | General View D wearc | #
12 |27/10/18 13:58 | General View 0 | tcews | &
|13 |27/10/18 13:58 | General View 0 | Laiwe |
14 (2771018 13:58 | General View 0 | s |
(15 27/10/1813:58 | Genersl View O | weares | @
16 27/10/18 13:58 | General View O | woars | &
l17 127/10/18 13:58 | General View D | Load g
li8 (27/10/18 13:58 | General View O Ledws | 2
19 27/10/18 13:58 | General View © | weaws | 4
120 (27/10/18 13:58 | General View i | Leadwc | 4
21 (27/10/18 13:58 | General View O | oades | A |
22 27/10/16 13:58 | General View O | toaws | A
21 (27/10/18 13:58 | Genersl View O | wwedrs |
24 |27710/18 13:58 | General View ) | iLoad irg
25 27/10/18 13:58 | General View © ! aws | &
26 | 2710/18 13:58 | General View O carvs | B
77 |27/10/18 13:58 | General View ) | Loadrg
28 27/10/18 13:58 | General View D | leadirc | A
29 |Z7/10/18 13:58 Ganoral View D | sdire | &
30 27/10/18 13:58 | General View O wedies | A
31 |27/10/18 13:58 Reinspection Photo D | loadiec | &
32 27/10/18 13:58 | Reinspection Phote © | Loadrc | @
33 (2710018 13:58 Reinspaction Photo D | sz A
34 (77710718 13:58 | Rminspection Phato O | Loadirs

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do... 28/11/2018



Mernimen e-Claims

Page 2 of 2

Letters /Correspondences tperpage ||| B2
Ng_ | Finafized On | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbrail | Print
_ 14
;}S_Ll?fiﬂflati:ﬂ l!dmm @O | tosais | A
36 (27/10/18 13:58 | Reinspection Photo 0| s | A
37 |27/10/18 13:5%8 | Reinspection Photo g_ Load PG
3 27/10/1813:58  Reinspection Photo 0 | losdwc | A |
39 |27/10/1B 13:58 Reinspection Photo ﬂ Load JPG EI
A0 27/10/18 13:58 Reinspection Photo D | toadirc | A
41 27/10/18 13:58 | Relnspection Photo 0| lcedirc | |
42 I7/10/18 13:56 | Reinspection Photo © | sdwc | @ |
‘43 27/10/1B 13:58 | Reinspection Photo D | wcoaws | A |
L
44 27/10/18 1358 | Reinspection Photo O eawc | A |
45 37/10/18 13:55  Reinspection Photo 0 | losawc | A
'u_'zmms 13:56 | Relnspection Photo 0 | oars | 4
47 |27/10/18 13:58 | Relnspection Photo D | tcadaws | @
48 27/10/18 13:58 | Reinspection Photo D | losdirc | A
Documentation toerpage  |~]| 4
Mo | Relabel /Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 (0B/10/1B 15:50 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
7 (1B/11/1B 12:39 | TP ESTIMATE_MARKED Load POF
3 IB/11/18 10:25 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load FOF
4 ZE/11/18 10:25 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM | Load POF
5 26/11/18 10:25 | Release Voucher Load POF
& 2B/11/1810:25 | REMTAL RECEIPT Load POF
7 |2B/11/18 10:25 |LETTERTO O1 o Load PDF
Mo | Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Ltd. [SG) Thumbnail | Print
I | 0B/10/18 16:06 | O GIA REPORT © | Losaror
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | sove | eeine |
There are no document checklsts configured.
Our Checkiist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ)
ol
W
Show Remarks To: L Handling Insurer
Fote Ramarks doe pricals onless you thow il 8 Cier parties.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do... 28/11/2018



Preview Page 1 of ]

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SLU5346S (Insd veh) Model: DI Q7 3.6 FSI QUATTRO
SLCB496K (TP veh) -LINE (A)
| Date of Accident: |04/10/2018
Global Sum Settlement | : | [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimate ‘5 2544485
Final Repair Cos! s §,500.00
Loss of Use 'S days &t $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) s 5 days
LTA ! GIA Search Fee 1S
Others 3
'S
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) i 6,500.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X ] NO (Kindly indicate
below)
A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): 0 (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown

1} | Chew Motor Pte Ltd s 6,500.00
2) g
28 Nov
JOANME LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 28/11/2018



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd o regno 1sssorsessy
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 5844-B805 Emall: sun@ikkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB/AIG1801817TWAPA3Q2

Date: 2811172018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer; AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Palicy No: 1700080855
Clalmant Vehicle 51 cosgek Insured Vehicle No ;  SLUS3465
Date of Loss: D4/10/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 18013%92935G
PTI IFICATI F VEHI
Reg No: SLC9486K
Make & Modal: AUDI Q7, 3.8 FSI Quattro S-Line (A) Engine No: EHKD98517
Reg. Date: 19052009 (Man, Year, 2008) Chassis Mo. WaLZZZ4l BRD028832
Colour. Grey Odomater 103220 km
Engine Capacity: 35457 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (SS): Market Value/New Car Price
I T T E
Geaneral Condition: Steering (Serviceable) Yes Footbrake (Serviceabla) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification Noe Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size 275/45 R20 Rear Tyre Size: 275/45 R20
Front Left Side: Nexen 6 mm Rear Left Side: MNexan 6 mm
Front Right Side: Nexen & mm Rear Right Side: Nexen & mm
The above values reprasent the mmaring fyre toads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Parts 18,654 .85 573258 14,222 27 71.27
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 5,480.00 1.640.00 3,850.00 70.13
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 25,444 B5 T.3T2.58 18.072.27 71.03
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 5,900.00
Mett Amount (S§5) 25,444 85 5,900.00 19,544.85 76.81
+ Car Rental (5.0 x $§130.00/day) (S$) £50.00
Natt Liability (S$) 6,550.00
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 6,500.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 051072018
Date Inspected: 05/10/2018 Inspected At Chew Molor Pte Ltd (HQ)
BLOCK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE B, #01-43
Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair 4 0 days

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 28/11/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 0f 4

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: This repart represents our findings ar ihe fime end piece of mspection safed homin, Such inspection has been carmed oul fo the best of our
inowlsdpe and abiify but any cther labiily under sy offer cifcumatances i hemby sxpresaly axcliided.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 28/11/2018



Adjuster Report

Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
Ne. Qty ::" Particutars Condition Repairers Amount
11 *‘REAR BOOT LID Repair 4,202 65F . FL
2 2 *REAR BOOT LID HINGE Not Necessary 230.10F “FL
3 2 *REAR BOOT LID SHOCK ABSORBER Not Necessary 174.70F “FL
PR *REAR BOOT LID EMBLEM LOGO Necessary G365F "9365FL
5 1 *REAR BOOT LID Q7 LOGOD MNecessary T2.30F *"T2.30FL
B 1 *REAR BOOT LID 3.60 LOGO Necessary 7230F *T230FL
7 1 *REAR BOOT LID QUATTRO LOGO Necessary 7230F *72.30FL
B 1 *REAR BOOT LID INNER LOCK Nat Necessary 160.00F “FL
9 1 *REAR BOOT LID INNER RUBBER Not Necessary 145.85F “FL
10 1 *REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD Not Necessary 1.261.00F *FL
" 1 *REAR BOOT LID WINDSCREEN SEAL Not Necessary 100.00F “FL
12 1 *REAR BOOT LID WINDSCREEN MOULDING Not Necessary 155.00F “ FL
171 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 2.250.85F *2.250.85FL
14 10 *REAR BUMPER CLIP Necessary 85.00F *30.00FL
15 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER Necessary 8020F *90.20FL
16 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR MN/S Cracked / O/S 53080F *539BOFL
Cul
17T 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER Deformed T81.00F *7T81.00FL
12 1 *‘REAR BUMPER LOWER COVER Deformed 353.85F *3A53B5FL
19 1 *REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR Damaged (2 PCS 779.00F *38950FL
(4PCS) ONLY)
20 4 ;F:JE:BHEzUHFEH REVERSE SENSOR HOLDER SEAL Not Necessary 26.00F “FL
21 1 *REAR BUMPER CENTRE GUIDE Cracked 285.00F *285.00FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Bent 993 55F *093.55FL
23 1 ‘REAR END PANEL ASSY Hepmr 974.30F *FL
24 1 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Not Necessary 314.45F “ FL
25 1 *REAR END PANEL LOCK SENSOR Not Necessary 184.75F “FL
286 1 *REAR END PANEL BUZZER SENSOR SWITH Not Necassary 126.25F “FL
27 1 *REAR EXHAUST Repair 2,791 55F “FL
28 1 *REAR CENTRE EXHAUST Not Necessary 1,.433.15F “FL
20 1 *REAR EXHAUST CHROME PIPE Not Necessary 348 55F ~FL
30 1 *REAR EXHAUST ALUMINIUM COVER Not Necessary 462 55F “FL
31 4 ‘REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING Not Mecessary 336.20F *FL

FeFranchiss part. L=ListilemDisc.

- List ltem Discount on L tems 0.00/5.00% (5%)

Sub Total (S§) 19,054.85 6,034.30

0.00

301.72

Total Parts (55) 18,954.85 5,732.58

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 28/11/2018



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems
There are no new miscellaneous lems selecied.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour llems
1 TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN New 150.00 0.00
2 GUM MNew 50.00 0.00
3 TO REMOVE & REFIT BOOT LID AUTO LOCK MOTOR New 280.00 0.00
4 TO REMOVE & REFIT REVERSE SENSOR Mew 100.00 60.00
5 TO REMOVE & REFIT CUSHION & TRIM BOARD New 3B80.00 0.00
2] TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR & CENTRE EXHAUST New 380.00 100.00
T TO CHECK WIRING MNew 100.00 30.00
B TUFF KOTE New 150.00 0.00
a TOWING FEE MNew 100.00 0.00
10 PANEL BEATING Mew 2.000.00 650.00
11 SPRAY PAINTING New 1,800.00 800.00
Gross Labour Cost [S5) 5,490.00 1,640.00
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MT Radjuster&fuseaction=gen... 28/11/2018



