Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 5:10 PM

To: ‘Wei Shong'

Cc: 'sam333@bloomberg.net’; 'Johnson Chua'; Admin A

Subject: RE: URGENT - Check Liability - TLM Ref: TP013102018; LKK Ref: TBA; Accident

involving EV200P (TLM) & SLW4092U (AIG) on 04.10.2018

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS
Our Ref: CC6/AIG18018167/Ufa3
Your Ref: EV 200P

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SLW 4092U AND EV 200P ALONG ON 04.10.2018
We refer to the above matter.

We have reviewed the circumstances of the incident and we are of the opinion that there is no conclusive
evidence yet to substantiate either party’s version unless you can provide rear car camera footage from
11.38.43 onwards to further consider this claim.

Falling which, we regret to inform you that we are unable to look into your claim.

Below is a copy of our insured's accident report statement for your perusal.




“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

57424

ReRREn W Syve the Lartht Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Samuel Tan (SOLITAIRE ASSET MANA) [mailto:sam333@bloomberg.net]

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 2:37 PM

Subject: RE: URGENT - Check Liability - TLM Ref: TP013102018; LKK Ref: TBA; Accident involving EV200P (TLM) &
SLW4092U (AIG) on 04.10.2018

Hi Poh Kin, This process of resolving the accident dispute is taking too
long. Do you agree? I am losing a little patience here. Just tell me the
conclusion asap so that I can plan for the next course of action. This
thing cannot drag on any further! Samuel

From: wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg At: 12/04/18 17:06:11

To: pohkin@lkkauto.com

Cc: SAMUEL TAN (SOLITAIRE ASSET MANA ) , johnson.chua@tlmotor.com.sg
Subject: RE: URGENT - Check Liability - TLM Ref: TP013102018; LKK Ref:
TBA; Accident involving EV200P (TLM) & SLW4092U0 (AIG) on 04.10.2018

Without prejudice

Dear Poh Kin,

We still waiting from your reply, please update us whether your insured agreeable to
direct settle with us at 100% liability for this accident



