Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 March, 2019 12:41 PM

To: Vie (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain

collision SGM7400G>GBC17875>FBEB4A91M >SGYT883H on 21/9/2018 LKK REF
CC4/LPC1B018105/Dhb3 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Teti&E} 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all { ¥ew | lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 7 March, 2019 2:24 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
SGM7400G>GBC17875>FBEB491M>5GY78B3H on 21/9/2018 [External Confidential] LKK REF
CC4/LPC18018105/Dhb3

Your Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935
Our Ref: CC4/LPC18018105/Dhb3

Dear Gerald,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBC 17875 (0l) / SGY 7883H (TP) / OTHERS ON 21/09/2018
We refer to the above matter.

We refer to the assignment dated 4'" October 2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlernent with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

It was reported that our Insured vehicle was involved in a 4 vehicle chain collision and was the 3™ car and was
pushed forward from behind.

We propose to offer to TP repairer “CAREWELL AUTO SERVICE" as below:



[ TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair §5,108.00 $ 2,300.00
Loss of Use (5150 x 3 days) S 450.00 S 360.00 (5100 x 3 days)
TOTAL | §5,558.00 $ 2,660.00

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 3 days
TOTAL | 3 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vice Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February, 2019 5:20 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG

Subject: FW: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
SGM7400G>GBC17875>FBEB491M>5GY7883H on 21/9/2018 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

Please ignore my earlier email.

BOLA applied in this scenario.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



4" December 2018

Toh Hea Yam
Apt Block 201 Bishan 5t. 23
#02-487

Singapore 570201

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
300 Beach Road
#17/04-07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Attn @ Motor Claims Department

Dear 5irs,
RE : Accident Involving Vehicle No. 5GY7883H and Lorry GBC17875 along
Bishan Road heading twds Braddell Road, near Bishan MRT Depot on
September 217 2018
| am the owner of Vehicle No. SGY7883H which was involved in the above accident
with Lorry GBC17875 whom | understand is insured with you.
The accident was clearly caused by your driver’s negligence, therefore | am seeking
compensation from you for my financial loss as itemised below -

1. Cost of Repair as per Carewell Auto Service Inv # 19605 55 2,300-00
2. Loss of Use for 3 days @ 55150 p/day 55 450-00

Total :- 55 2,750-00

Awaiting for your early reply.

Thank You.

Yours sincerely,




AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

Uwe, e Wew Yan® Chok Yah Yen (the third party claimant”) of
B\ Do\ Bishan $4 A2 Hed- ¥ o $Fede) (address), owner of D0 A8E3N
(vehicle no.) hereby authorize Casavdal ko Lesvice (“the workshop™) to act for me with

respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no
S 28828 that was damaged pursuant 1o the accident which occurred on 2 ]_‘3{1 '!-'*“ 'B(date)

along B ishan & o ading dewads Bredden Read (location) involving vehicle no/s
GBCVIPTS (“the accident™),

1/We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem
fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.
I/We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this A\ % (day) of Mas (month) 201° i (year)

igned by “the third party tlaimant™ Signed by “the workshop”
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



} LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : I18/18/18/VC05/020935
DATE : 21 MARCH 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

(4 & "W;"Jl

/We, TOH HEA mlﬁ@gggj( YAH YEN confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANC “and/or the owner of GBC_1787S the sum of
Singapore Dollars Two Thousand Six Hundred Sixty Only ($2,660.00) in full and
final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to mefus
upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim
sustained by mefus whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident to my vehicle. SGY 7883H on 21
SEPTEMBER 2018 along BISHAN ROAD.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (PENTA LIGHTING PTE
LTD / LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever
made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you 1o pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S
CAREWELL AUTO SERVICE,

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action,

Name of vehicle owner/Date ‘1,\ o3 \}:‘: 'q



ﬂ INVOICE No: 19605

CAREWELL AUTO SERVICE

160 Sin Ming Drive #03-21 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Tel: 5459 9926 Fax: 6459 9928 Email: carewell@singnet.com.sg
Reg. No. 307289004
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FEUCE FQREE- Singapora 40BBGS
Tel +G5 G547 0000
Fax +B65 6547 82508
WA police, gov. 50
Our Ref s TRP/54129/2018
Date : 17 January, 2019

LIONG SIN CHOOMN

APT BLK 986C JURONG WEST STREET 93
#07-619

SINGAPORE 6439806

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGYT7883H/FBEB401M/GBC17875/SGMT7400G ON
21/09/2018 AT ABOUT 1618 HRS ALONG BISHAN ROAD TOWARDS BRADDELL
ROAD AFTER ANG MO KIO AVENUE 1

I refer to the ahove accident,

2. Please be informed that we have completed our investigations which shows that
the driver of SGM7400G have committed an offence of Inconsiderate Driving under Section
65(b) Road Traffic Act, Chapter 276. Action has been initiated against the driver for the said
offence.

3. If you have any queries, please contact the Investigation Officer MUHD NOOR
BIN ABDUL RAHMAN at telephone number 6547 6201,

Yours faithfully

Roslédn Ahmad, Stn Insp
For Head Investigation
Traffic Police

Singapore Police Force

A FORCE FOR THE MATION
NP 510



