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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-B607198-R
l Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
ILONPAG INSURANCE BHD Ref :  CC4/LPC18018105/Dhb3
e 040 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE fogss5 Dale: 05102018 mmm"mmmmm |‘|
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, GBC 17875 Veh. Inspected SGY 7883H
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 05/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre rim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  21/09/2018 Inspection Date 08/10/2018
Survey held at CAREWELL AUTO SERVICE
BLEK 176 SIN MING DRIVE
#02-06
SIN MING AUTOCARE
SINGAPORE 575721
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFAIRS.
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’ e Consuitants
== Pies bl Company Reglstration No, 19960T1H8R
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STUBLAVE L2 25 PAYA UBLINDDSTRIAL PFARK, sINGAPORE 09933 TEL $ (065 62563561 FANX @ (065 62564115

Yourref: To Be Advised Date; 16.10.2018
Owr ref: CCH1L.PC18018105/Dhb3

The Motor Claims Department

Mis LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SGYT883H
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 08.10.2018
al the premises of M/s _Carewell Auto Service_and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 5h 5,005.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 3,353.00
"Check” ltems Amount 185 790.00
Market Value D88 s
LTA Reimbursement Value : 58 -
Mett Value 1 5% -

FERRI
Description of Damage: - ——
The vehicle sustained damages at the Ly /5 T
Rear Portion e

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3 days

Yours faithfully,

ANG BRYAN TANI
Licensed Appraiser



Mr Toh Hea Yam

Vehicle No. SGY7883H

Model Mo. Mercedes Benz W212/E250

02" Oct 2018

LKK Auto Consultanis hence nolify
the Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey Defora/afer spray painting
« To desplay damaged pari{s) during resurvey
» Parts prices ame subject 1o confirmation
» Third pary sunwey i on & “Withoul Prejudice” basis
» No ilegal modification|s) & allowed
» Supplementary itam(s) must be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer

Signatums:

Date:

Re: Estimates and Miscellaneous Charges
1. 1 pc Rear Bumper Assy cAupaad 5§ 1,603-00 “
2. 1 pc Rear Bumper Reinforcement A2 NH 790-00 A X
3. 2pcs Rear Bumper Brackets koryl 330 156-00
4, 1pc Rear Bumper Centre Chrome Moulding (e pe.  171-00 —
5. 2pcs Rear Bumper Side Chrome Mouldings  He 256-00 ~
6. 1pc Rear LHS Tail Lamp Assy Kaf 612-00 %, QEQL-UE
7. 2pcs Parktronics DI*.,H:-{ £90-00 ){,
io?s 'lalLtJ\“*D
Sub-Total 55 4,155-00

Labour Charges

To knock, remove and install the damaged parts
according to conditions.

To putty primer and spray paint Rear Bumper

Total

%) \ 1bPﬂg Q “-l*%:dm

A A A

cle-a.

«

5S¢  450-00 3oe|-
55 40e-80” &ej: 3{33[_
$$  5,005-00 /
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Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: ONG U U <liong®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 4 October, 2018 5:44 FM

To: carewell@singnet.com.sg; assignments@Ikkauto.com; admin-d@Ikkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref; 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
SGM7400G>GBC17875>FBEB491M >SGY7883H on 21/9/2018

Attachments: 02102018163348.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Mdm

As spoken with your Jessy, please let us know if you require us to conduct the TP survey, If

so, please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd. \ﬁu\wm
NG x:j.lm%-’ :

Dear Catherine/Nivitha VA \,Px\ﬁ‘kﬁ\ﬂ

Please follow up with workshop. -g\.mqi‘??

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Charlotte Chew [mailto:charlotte.chew@income.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 4 October, 2018 2:00 PM

To: carewell@singnet.com.sg

Cc: ONG LI LI

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
SGM7400G>GBC17875>FBEB491M>SGY7883H on 21/9/2018

Without prejudice

Dear Hea Yam

Our investigation shows that GBC17875 had hit onto SGY7883H. This is confirmed by the reports of 3 vehicles SGM7400G,
FBEB491M and SGY7883H.

We are unable to accept any liability.
Thank you.

Charlotte Chew

Senior claims executive

Maotar Insurance

T+b65 6430 7924
WWW.INCOME,Com.sg

(' Incon'E At Income, we are 'In with You' on Pedormance, Growth.
maos diffessnt Innovation and Impacl. Thes« se altnbutes reflect what we promise
45 an emplover and what we want our people to exemplity n
m Find out more at Income.com.sg/careers ‘

1




From: mtreg

5ent: Thursday, 4 October 2018 10:46 AM

To: 'carewell@singnet.com.sg'; Charlotte Chew

Subject: FW: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
S5GM7400G>GBC17875>FBEB491M>5GY7883H on 21/9/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm

We have registered the claim.
Claim no. MT/1012896-002
Officer-in-charge —Charlotte Chew

Josephine Cheah
Snr Administrator, Motor Insurance

Www.inCome.com.sg

(' Incorr.E At Income, we are ‘In with You' on Performance, Growth, 't\
mods diffamnd Innovation and Impact. These attributes reflect what we promise W'l

as an employer and what we want our people to exemplify. n O|
n m Find out more at Income.com.sg/careers y

‘With effect from 1 Oct 2018, we will be discontinuing our fax number 6338 1504.

Please forward all motor claims related correspondences to mtci@income.com. s5q so that we can attend to it
accordingfy.”

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, October 02, 2018 4:57 PM

To: carewell@singnet.com.sg
Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; NTUC Income Motor Dept <motor@income.cam sg>

Subject: Your Ref: 5GY7883H Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
S5GM7400G>GBC1787S>FBER491M>5GY7883H on 21/9/2018

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

Dear Sir/Mdm
We refer to the above chain collision.

As spoken, according to our Insured, the motorcycle FBEB491M had collided onto your
client’s vehicle.

Please direct your client's claim to his insurer NTUC Income under MCF.

Regards,
Ong Li Li



Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Cc NTUC Income - pls take over (your insured FBE8491M)

Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the
recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately
and delete all copies of it. Thank you.



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

S—— ——————— === ——— -
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms
Sent: Wednesday, 17 October 2018 10:10 AM
To: : Shu Pei (LKKAuUta)
Cc MT_Claim_SG; Vic (LKKAutao)
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/18,/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision SGMT400G=
GBC17A75>FBEA491M=>5GYTHE3H on 21/9/2018
Attachments: 171020180957 28 pdf; 17102018100010.pdf; 17102018100457 pdf

Dear Shu Pei,

We attached copy of our insured’s GIA report together with
the police reports of the various parties involved in the chain
collision.

Based on the thitd party reports, it would appeared that our insured
had hit into vehicles, FBEB491E and SGY7883H.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent; Wednesday, 1/ October, 2018 9:38 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto}

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/ 18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
SGM7400G>GBC1787S>FBEB491M>SGY7883H on 21/9/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above marter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SGY 7883H at M/s Carewell Auto Service ona WP basis and TP repairer purposed
for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

1



Thank vou.

Bost Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LEK Auto Coniultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6366-0055 | emall: shupaif@lkkaute.com | fax 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKEKAuta)

Sent: Friday, 5 October 2018 10:46 AM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_5G" <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
SGM7400G>GBC17875>FBER491M>5GY7883H on 21/9/2018

Dear Li L,
Mhank you for the assignment.
Please be infarmed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8494 | email: assignmentsivlkkauto.com | fax: b2g6-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Fark, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI Ll [mailto:llong@lonpac.com)

Sent: Thursday, 4 October, 2018 5:44 PM

To: carewell@singnet.com.sg; assignments@lkkauto.com; admin-d@lkkauto.com
Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.coms>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
SGM7400G>GBC17875>FBEB491M>SGY7883H on 21/9/2018

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Mdm

As spoken with your Jessy, please let us know if you require us to conduct the TP survey, If so,
please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.

Dear Cathering/Nivitha

Please follow up with workshop.
Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555

F



Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Charlotte Chew [mailto:charlotte chew@income.com.sq)
Sent: Thursday, 4 October, 2018 2:00 PM

Teo: carewell@singnet.com.sq
Cer ONG LI LI

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
SGM7400G>GBC17875>FBEB491M>5GY7883H on 21/9/2018

Without prejudice

Dear Hea Yam

Our investigation shows that GRC17875 had hit onto 5GY7883H, This is confirmed by the reports of 3 vehicles SGM7400G,
FEBEE451M and SGY7B83H.

We are unable to accept any liability.
Thank you.

Charlotte Chew

Seniar claimes executive
Mator Insurance

T+65 6430 7924
WWW.INCOIMEe.COMm.58

(' | ﬂe*{-ni T T mam—m——— 11 Wl,th

..... ] innovation and Impact, These attributes reflect what we promise .-.'i“af‘.‘".q. 1

as an emplioyer and what we wanl our people to exemplify. = E Ou
- q- " = B |~
L] o Find out more at income.com.sg/carears a= =

From: mtreg

Sent: Thursday, 4 October 2018 10:46 AM

Ta: ‘carewell@singnet.com.sg’; Charlotte Chew

Subject: FW: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
SGM7400G>GBC17875>FBEB491M>SGY7883H on 21/9/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm

We have registered the claim.
Claim no. MT/1012896-002
Officer-in-charge —Charlotte Chew

Josephine Cheah
Snr Administrator, Motor Insurance
WAL INCOME, Cam.58




T " Mesirs WAL R L1 3 [E

35 an emplover and what we want our pecple to exemplily, = B e you

0 + i I B

n m Find out more at income.com.sg/carears am -

"With effect from 1 Oct 2018, we will be discantinuing our fax number 6338 1504.
Please forward all motor claims refoted correspondences to mtc@income.com.sg <o that we can attend to i
accordingly.”

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com)

Sent: Tuesday, October 02, 2018 4:57 PM

To: carewell@singnet.com.sg

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt claim@Ilonpac.com>; NTUC Income Motor Dept <motor@income.com.sg>
Subject: Your Ref: SGY7883H Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020935 Chain collision
SGM7400G>GBC17875>FBEB491IM>SGY7883H on 21/9/2018

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

Dear Sir/Mdm
We refer to the above chain collision.

As spoken, according to our Insured, the motorcycle FBE8491M had collided onto your client’s
vehicle.

Please direct your client’s claim to his insurer NTUC Income under MCF,

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Cc NTUC Income - pls take over (your insured FBE8491M)

Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s)
narned above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all
copies of it. Thank you,



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Moo 199607 198R. GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CC4/LPC18018105/0hb3n2
FkmaiCapm———E O ]
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBC 17875 Veh. Inspected SGY 78E3H
Policy No. Z18VPCO5000102 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 18/18/18/VCO5/020935 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From GERALD Assign Date 04/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ E 250 C.C 1796
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. WDD2120472A128310 Colour SILVER
Odometer 210829 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/55 R18 MICHELIN 5mm
L/H Front Tyre |[225/55 R18 MICHELIN 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[225/55 R18 MICHELIN 5mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[225/55R18 MICHELIN 5 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5 General Information
Accident Date  21/09/2018 Inspection Date 08/10/2018
Survey held at 160 SIN MING DRIVE #03-21
Repairer CAREWELL AUTQ SERVICE
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE MOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

3 Working Days




I B Pd¥ V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Bed B BB B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
o s SE TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9507198-R Page No. 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGY 7883H
Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::LT:;:%} u“*"}i{“md
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER ASSY DISTORTED 1,603.00 1,603.00
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 790.00
2|REAR BUMPER BRACKETS BROKEN 136.00 136.00
1|REAR BUMPER CENTRE CHROME MOULDING CRACKED 171.00 171.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE CHROME MOULDINGS NECESSARY 256.00 256.00
1|REAR LHS TAIL LAMP ASSY NOT NECESSARY £12.00 .
2|PARKTRONICS NOT NECESSARY 690.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -216.680
4,258.00 1,949.40
LABOUR
TO KNOCK ,REMOVE AND INSTALL THE DAMAGED 450.00 300.00
PARTS ACCORDING TO CONDITIONS.
TOPUTTY PRIMER AND SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER, 400.00 300.00
850.00 600.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,108.00 2,549.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,300.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18018105/Dhb3n2
/ f T+
Y
ANG BRYAN TANI HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor [ Investigator Automotive Assessor




