Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuUtO)

Sent: Monday, 4 March, 2019 9:42 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cec: Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GZ1570U (OL
SNM18D04721C02/0) and SLZ5732) (TP : LKK REF - CCe/CTI18018062/Aha3) on
01/10/2018

Dear Alfred,

We refer to the below email.
Please be informed that we had settled the matter at a global sum of $8,650.00 (all in).
We will forward relevant documents to your good office for you necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Monday, 28 lanuary, 2019 4:32 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GZ1570U (OI: SNM18D04721C02/0) and
SLZ5732) (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118018062/Aha3) on 01/10/2018

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18018062/Aha3
CTI REF — SNM18D04721C02/0 (GZ1570U)

Hi Vic
We refer to your email of 25 January 2019 pertaining to the above matter,
You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $8,673.50.

We await your payment advice to enable Chin Kiat to act accordingly,

1



Vic (LKKAuto)
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From:; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 28 January, 2019 432 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuUta); Admin A

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GZ1570U (OL
SNM18D04721C02/0) and SLZ5732) (TP : LKK REF - CCe/CTI18018062/Aha3) on
01/10/2018

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18018062/Aha3
CTI REF — SNM18D04721€02/0 (GZ1570U)

Hi Vic
We refer to your email of 25 January 2019 pertaining to the above matter.
You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 58,673.50.

We await your payment advice to enable Chin Kiat to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Tel (65) 6389 5183

Fax (65) 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a conmmitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited [f you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately,

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 25 January, 2019 5:36 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=; Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GZ1570U (Ol: SNM18D04721C02/0) and
SLZ5732) (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18018062/Aha3) on 01/10/2018

Importance: High

CTlI REF = SNM1BD04721C02
LKK REF — CC6/CTI18018062/Aha3

Dear Boon Sen,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GZ 1570U (OI) / SLZ 5732 (TP) / OTHERS ON 01/10/2018



We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that the Insured vehicle was involved in a 3 vehicle chain collision and was the 2™ car and was pushed
forward from behind.

A letter and email were sent out to the Insured to informed about the TP claim and liability. No feedback received till
date.

In view of the above, we are of the view that liability is not to our Insured’s favour and the damages sustained to TP
vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

Summary to offer to repairer KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 12,545.70 S 797150
Loss of Rental (5120 x 7 days) 5 840.00 5 700.00 (5100 x 7 days)
GIA Search Fee 5 2.00 5 2.00
TOTAL $ 13,387.70 $ 8,673.50

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 7 days
TOTAL 7 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Meanwhile, we had confirmed with TP repairer as of today that the PD LOD is not yet available, the above
proposed amount was given to us over the phone and they will forward the LOD by next week.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

FESES 8
SeRRER N Save the Earthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof. and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Chong Boon Sen [mailto:boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com

Sent: Friday, 25 January, 2019 8:59 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GZ1570U (OI : CAI - SNM18D04721C02) and SLZ5732J (TP : LKK

z



,;1_ f\f ;ij ﬁai‘%‘:"/\jﬁ 187
Ir-:n.n KANG %AR REPAIRERS P’?Ei’[%

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-06 AUTOBAY @KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 67477636, 67473005 FAX: 67485071 Email: kangcar@singnet.com.sg \
Co. Reg. No. 201300201N GST Reg. No. 201300201N

Our Ref : KCR1020185732CTI
Your Ref : SLZ5732J

Date  :go s 200} WITHOUT PREJUDICE

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
C/O LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Pk

Singapore 408913

Attention ; Motor Claim Department

Dear Sirs,

Accident involving SLZ5732J /GZ1 570U and others on 01,10.2018 along Slip Rd of CTE
twds City near Bus Bay 60089.

We refer to the above accident. On our record showed that you are the insurer of motor
vehicle GZ1570U

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured's negligent driving and/or
management of his vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle was damaged and
our client has been put to loss and expense.

On behalf of and as authorized by M/S Kelvin & Geraldine, the owner of motor-vehicle no:
SLZ5732J, we submit his claim to you:

Cost of repairs (Inclusive of 7% GST) $7971.50
Loss of rental (7 days x $120.00) $ 84000
GIA search fee 3 2.00

$8.813.50

Enclosed herewith are copies of the following documents in support of our client's claim:
1) Tax invoice no: KCR-INV1900046
2) GIlA report of SLZ5732J
3) GIA search fee and invoice
4) Rental agreement and invoice
Ve hope to receive your early reply soon.
Thank you. |

Yours faithfully,
KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTELTD
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S1UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563361 FAX : (065) 62564315
Our Ref: CC6/CTI18018062/Aha3

01 NOVEMBER 2018

RIGHT ENGINEERING PTE LTD By Post and By Email
2 JALAN RAJAH

#07-04 GOLDEN WALL FLATTED FACTORY

SINGAPORE 329134

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir'fMadam.,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 1570U / SLZ 57321 / OTHERS ON 01/10/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Vic/Alpeh
DJD: 6841 2096
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh(a@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)
fesviphonia@righiprojecis.com.se
(Email)




Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 November, 2018 5:57 PM

To: jesylphon@rightprojects.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAUto)

Subject: Your Ref: GZ 1570U_ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 1570U / SLZ 5732) / OTHERS ON
01/10/2018

-" U U Aulo

- e Consulfants
SJda BA B Phe Lid

ST UBLAVE 1, #00-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX : (lb3) 62564313

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18018062/Aha3
01 NOVEMBER 2018

RIGHT ENGINEERING PTE LTD By Post and By Email
2 JALAN RAJAH

#07-04 GOLDEN WALL FLATTED FACTORY

SINGAPORE 329134

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 15700 f SLZ 5732) / OTHERS ON 01/10/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please call us if you have further queries,

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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SeRRER NW suve the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the scle use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not

1



read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

YourRef: gz15700

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Rd

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Dear Sirs,

Accident involving SLZ5732] and_ GZ1570U
on0l.10.18 at Slip Rd of CTE twds City

I/WWe am/are the owner/s of vehicle number SLZ5732].

Ie had instructed KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD to make a claim on my/our
behalf against your company in respect of the abovementioned matter.

I/We hereby authorize you to issue the settlement cheque in favour of my/our
workshop, KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD in full and final settlement of my/our
claim for my/our repair cost and loss of use/rental charges, in respect of the above
accident.

Yours faithfully,

KELVIN & GERALDINE
# CoRegNo: 53358675E

KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE. LTD.

{
e [ LT T T ——

Witnessed b‘_'f:__'Krh:-ng Chin Watt
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" KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-06 AUTOBAY @KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883

TEL: 67477636, 67473005 FAX: 67485071 Email: kangcar@singnet.com.sg
Co. Reg. No. 2013002018 GST Reg. No. 201300201

M/S . CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD  Final No: KCR-INV1900046
3 ANSON ROAD Claim No: ESTI800305
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER Date: 30 Jan 2019
SINGAPORE 079909 Policy No: 5100612169

TEL: 63896111 FAX: 62247175 Veh Reg No: SLZ5732)

ATTMN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model: HONDA SHUTTLE

HYBRID 1.3A

Your Ret No: GZ1570U Chassis No: GP71208522

Claim Type: Third Party Engine No: LEB6550408

Accident Date:  O1/10/2018 Reg. Date: 09/05/2018

TP Veh Reg No: GZ1570U
Tax Invoice to Vehicle No :SLZ5732J

Padakl

Description | Quantity | List Price Amount
55 S8

As recommended by survevor o proceed repair at total cost/lumpsum cost 5% 7.450.00

Add GST @ 7% 521.50

Total Amount payable 5% 7.971.50

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR SEVEN THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED SEVENTY ONL AND CENTS
FIFTY ONLY

For Kang Car Repairers Pre Ltd

&

Y

E. & 0. E. AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



BKW

RENT-A-GAR

TAX INVOICE

GST REG. NO.: 2001062760

TOTAL

INVOICE TO DATE INVOIGE NO.
TING MING LIANG KELVIN 16-0c1-2018 A 38329
RLK 216A
COMPASSVALE DRIVE
#O4-338
SINGAPORE 541216

VHA NO, DUE DATE VEH. NO
A 38329 16-Oet-2018 SLEK 34564
DESCRIPTION NO. OF DAYS RATE AMOUNT
RENTAL FROM 01 OCTOBER 2018 TO 08 OCTOBER 20138 7 112.15 TR5.05
YOUR REF; SLZ 5732
GST@ 7% $54.95
$840.00

All chegues must be made payvable to BKW Rent A Car Pie Lid
Pleave write the vehicle and invaice number an the reserve,

BKW Rent-A-Car Pte Ltd

120 Lower Delta Road #02-15 Cendex Centre (5) 169208 Tel: 6738 7777

GST Reg. No: 20-0106276-D

ACRA No: 2001062760
f BKW Automobile Pte Ltd

A subsid:ary of

777 Fax: 6738 6666

Wehsite: www.bkw.sg

pirSAFE




120 Lower Delta Road #02-15 Cendex Centre Singapore 169208 Tel: 8738 7777 Fax. Gr38 6666 yHA NO: A 3 8 3 2 9
ACRA No: 20-0106278-D° GST Reg. No: 20-0108278-0

44 HOURS HELPLINE : 6223 1122
VEHICLE HIRING AGREEMENT

BKW ﬁENT A CAR PTE LTD
KW

; i
HIRER'S PARTICULARS ﬁirew‘s Own Vehicle No: Replace Veh No; |
Mame (asin G} A 3 b i | Loan Yehicle Mo: VR No: 1]
NRIC/Passport Mo, Date of Birth T DL I Make & Model: Auto/Manual Group:
Address: _ ' - Ay CHARGES : 5 cts
b -y El:_ Jidks ) - " —
Daily ] day @$ Per day |
Mame & Address of Employer____ ;
WaeklyManthiy week @3 Per week/Monthly
Qwcupation Drving Expt | | Ghers % =
P P Manthl
Driving Licenca No: L ParsedDatec'c EWI 4 es " dey \“I_ e
| DA Type: LacalintiOthers: _ | | Detivery/Collection Svc
|h.T1.:I|;D:| S LML . HP | GST
DRIVER'S PARTICULARS OR No: {A) SUB-TOTAL |
e  oE 1 17 304 F 3
Mame {#s in WG] . FmralaLml CI'UT!"
MRIC/Passport No: Dafe of Birth: Surcharge | |N .
i — —Agei____ First_______ km FREE per day asT ,
A J Excess mileage is chargeabla ol | E
|-t cenisperkm TOTAL CHARGES |
DOccupatsan Diriving Exp. ¥is ) -y
e =
Driving LicencaMo: _____« Passed/Expiry Date: ___ = Security Deposit : § Bank:
Sl i == aa I ——— | CASHINETSVISAMC/AMEX/CHQ No:
e = y =
Expiry Date: Card 1D No:
Mama as in Card:
MON WAIVER EXCESS (Subject to GST): 5 F|
ACCESSORIES CHECK '
] Data Cards O Camera Systems [ Hub Cap [ Radia/ CD Cartridge
J Jack 1 Tyre Opener J Petral Cap ] Spare Tyre
| <0
INDICATE: {
& - Aocidans e = —
D~ Dants e Hirer's Si . : I :
B ks o= irer's Signature Additional Driver's Signalture

=== O  —

| have read and agres to thaterms and condition onboth sides of this agreement, If | hava presented a chargsfmiait card for payment. | agree that all amounts ]
payable under this agreement and for parking and traffic infringements may be hilled to that account and my signature above will be considered fo have been
\made on the chargelcradit card voucher. All information | have been given BKW Rent & Car Pte Ltd in connection with this agreement iz true

i~ IMPORTANT tice 2l pis o full F e

SINGAPORE Use Only

-t e

i

i

v hasmw), whaisoever an:

Date_Duf : Time Qut | nileage Chack By ! _Eemarlis- | W ;3

b | | g : fll | - Hirer's/Dirhiar Shgratura J

~ Ratum OFf Vehicle: The Hier Driver |5 Required To Sign In The Column *Signature Of Hirer Driver Failing Which The Day And Tima Inaerted Balow Shall Be Deemed To Ba The
Day And Time The Vehicle Is Returned To BKW Rent A Car Pie Ltd And The Same Shall B Accepted As Condusive Evidance Of The Same And Shall Not Be Challenged Or

Questidned On Any Account Whatscever. And | had cleared my belonging items from the rental vahicle (cashcard, parking coupons, eic)”
Dateln | Timelm | Mieage |  CheckBy Remarks {

1 = 3 =t 3

7 & '] Iy Hirer'sDiriver Signature A,




invoice Page 1 of 2

A GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
[ ""GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

' 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

\em INSURANCE -rrone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

S AssoclaTion Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm
i i : 0
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE OST Registration No: M400017738

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No. GR-18-151363
Date of Request: 01102018 Your Ref No. Online Purchase

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
Mo 1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#02-08 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 01/10/2018

Enquiry By Yea Mei Cheng

TP Vehicle No GZ157T0U

Accident Date 01/10/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
GZ1570U China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid 03/01/2018-02/01/2019 {63BO 6111
Thank You,

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or In connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp g... 1/10/2018



Invoice
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RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-18-151363
Date of Request: o1/M1Qr2018

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
Mo 1 Kaki Bukit Ave B

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Cperating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Online Purchase

#02-06 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 01/10/2018

Enquiry By Yee Mei Cheng

TP Vehicle No. GZ1570U

Accident Date 011072018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRC [ ] Cash [ ] Chegue

https:.l’fsinj.r.apore.merimen.cnrna’claimsfindex.cfm?fuscbﬂx=MTRsas&ﬁJse&ctiun=dsp g... 1/10/2018



