Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2018 9:11 AM
To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'; SUR
Subject: RE: SLA 1888B

Dear Gerald,

There is no modification for the mentioned vehicle.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2018 8:19 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLA 1888B

Dear Gerald,
According to surveyor, the item mentioned is not original fitted by agent, is after market.

But not under illegal modification by LTA.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 14 November 2018 7:20 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLA 1888B

Dear Veron,

Kindly verify with the surveyor also if it is not fitted by the manufacturer but it is
fitted by the owner, does it means modification of the vehicle.

Best Regards



Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 13 November, 2018 11:19 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: SUR

Subject: FW: SLA 1888B

Dear Gerald,

We will check and revert.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 10:22 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject:

Dear Veron,

Can check with your surveyor if the parts show in attached photo (circle) comes together in
original condition ?

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



