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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, October 02, 2018 10:01 AM
To: Kitty Teo Poh Guek

Cc: HO Kow Wai; SUR

Subject: RE: COE _SKA 519K

Dear Kitty,

The market value for SKA 519K is $15k - $17k (Est) as at October 2018.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: HO Kow Wai [mailto:kowwai.ho@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, October 01, 2018 8:55 PM

To: bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; frankie @fta.com.sg; motorsurvey @fta.com.sg; benson@Ibs-
auto.com; nick@lbs-auto.com; KKLau <kklau@Ilkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>;
jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; ricky@rta.com.sg; elson@rta.com.sg; collin.weng@a-
pac.sg; patrick.soo@a-pac.sg; LKK Valuation <valuation@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Subject: FW: COE _ SKA 519 K

Dear partners,
As per attached, pls assist to check MV and forward your finding to MS Kitty Teo.
Tks.

From: Peiwen [mailto:peiwen@procarcare.com.sg] On Behalf Of Claims
Sent: Monday, October 01, 2018 4:03 PM

To: HO Kow Wai <kowwai.ho@axa.com.sg>

Subject: COE _ SKA 519 K

Hi Mr Ho,

Please refer to the attached.
Regards,

Pei Wen NG

Claims Advisory

Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd
Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 01-45/46 Singapore 408716



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner iD Wpe:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Qriginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE Periad(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained hereinis correct as at 28 Sep 2018

hitps://vrl lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput /FUN...

Foreign |dentification Number
6568Q

SKA519K

Yes

285ep 2018

TOYQTA

CAMRY 2.0 AUTO ABS AIRBAG
Beige

2009

1AZE131454
MRO53BK4107043421
108.0 kW (144 bhp)
$25,948.00

25 Mar 2009

25 Mar 2009

2

$25,948.00

Yes
24 Mar 2019
$12,974.00

24 par 2019

E - Open Category
10

$3,000.00

$33.00
$13,007.00
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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: HO Kow Wai <kowwai.ho@axa.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, October 01, 2018 8:55 PM
To: bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; frankie@fta.com.sg;

motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; benson@lbs-auto.com; nick@lbs-auto.com; KKLau; Olivia Lau
(LKKAuto); jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg;
ricky@rta.com.sg; elson@rta.com.sg; collin.wong@a-pac.sg; patrick.soo@a-pac.sg; LKK

Valuation
Cc: TEO Kitty
Subject: FW: COE _SKA 519K
Attachments: 28092018125011-0017 - Copy.tif

Dear partners,
As per attached, pls assist to check MV and forward your finding to MS Kitty Teo.
Tks.

From: Peiwen [mailto:peiwen@procarcare.com.sg] On Behalf Of Claims
Sent: Monday, October 01, 2018 4:03 PM

To: HO Kow Wai <kowwai.ho@axa.com.sg>

Subject: COE _ SKA 519 K

Hi Mr Ho,
Please refer to the attached.
Regards,

Pei Wen NG

Claims Advisory

Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 01-45/46 Singapore 408716
T:+65 6741 5336 | F:+656741 7208

E: claims@procarcare.com.sg

W: www.procarcare.com.sg

PRUOGRESSIVE

CAR CAREPTELTD

*With effect from 1 Sep 2018, Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd has been rebranded as Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd. You
may now reach us at our new email addresses (@procarcare.com.sg). We look forward to your continued support.

----- Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you
are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you
have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented
in this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd



