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From: Vie (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January, 2019 12:07 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: SHC4278DS - Survey (Lonpac) Qur Ref: To Be Advised

LKK RER CC4/LPC18018016/Nha3

Dear Gerald,

We refer to the subject matter.
Please be informed that we had settled the matter at global sum $1,570.00 (all in).

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)
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RARRER NWT Save the Earth- Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you,

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com)

Sent: Thursday, 27 December, 2018 8:40 AM

To: Vic [LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: SHC4278DS - Survey (Lonpac) Our Ref: To Be Advised LKK RER
CC4/LPC18018016/Nha3

Dear Vic,

Our reference is 18/18/18/VC00/020979

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com:>

Sant: Thursday, 27 December, 2018 8:40 AM

To: Vie (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: SHC4278DS - Survey (Lonpac) Our Ref: To Be Advised

LKK RER CC4/LPC18018016/Nha3

Dear Vic,

Our reference is 18/18/18/VC00/020979

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

P
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From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 26 December, 2018 6:01 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT _Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: SHC4278D5 - Survey (Lonpac) Our Ref: To Be Advised LKK RER
CC4/LPC18018016/Nha3

Dear Gerald,
Noted with thanks.

Please advise your claim reference.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sendar that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 26 December, 2018 3:56 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: SHC4278DS - Survey (Lonpac) Our Ref: To Be Advised LKK RER
CC4/LPC18018016/Nha3

Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
TqL:__{_ES} 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

St e The all (MW ) lonpac.com.sg

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 24 December, 2018 10:12 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: SHC4278DS - Survey (Lonpac) Our Ref: To Be Advised LKK RER
CC4/LPC18018016/Nha3

Your Ref: TBA
Our Ref: CC4/LPC18018016/Nha3

Dear Lili,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GW 9003D (OI) AND SHC 4278D (TP) ON 29/09/2018 ALONG BLOCK 15 UPPER
BOON KENG ROAD O5CP

We refer to the above matter.

We refer to the assignment dated 4™ October 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a clear-cut case where Insured vehicle rolled forward and collided to the parked TP vehicle. As such, liability is
not to our Insured’s favour.

We propose to offer to TP repairer “SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD" as below:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair S 2,326.80 s 480.33
Loss of Rental (5120.91 x 5.5 days) 5 665.01 s 665.01
Loss of Income ($76.71 x 5.5 days) 5 421.91 s 421.91 (based on ITR)
LTA Search Fee 5 7.00 5 7.00

P



TOTAL|$  3,420.72 |$ 1,574.25

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 2 days
Weekends / Downtime 3.5 days
TOTAL 5.5 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2066 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)
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SIS W Save the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 October, 2018 12:12 PM

To: 'ONG LI LI

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A; Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SHC4278DS - Survey (Lonpac) Our Ref: To Be Advised

LPCref: TBA
LKK REF: CC4/LPC18018016/Nua3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SHC 4278D
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

* TP estimated cost of repair

e Preliminary advice

]
Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.
3
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LETTER OF CLAIM

We claim on behalf of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD, owner of motor taxi no.: .
Your insured's negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has
suffered the following losses:-

1. Cost of Repair T : 3
2. Loss of Rental for _days @ S$_'~" '/ _iday $ (1501
3. Lossoflncomefor 7™ days@S$ 75 ! /day $ 1 4y
4. Police Report! SAS Report/ LTA Search Fee 3 03
5. Survey Fee 3 -
6. Others
Total Claims : 8| ¢ 4 )
We enclose the following documents:-
Repair Invoice Vehicle laid-up report
Police Report/ SAS Report LTA Search result

Letter of Authorisation D Others
E:l Investigation results 1.
Proof of Loss of Use/Rentalllncome 2.

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this
letter Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

Yours sincerely,
SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
|

YU
{7
Selena Tan
For Manager, Claims
Claims Department
Direct line: 6BGE 2653
Email address: tanselena@smrt.com.sg

FR-AS-CLM-02 REV 2



L2 &5 SIMRT

ALTOMOTIVE

Date: |};o/;{);€’

Dur Ref. No.:

|etter of Authorisation

I, _Sod wWek CHigng 2?4}1*440:»!3) (NRIC No.: JANUSIIL ) the
registered hirer / relief driver / contract hirer of SMRT taxi registration number
SHC423¢ D hereby authorise SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
(“AutoSvs”) to deal with all matters arising out of the accident between my taxi
and  Aaw 9003 P happened on _+§ _upper 2‘1‘%}??
along__open Cetpark IS wpper Roou keuq W d | éuﬁw\
(the “Accident”) on my behalf, including but not limited to mstltuhglg and any claims or
proceedings against such party or parties (as AutoSvs deems fit in its absolute

discretion) in respect of any claim, demand, loss, cost, expense, liability, damages or

action made against us or incurred or suffered by us.

Without prejudice to the foregoing, | further authorise AutoSvs to negotiate, resolve
and settle any proceeding or claim arising out of the accidents, including but not limited
to doing any act or executing any document or signing the Discharge Voucher on my

behalf as may be required.

Name  :S°H '€k CHimng @4

NRICNo. :..2dMS732LZ . .

Tel No, o dz2055 13

Addioes G Lot eerdy B HOFL O i
...... LI 48075 S,

FR-AS-CLM-03 REV 3



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

I/'We. SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (the third party claimant”) of 60 WOODLANDS
INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 (8)757705 (address). owner of SHC 4278D (vehicle no.)
hereby authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™)

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use
(“claim™) for my vehicle no SHC 4278D that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on 29/09/2018 (date) along UPPER BOON KENG ROAD OSCP
{location) invalving vehicle no/s GW 9003D (“the accident™).

I/We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner
that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to
settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT

TAXIS PTE LTD.

I/We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf
is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the

driver/ownerfinsurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Al

Dated this > %\ (day)of ______| (month) 2618 (year)
Signed by “the third party claimant”™ Signed by ““the workshop™

(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 18/18/18/VC00/020979
DATE : 27 DECEMBER 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of GW 9003D the sum of Singapore Dollars
One Thousand Five Hundred Seventy Only ($1.570.00) in full and final satisfaction,
liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the said M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by me/us
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from
an accident to my vehicle, SHC 4278D on 29 SEPTEMEBR 2018 along UPPER
BOON KENG ROAD OSCP.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (YATAI SECURITY &
COMMUNICATIONS PTE LTD / LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all
claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in
respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S SMRT
TAXIS PTE LTD.

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action,

........... R N R N R R TN |

Signature of vehicle ownet/Date 1|1} 14"

Name of vehicle owner/Date R A\



SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
stT 251 Morth Bridge Road Singapore 179102
Tel: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247
AUTOMOTIVE

Tax Invoice
GST Reg No. 1 MR-B500001-7

Customer Code: 3000063

CRHN : 1990042802
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD Invoice Mo. : IV1BL100066
Date : 04.11.2018
Block Unit Vehicle Hao. : SHC4278D

Your Ref No. : TAX/08/18/2144

60 WOODLENDS INDUSTRIARL PARK E Cur Ref No. : 24088136

SINGRPOEE 757705 Texrms : 30 Days
Description Qty Unit Add / (Discount) Amount
Cost ] Bmount

Parts

COVER; FR BUMFER 1.00 5 455,50 (100.00) S 495.50 S 0.00

BRACKET, FR BUMPER 0.00 3 099,80 0.00 = 0.00 5 0.00

NUMBER FLATE 1.00 5§ 15.00 0.00 8 0.00 5 15.00

NUMBEER FLATE FRAME 0.00 5 12.00 0.00 3 0.00 E} 0.00

ABSORBER, FR BUMPER 0.00 5 70.30 0.00 8 0.00 5 0.00

EEINFORCEMENT FRONT UPPER 0.00 5 &91.10 0.00 5 0.00 s 0.00

EMBLEM ASSY FRONT 1.00 § T.10 (25.00 ) s 21.77 5 65.33

Sub-Total ] BO.33

Labour b

TO REPAIR FRONT BH PORTION 1.00 5 200.00Q 0.00 5 0.00 s 200.00

Others

TO REFSRAY FRONT BUMPER 1.00 5 2040.040 0.00 = 0.00 = 200.00

TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION 0.00 5 80.00 0.00 3 .00 5 Q.00

TO WASH AND VACUUM 0.00 % 60.00 0.00 5 0.00 =} 0.00
CRAND TOTAL 3 480,33

Femark

Make /Model : PRIUS4
Accident Date : 29.09.2018

W.B, Fayment by chegue should be crossed and

made payable to 'SMRT Automotive Services Fte Ltd'.
Mo receipt will be issued unless requested. fl/"h,f1 5?{:)

Buthorised Signature
for SMRT Automotiwve Services Fte Litd

Page 1/1 E. & Q.E
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SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Ref:  TAX/09/18/2144/ST
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: 17.10.2018

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC4278D & GW9003D ON 29.9.2018
ALONG OPEN CARPARK AT 15 UPPER BOON KENG ROAD

This is to certify that Mr. Soh Wee Chiang Raymond of IC No. S71159321 is the
registered hirer of the above taxi no. SHC4278D.

This is also to confirm that the daily rental rate for SHC4278D
is $120.91..

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
AX%IS PTE LTD

SMR:I;.:F
Pl

phl>
s

T

for Manager



ANITNA Wihirle Flidk

~ Enquire Transaction History

Lopg Dated Time: 07 Oct 2018/ 08:31:57
Masel Type: Wizhicle Transaction Amaunt: §7.49
Aszet I GWRN03D
Transaction Type: 18.372 Insurance Enguiry [GIRO Payment)  Channel: External Agency
: - | : i i 3
UseriD: ESASRAHD - BALOQISH BINTE ABDUL Business Transaction 20184002083157063866
HALINL Reference Mo
Search Late / Time: 29 Sep 2018 13:00:00
Insurance Company: LOMPAC IMSURANCE BHD
Infermatinn displayed s correct as at the log date and time
Enquirc Related Logs Back to List
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L 5 OTHER
4 S'PORE(§)  COUNTRIES (3)
 TRADE 28,0000
TOTAL INCOME 28,000.00
ASSESSABLE INCOME
1 LESE PERSONAL RELIEFS i 3
g %j_"’”  Earned Income ERESH (1,000,000
ARl “NSman-ssitwitelparent | - 1,500.00
 Provident Fund/Life Insurance 263,00
TGTAL PE'RSQH.AL RELIEFS
CHARGEABLE INCOME : _
FIRST £,237.00 @ 2.00% ! 1 L [ ol 9

TAX PAYABLE BY 02 JUN 2018

Thank you for your contribution towards nation bullding

i [

TOTAL (%)
28,000.00

E,E,_DDD.OD
28,000.00

2,763.00

25.237.00
104.74

104.74 DR
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