Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Alice,

We refer to your below email.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 2 January 2019 3:43 PM

‘Alice Leong'

RE: ACCIDENT ON 03.10.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD2503L & SHB6241B *LKK
REF: CC4/11118018010/T1pb3

Statement of SHB 6241B.pdf; SHD 2503L vs SHB 6241B - Ol VIDEO.MP4

We attached here with a copy of our insured accident statement and video footage for your easy
reference. The video shows that our insured vehicle was stationary and suddenly there was a jerk/ impact
on his taxi. We are of the view that our insured statement is more credible. Your client had collided onto our

insured’s taxi from behind.

In view of the above, we regret to inform you that we have our principal to deny liability and unable to look

into your client’s claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Alice Leong <aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 3:24 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT ON 03.10.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD2503L & SHB6241B

Importance: High
Hi Hsiao Tong,

Our below e-mail refer.

2"d Reminder

For swift & amicable settlement, please let us have your offer on or before 08/01/2019.

Thank you

Alice Leong

Manager, Motor Claims



Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927

T (65): 6861 0908 1 F (65) 65152948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer

This e-mail (including all attachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system.
You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com]

Sent: 19 December, 2018 5:23 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Zuhaidah Samsuri <aida@iii.com.sg>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT ON 03.10.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD2503L & SHB6241B
Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong, 1*' Reminder

Understanding this file was taken over by you.

For swift & amicable settlement, please establish liabilities & quantum on urgent basis.
Thank you

Alice Leong

Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927

T (65): 6861 0908 1 F (65) 6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer

This e-mail (including all attachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system.
You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com]

Sent: 14 November, 2018 3:45 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Zuhaidah Samsuri <aida@iii.com.sg>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT ON 03.10.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD2503L & SHB6241B
Importance: High

Hi Thin Thin,

Our below e-mail referred.

For swift & amicable settlement, please establish liabilities & quantum
Thank you

Alice Leong



Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927

T (65): 6861 0908 1 F (65) 65152948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer

This e-mail (including all attachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system.
You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com]

Sent: 01 November, 2018 5:26 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Zuhaidah Samsuri' <aida@iii.com.sg>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT ON 03.10.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD2503L & SHB6241B
Importance: High

Hi Thin Thin,

Our LOD dated 18.10.2018 referred.
Please establish liabilities & quantum.
Thank you

Alice Leong

Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927

T (65): 6861 0908 1 F (65) 65152948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer

This e-mail (including all attachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system.
You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com]

Sent: 22 October, 2018 11:49 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Zuhaidah Samsuri' <aida@iii.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 03.10.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD2503L & SHB6241B
Importance: High

Hi Thin Thin,
The above referred.
Your appointed surveyor Mr. Taufikh had surveyed our client’s vehicle on 11.10.2018

For swift & amicable settlement, please establish liabilities on urgent basis



Thank you

Alice Leong

Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927

T (65): 6861 0908 1 F (65) 65152948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer

This e-mail (including all attachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system.
You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.



