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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 25 October, 2018 9:04 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SJE7655U & SKT6761L DOA 2.10.2018

Attachments: GIA.pdf; RENTAL.pdf; SD.pdf

Dear Vic ,  

 

Enclosed is our GIA , INVOICE , RENTAL & LOA . 

As request following :  

 

1. RC    $ 2675 ( $2500 + 7% GST ) -AS AGREED  

2. LOR $1170 ( $130 X 9 DAYS - 5 days recommend + 1 day waiting period + 1 day weekend ) 7 days   

@ 100% ( direct from behind )  

 

Total $ 3845/-.  

 

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks  

 

 
Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

ZEN WERKZ LLP    
  

HP: 92712214 

 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, October 5, 2018 9:39 AM 

To: chan pick yuen 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: SJE7655U GIA report  

  
Dear Chris, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that we are currently pending for OI GIA report. 

  

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

Thank you 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 4 October 2018 5:02 PM 

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SJE7655U GIA report  

  

Dear Shu Pei ,  

  

Enclosed is GIA .  

Please advise your OIC & claim number .  

please check & confirm liability . Thanks  

  
Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

ZEN WERKZ LLP   

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  


