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1142018 PARFICOF Rahata Frnnine

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 2526E
Y3 0 T 1 O 551 e M o o T e o R AR |

Vehicle No.: SKZ3A

Vehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended Deregistration Date: 01 Nov 2018

Vehicle Make: LAMBORGHINI

Vehicle Model: HURACAN LP&10-4
Primary Colour: Orange

Manufacturing Year: 2015

Engine No.: CsJ005199

Chassis Mo.: ZHWEC1ZF2GLADA127
Maximum Power Qutput: 449.0 kW (602 bhp)
Open Market Value: $246,900.00

Original Registration Date: 16 Jul 2016

First Registration Date: 16 Jul 2016

Transfer Count: 4]

Actual ARF Paid: $416,420.00

e PARE Reba e A e e e L S e

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 15 Jul 2026

PARF Rebate Amount: $312.315.00

COE Expiry Date: 15 Jul 2026

COE Category: E - Open Category

COE Period{¥ears): 10

QP Paid: $57,390.00

COE Rebate Amount; $43,922.00
Total Rebate Amount: $356,237.00

The informaticn contained herein is correct as at 01 Nov 2018
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Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto) - .

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=
Sent: Wednesday, 14 November 2018 4:12 PM

To: soonkiat.scoh@crawford.comsg

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: Motor surveyor

Dear Mr Soh,

Refer to our conversation earlier, we have checked with the repairer, the vehicle still under repair and
awaiting spare parts arrival by air flight.

The repair cost is not concluded yet. Expected time of arrival is about 1 months.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg [mailto:soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 10:22 AM

To: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Motor surveyor

Hi Shirley

Is the repair concluded?

Any issue pertaining to the repair and look forward to your conclude report.

Kindly contact me should you have any queries.

Soh Soon Kiat « LLE MBA Dip. 5C! {(General) = Manager = Singapora

Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd = & Shenton Way, #03-01 AXXA Tower, 062811, Singapore

Direct: +B5 6632 85638 « Mobile: +65 9634 0429 » Office: +65 6632 8600 » Fax: +65 6632 8040 = Email:
soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg = Web Site: www.crawfordandcompany.com




Shirle! Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 3:00 PM

To: soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg

Cc assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

CSubject: RE: Motor surveyor

Attachments: SKZ 3A - Preli Advise pdf

Dear Mr. Soh,

As spoken, enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKZ 3A.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhl Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 9:37 AM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; 'soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg' <soonkiat.sch@crawford.com.sg>;
'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Motor surveyor

Dear Mr. Soh,

According to the repairer, the said vehicle has not commence to repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 22 October 2018 7:18 PM

To: soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Ce: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Motor surveyor

Dear Mr Soh,

Please be informed that survey done on 19.10.2018, we will revert to you shortly.
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Dear Shirley,

Kindly assist. Our Ref: C5/CWF18017982/R1sb

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6741-8434 | email: assignmentsi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg [mailto:soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 22 October, 2018 8:50 AM

To; Admin-D <admin-d@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: Motor surveyor

Hi Catherine

How is the survey at Eurosport?

Kindly contact me for a discussion.

Soh Soon Kiat = LLE MBA Dip. 5C {General) = Manager = Singapore

Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd « 2 Shenton Way, #03-01 AXXA Tower, 0bBE11, Singapore

Direct: +65 6632 3638 » Mobile: +65 9634 0429 « Office: +65 6632 B0OD » Fax: +65 6632 8040 « Email:
sponkiat. soh@crawford.com.sg « Web Site: www.crawfordandcompany.com

From Soon Kiat Soh/'SG/Crawco-AP

To "Cathering Chang VLKK Auto\)” <admin-di@ikkaute com>@CRAWCO-AP
Date 1TM0F2018 0214 AM

Subject RE: Motor surveyaor

Catherine

Kindly let me know the date and time of the survey at Eurosport.

Soh Soon Kiat » LLE MEA Dip. 5CI (General) » Manager = Singapore

Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd « & Shenton Way, #03-01 AXXA Tower, 068811, Singapore
Direct; +65 6632 8638 » Mobile: +65 9634 0429 « Office; +65 6632 8600 » Fax: +65 6632 8040 « Email
sponkiat soh@crawford.com.sg » Web Site: www.crawfordandcompany.com




From "Gatherine Chong YLKK Auto\)” <admin-d@kkaute.com>

Te: =goponkial sohf@orawiord com eq>. =gggignments @ikkaulo com>
Ce 'SUR' < Ik COm

Crate: 03M0/2018 1112 AM

Subject; RE: Motor sunveyor

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Kindly assist provide us the contact number for the person in-charge at Eurckars Auto Pte Ltd.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-84434 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408633)

From: soonkiat.sohi@crawford.com.sg [mailto:soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg)
Sent: Wednesday, 3 October, 2018 5:55 AM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com
Subject: Motor surveyor

Hi Serene Fong
We refer to our telephone conversation on the matter.

We look forward to your appointment of motor surveyor familiar with such type vehicle for survey and assessment of
the repair quantum.

Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries and kindly maintain confidentiality of the
assignment.

Soh Soon Kiat » LLB MBA Dip. SCI {General) = Manager = Singapore

Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd = 8 Shenton Way, #03-01 AXXA Tower, 068811, Singapore
Direct: +65 6632 B635 = Mobile: +65 9634 0429 = Office:; +65 6632 8600 = Fax: +65 6632 8040 « Email
soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg « Web Site: www.crawfordandecompany.com

Please think of the environment before printing out this message.

This message and any files transmitted with it may contain confidential, proprietary or legally privileged information
and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. No confidentiality or privilege is
waived or lost by any mistransmission. If you have received this message in error, please immediately delete it and all
copies of it from your system, destroy any hard copies of it and notify the sender. You must not review or in any way
use or publish the content to any party. Crawford reserves the right to monitor communications through its network.

Please think of the environment before printing out this message.
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Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October, 2018 9:59 AM
To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Subject: Maotor surveyor

Attachments: 02102018135038-0001.pdf

Hi Serene Fong
We refer to our telephone conversation on the matter.

We look forward to your appointment of mator surveyor familiar with such type vehicle for survey and assessment of
the repair quantum.

Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries and kindly maintain confidentiality of the
assignment.

Soh Soon Kiat « LLE MBA Dip, 5C1 {General) » Manager = Singapore
Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd = 8 Shenton Way, #0301 AXXA Tower, DERE11, Singapare
Direct: +65 6632 8638 » Mobile: +65 9634 0429 « Office: +65 6632 8600 « Fax: +65 6632 8040 » Email

sponkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg + Web Site: www.crawforda ndcompany.com

Please think of the environment before printing out this message.

This message and any files transmitted with it may contain confidential, proprietary or legally privileged information
and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. No confidentiality or privilege is
waived or lost by any mistransmission. If you have received this message in error, please immediately delete it and all
copies of it from your system, destroy any hard copies of it and notify the sender. You must not review or in any way
use or publish the content to any party. Crawford reserves the right to monitor communications through its network.
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A B ™ Prolid Company Registration No. 199607 198R

[

S5 UBRIAVE 1, #02.25 PAVA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAFORE 405933 TEL : (065 62363561 FAX 1 (065) 6256435

Your Ref; NIL Date: 22 October 2018

Our Rel: CS/CWFEF18017982/R1sh

The Motor Claims Department
Crawford & Company International Pl

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SKZ 3A .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 19/10/2018 at the premises of M/s Eurosports Auto Pte Ltd and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 85 33.306.00
Revised Estimate Amount ;55 27.906.00
“Check” Items Amount : 8% 3.000.00
Market Value 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value : 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 4 Days

Yours faithfully,
Mohammed Rasul
Automotive Assessor



EUROSPORTS AUTO PTE LTD

24 Leng Kee Road. #01-03, Singapore 159096
TEL : (65) 6565 5995 FAX: (65) 6567 5515

Repair Quotation 08-10-18

Lamborghini Huracan - SKZ 3A

Parts

W =

b
o
o
=

BN =

Qty Price

4T0807103C FRONT BUMPER cR” Broken 1§ 7,500
470898085 AERODYNAMIC KIT HURACAN (H,Brr:rken 1 $ 15,456
Bumper Brackets and Clips g / Nec $ 650

O
To dismantle and ReFit all Parts 6 16 3600
To do Respray Paint on Front Bumper and Spoiler Kit $ 15002000
Lost Of Use-$200.00 PerDay x15Days o/ -le ) $ 7. 8000
Front Bumper Stone Film n e 1,200
Sub-Total d 33,306
GST $ 2,331
TOTAL $ 35,637
FA __?:"'L'p'

1 This is only an estimate,shouid any additional work be found necessary in the course s y@kii
of work,extra material and labour,cost will be charged accordingly for which you will |’ \Tﬂ
be informed prior to action taken. | [\

2 All materials prices quoted are subject to change without notification VoA N
3 All repairs are subject to spare parts availability U-‘(_, L2
4 Quotation valid for one month from date of issue. H]O qﬂg [0© 6%'

Lamborghini Singapore 4— JU?A

Workshop Contact:

Ising Lee ?,[7

Service Advisor 6

Hfmlg% @ (>0

Resey vt P



I V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

St SAS & 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933

_—r TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607 198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

CRAWFORD & COMFANY INTERNATIONAL PL Rel CSICWF18017982/R1sbs2

#0301 AXATOWERSINGAPORE 068811 DRl RRVIER ” |||ﬂ‘"”"|||“l“"‘|
Code: CWF
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. UNENOWN VEHICLE Veh. Inspected SKZ 3A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 1089965/55K Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SOH SOON KIAT Assign Date 03M10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model LAMBORGHINI HURACAMN c.C 5204
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. ZHWEC1ZF2GLADA 2T Colour ORANGE
Odometer 016000 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/30ZR20 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/30ZR20 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/30ZR20 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 245/30ZR20 PIRELLI & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date Ilnspection Date 18/10/2018
Survey held at 24 LENG KEE RD #01-03
Repairer EUROSPORTS AUTO PTELTD
5a. Remarks
A)THE VEHICLE HAS NOT SEND IN FOR REPAIR.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTII".IM.TED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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AJS BE B

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKZ 3A

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Fage No.:1 of 1

(REPAIR COST NOT CONCLUDE)

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER CRACKED 7,500.00 7,500.00
1|AERODYNAMIC KIT HURACAN CRACKED 15,456.00 15,456.00
1|BUMPER BRACKETS AND CLIPS NECESSARY 650.00 650.00
1|FRONT BUMPER STONE FILM NECESSARY 1,200.00 1,200.00
24 806.00 24,806 00
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE AND REFIT ALL PARTS. 3,500.00 1,600.00
TO DO RESPRAY PAINT ON FRONT BUMPER AND 2,000.00 1,500.00
SPOILER KIT
5,500.00 3,100.00
GRAND TOTAL 30,306.00 27,906.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 27,906.00

Report Ref No. CS/CWF18017982/R1sbs2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE, AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAMMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Reporl.
fort. s accepted to any third party who may reply onthe Ropo

Report. in whele o In part. does 50 at




