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Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.
Jun Taiyo Service Centre

No. 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705
Tel : 64663022 Fax: 68966591

Co. Reg.No. 199400389N GST Reg.No, M2-011899-3

VEHICLE ESTIMATE dated 02/10/2018

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD ACCIDENT DATE  : 20/09/2018 @ 19:25
VRN : SLR2922P
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT MODEL : TOYOTA VOXY HYBRID
TP VRN : SHD3672A
_——— —— == — B
Qty S8 Unit S$ Amt §§ Labor
PARTS REPLACEMENT
1. epair
_—
/1 REARBUMPER 1°®* 7~ 1§ 55000 § 1550.00
2 REAR TOW HOOK COVER sut <~ 1 8 4500 § 45.00
3 REAR BUMPER CLIPS pea-~ s 10§ 550 $ 55,00
* 4 RR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER INNER RIL®“ I 2’ § 00D $  160.00
5 RR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER OUTER RIL%> |,:.).’ g §  180.00
6 RR BUMPER REFLECTORRIL (s 7 ﬁf-.,Z’ $ g;l_?% $§  156.00
7 RR BUMPER END PANEL ['egeu 1§ 00-—$— -715.00 -
B RRBUMPERROD T An 1 8 21500 _§ - 215.00
5 § 209500
Discount -25% Qﬂ L Gy § 52375
Fp Yoot S 157125
Special Nett
9 REVERSE SENSOR MV 18 c[ﬂ‘-{) 1 8 20000 8 20000 X
o8 7(f 5 200.00
10 REAR FENDER LH Repair
_—l .k et e ol ﬂ?l“‘ikglt"; o .
PARTS TOTAL — 8§ 1, 771.25 —

2. Labour Charges

Panel Beat, Cut, Weld, Re-align & Replace Damaged Parts Of Affected Area

Putty, Blend And Spray Paint on Affected Area

Remove and Refit Rear End Panel Lining and Garnish to Facilitate Rapair

Remnove and Reinstall Reverse Sensors

No. of repair days:

10

LABOURS TOTAL

CUSTOMER SIGNATURE

LUK Ayto Congultants hence nofify
the Repairer of the faliowing:
* Ta rgsuruey £y painling
* To dieplay damagod pari{n) dusing reaurvey
= Faris pricos are subject i confinmation
= Third party survey s on a “Withou: P refugics” s
= No fligal modifcation's) & allewsd
= Supplamentary lems) snost be ssasrygyed andl
3 sabect o final appoorva from |asurngs Ca Ky

Acanowlediied by Reasier
Signalura:
Dirla:

$ev 5 150000

€0 § 135000
§%0 1

§ 60 126000

$ 3.020.00
Grand Total § 4,791.25
Add 7% GST : § 335.39
Nett Total $ 5126.64

HITACHI CAPTIAL ASIA PACIFIC PTE LTD

| (MANAGER)



Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.
Jun Taiyo Service Centre

No. 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

Tel : 64663022
Co. Reg.No. 199400399N GST Reg.No. M2-011898-3

Fax : 68966591

VEHICLE ESTIMATE dated 02/10/2018

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTELTD

ACCIDENT DATE

:20/09/2018 @ 19:25

VRN SLR2922P
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT MODEL : TOYOTA VOXY HYBRID
TP VRN - SHD3672A
Qty S$ Unit S$ Amt S$ Labor
PARTS REPLACEMENT
1. Body Repair
1{ REARBUMPER [=* 7 $ 55000 $ 55900
. 2 REAR TOW HOOK COVER st <~ 1 8 4500 § 45.00
3 REAR BUMPER CLIPS Ae~~" 10 § 550 8 55.00
4 RR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER INNER RLM* Ipe 2 § (B0.0D §  160.00
5 RR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER OUTER F!.f!_/i ,2’ $ % $  190.00
6 RR BUMPER REFLECTORRIL céa ~ ,2/ $ : $  156.00
7 RR BUMPER END PANEL “‘f““"’ 1 8 71500 5 715.00
8 RRBUMPERROD 7,y i1 1 8 21500 §  215.00
Discount -25% (y 5 §23.75
F’fr Y100 S 1.571.25
Special Nett
9 REVERSE SENSOR ¥e d ] 20000 $ 20000 XM
{ $  200.00
10 REAR FENDER LH Repair
u&lu\w €115 opal
PARTS TOTAL § 1.771.25

Zgabogr Charges

Resury bl

e

Panel Beat, Cut, Weld, Re-align & Replace Damaged Parts Of Affected Area o0 § 1 ,590/01]
Putty, Blend And Spray Paint on Affected Area
Remove and Refit Rear End Panel Lining and Garnish to Facilitate Repair $%o 15008
Remove and Reinstall Reverse Sensors

No. of repair days:

10

CUSTOMER SIGNATURE

LABOURS TOTAL

S0 $ 1,28000
$6n‘|,28‘ﬁi]

§ 302000

Grand Total : § 479125
Add 7% GST : $§ 335.39
Nett Total $ 512664

HITACHI CAPTIAL ASIA PACIFIC PTELTD
(MANAGER)



'Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim <Jamilahbegum@hecspl.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 12:02 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: SLR2922P DOA: 20/08/2018 - LOD

Dear Poh Kin,

Offer accepted.
Acceptance without prejudice to Injury/medical claim if any.

Thank you & regards,

lamilah

Auo Servicing

l'otal Vehicle Solutions Department

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Lid.

Tun Taiyo Service Centre (Automobile Leasing & Workshop)
8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

1: H833 6265

¢: jumilahbepum@hespl.com.sg

w: www.hitachi-capital.com.sg

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@Ilkkauto.com=>

Sent: Friday, May 10, 2019 5:40 PM

To: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim <jamilahbegum{@hcspl.com.sg>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLR2922P DOA: 20/09/2018 - LOD

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE ASTO COSTS

Our Ref: CC4/I1180178758/R1fa3
Your Ref: SLR 2922P

Dear Jamilah,
We refer to above matter and your letter of demand.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have
instruction from our principal to offer settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair (w/gst) SS 2,219.18
2. Loss of Use (S100.00 x 4 days) S 400.00
S5 2,619.18

kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.



‘Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin [LKKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2013 5:40 PM

To: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: SLR2922P DOA: 20/09/2018 - LOD
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS
Our Ref: CC4/1118017879/R1fa3
Your Ref: 5LR 2922P

Dear Jamilah,
We refer to above matter and your letter of demand.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have
instruction from our principal to offer settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair (w/gst) S$ 2,219.18
2. Loss of Use ($100.00 x 4 days) SS  400.00
S5 2,619.18

kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
Intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatspever, should be deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liabllity/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin. Chong (Mr} | Case Handler
LER Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2142 | email: pohkinglkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

¥ IR chee
SesRsR mw Sowe bhe Lorthe Frint anly when necassary

Ihis &-mail contan confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distnbution by an
unintended recipiant is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belleve that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mall or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, Including any coples thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachmenlts and any copies thereof, Thank you



Poh Kin SI.KKAuto! e

From: Poh Kin (LEKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 5:10 PM

To: ‘Jlamilah, Binte MohdKassim'; Rasul {LEKAuto)
Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Finalisations for SLR 2922P

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC4/1111B017879/R1fa3
Your reft SLR 2922P

Dear Jamilah,
We refer to the above matter.

For COR, our surveyor had recommended amount P/P at $2,074.00 (before GST) with 4 repair days.

lease note that: All fi u : val.

*** Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act,
rental receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the lssues of liabllity/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chang (Mr) | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

YN
e =~ Save the Earth: Frint only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inlended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prahibited, and may be a violation of law. Il you believe that you received this e-maill in emor, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim [mailto:jamilahbegum@hespl.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 3:17 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-af@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Finalisations



1412010 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with

*SLR2922P (MCT18090568)
[SHD3672A]
TP
TEO CHER TECK
Sep 20 2018 T:00PM

-l
Hitachl Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (N_SG), sent on 10/05/2019 17:03 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$2619.18) - SLR2922P - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillal

Approved:2619.18,

hips Hsingapore mariman comfclaimsindex. cimusebox=SVCmailkluseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=527885534CF TOKEN=3al0diB0d07455b5-059155... 11



W 14/2018 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with

*SLR2922P (MCT18090568)
[SHD3672A]
T'P
TEO CHER TECK
Sep 20 2018 7:00PM

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Lid

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (II_SG), sent on 13/11/2018 10:00 AM,
To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (550.00) - SLR2922P - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillal

Approved:0.00.

Hi1ps {singapare. merimen.com/claims/index. cim Hlusebox=SVCmaill luseaction=dsp_PrntACFID=527885534CFTOKEN=3afldiB0d07455b5-059155

m



EM0/2018 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with -

*SLR2922P (MCT18090568)
[SHD3672A]
TP
TEO CHER TECK
Sep 20 2018 7:00PM

-l
Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte, Ltd

Frem india International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Il_SG), sent on 10/05/2019 17:03 PM.
To LKK_HO
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$2619,18) - SLR2922P - Clalm Handler: Sherini Pillal

ﬁ?}pruved :2619.18.

hitps /'singapore.merimen comicliimslindex.cfm Pusebox=3VCmaildluseaclion=dsp_PrintACFID=528423568CFTOKEN=40edd17303e11a884AC15... W1



*_Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Ce:

Subject:
Attachments;

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Motor Claim - |ll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Tuesday, 2 October 2018 10:15 AM

Catherine Chong (LKK Auto); ‘sur@lkkauto.com’; Olivia Lau (olivialau@lkkauto.com)
vion lim@eurokars.com.sg, Mekavathanan Sarangapani; Sherini Pillai

FW. SLR2922P / SHD3672A DOA: 20/9/2018 TP SURVEY & LIABILITY

SLR2922P pdf 10 am@ :]J o \g

Rain g NoN
vehide rot In

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLR2922P and let us have your report urgently

This claim will be handled by Ms Sherini

“fandly upload this survey request email 1o merimen

Thank You

Joel Nah
Motor Claims Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

B4 Cecil Street #04-02 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel 6347 6100 Ext 206 Fax: 6274 4174

From: Vonn, LM Siow [mailto:vonnim.siow@hcspl.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October, 2018 9:50 AM

To: Motor Claim - lll <matorclaim@iil.com.sg>

Cc: Mekavathanan Sarangapani <mekavathanan@Iii.com.sg>; JiongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>; Jamilah,
Binte MohdKassim <jamilahbegum@hcspl.com.sg>

Subject: SLR2922P / SHD3672A DOA: 20/9/2018 TP SURVEY & LIABILITY

Dear sirs,

We refer to the subject above and the attachment is for your reference.

Vehicle currently not in.

Kindly arrange survey with us and advise on the liability.

Thanks & Regards

Vonn Siow
Motar Claims Advisor
Auto Servicing

Total Vehicle Solutions Department




Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

" Jun Taiyo Service Centre (Automobile Leasing & Workshop)
B Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

t: 68336274

EH vgunlm.siuw@nug!.;am.sg
w: www hitachi-capital. com.sg

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses,

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment,
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



@ Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

Jun Talyo Service Centre
No. B Fourth Lok Yang Road
Singapore 629705

India Intermational Insurance Pte Lid Date . 28/02/2018

64 Cecll Street

#04/#05 108 Building

Singapore 048711

Re : Accident involving vehicle no.: SLR2922P and vehicle no(s); SHD3672A on 20/09/2018 at Along Punggol Rd Traffic.
Light Junction

Dear Sir,

Reference 1o the above accident, we are submitting the following claims on damages to our client’s vehicle caused by your
insured's vehicle,

& Workshop repair bill (Caost of repairs) TP20087920 $2,219.18
1 Loss of use vehicle for 4 days at ($120.00 /day) $480.00
I Medical expenses
[ Surveyor report fee
I Rental invoice
I Pain & suffering
[ Traffic police investigation fee
[ Search fee
O Others
Grand Total : $2.690.18
Please find the following documents enclosed,

[ Aceident Report [ Palice Investigation Resdlt
&1 Repair Bill 1 Medical Receipt

[J Vehicle Rental Receipt L1 Surveyor Bil

[ Search Fee Receipt ] Excess Bill

1 My Insurance Company

O Palicy No

[l Cthers

We look forward to your settiement within 30 days failing which you have to bear all costs incurred for engaging a solicitor to
enable us lo recover full settlement from your company

Thank you.

Hiiach! Capital Asia Pacific Pte Lid
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
DISCHARGE YOUCHER
|ll-Direct Settlement (PODS)
Iindia Ral: TP | MC T D055
Claimant Ref 5L 29229
Wesl,  Hitachi Capstal Asia Pacific Pte Lid mmmﬁmwmmmmwmm
with the appointed Surveyor of India Intemational Insurance Ple Lid LKK Auto Consultants P1e Lid {name
of Surveyor) wilh respect 1o the amount clamed for S$ 221818 (repair cost) SS_400.00 (oss of
sairenetl, S5 _— __ (search fee), vehicle no SUR 7P thai was damaged pursuant to Ihe accident which occurred
on 300BR018  (qge g PunagolRosd llocation) ipvohing. veficle o, SHL 36724 (insured

vehicle). This is pursusnt fo the inspection canducted on 08112010 (date) ai “the workshoo™.

Wel confim that well arefam authonzed by the owrief TED CHER TECK {the third party
:;m-rm".iducmmm.w_mmmmnmmmhmmﬂmﬂmmmmw
-.mMrmhmwhammtmwnWImmmnmwdmﬂﬂmwmm
party claimant”.

w-nmmmmﬂmm@nmwmﬂmmmmumm.mmrmm
mmﬁmmmhmmmwm m-mrmmmmmup.
Wdﬁnmmhmﬁlwwluummmmmmminlmmmnmmm:
of usa pursuant 1o the damage to 5% 3%32F_ (vetucle no.) as a result of the accident.

——

basis.

Thig sgreamant is tumwiah:pﬂmlmdmwnlw and ihe Singapore Courls have exchusive jurisdiction over any

dispute arising out of the same.
Wi/l autnorize you to pay the total amount of 8% 281818 1o Hitachi Capial Azia Pacific Ple L
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@ Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.
Jun Taiyo Service Centre

No. B Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore G249705
Tal: 64663022 Fax. 68966591

Co Reg No. 199400398N GST Reg. No. M2-0118098.3
TAX INVOICE
WS - India Intermational Insurance Pta Lid Invaica No - TP20087920
&4 Cecil Stroal Accident Dats  : 20/09/2018
#04/#05 108 Building Vah Regn . SLR2922P
Singapore 048711 Modal - Toyota Voxy 1.8V Hyrbid -
DA/DB2017 - OT/08/2022
Atin ¢ Motor Claim Dept Date . 26/02/2018
Tarms : 0days
Que Dale + 26022019
Your Insured - SHD3GTZA
Total Pages 2
Oty Silind s5aml Shlabor
1. Bady Regair Parts & Labour Charges
1 Parts 84,00
2 Labour 1,390.00
SubTotal o0 207400
Grand Total : 2,074.00
Add T % GST: 14518

Met Total After GST : 221018
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Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Lid.

Sarvice Manager '
Job done by :




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiemant

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case  |Notefled '[tg_sumnnm' = rA-_uIA;u-;_rg-_n = P.:_L;Tl.p? [Ad] Sutimitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
; . {00 SN ; —
|12 Mar 2013 pAOLI0IE se207400  $$2,074.00 oo Sopbien
M MMJMJ Ean Esnmates I View R I | Eﬂﬂfﬂl

Claim Detalls

A R Sat - = Horestnd by catputert
| COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. fieg. No. 1993038216

' TED CHER TECK, D 57514287H

20/0%/2018 19:00 - :58
|23 Months and 12 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man e

MCOMOO15

Date of Loss:

Policy /Cover
Note No.:

‘thlth_m_‘ n - -
N | SHD3IE72A Poiicy Mo | pnpv2018-00010222
{Tnswred): [Claimant ).

R — | Excenn:
Repairer | Mitachi Capital Asia Pacific Ple. Ltd (HQ) Mo & Fourth Lek Yang Rosd, 625705 Plonesr - Tel: 64563022
|lendiNG . ingia International Tnsurance Pt Ltd (HQ) - Tei: 63476100 . (Handled by Sherini Pillai)

c" "f! T e ———— — S—
Insurer:

| FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tei: 6727 5700 |
Adjuster| LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 82563561 ., [Handied by MOHD RASUL] ... [Final Rpt due 11/10/2018] i

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | Comgose Case Mal J‘|

« 115G (10/05/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved [$$2615.18) - SLR2922P - Clalm Handler: Sherini Pil...
= [5G (13/11/2018); Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved [$$0.00) - SLR2922P - Claim Handier: Sherini Pillai

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS~ _vnml Search Tasks | Cruinm‘l'uh.] cm_l

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
No resuits.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 28/5/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLR2922P (MCT1B090568)

[SHD3672A]

TEO CHER TECK
Sep 20 2018 7:00FM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd

™

Page | of 2

Uplosd Documents |  uplosd Photos | Compose ew Letter | View [View in Browser 7]
."ﬂlilln & - - - 1 per page w]| E
hNu |Finalized On India International Insurance Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall Print |
1 |13/10/18 09:54 | Video- TP - B | @ [ o0a s
""""E{'“"‘"" [ perpage V]
o Ratabel/ Reorder ]qut Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall Print
1 131180916 Odometer Reading 0  ceaws | A
|2 131118 09:16 | Chassis Number - 0 waws B
E |13710/18 09:16 | General View B B T | @ | weaws | BB
4 131118 00:18 General View . O v B
5 [1mnsosas | mm = O v &
6 1311/180916  General View B - - ©  owic | B
7 131118 09:16 _me 0  eawc A
& [13/111809:16 | Ganeral View D | weaws | A
‘s |13/11/1809:16 | General View QO  wwaws B
10 [13/11/1800:16 | General View o ‘_g_ tead G | B4
1L 1N11/1B09:16 General View . 0 wwors | &
12 13/11/1800116 | General View D wews | A
13 [1311/18 09116 | General View B - - O e | & |
12 UNLIB 0916 | General View 0D icaws | A
15 11180916 General View © | caors | 2
16 [13/11/1809:16 | General View - O | wowre | & |
17 |13/11/1809:16 | General View 0| eadrc | F |
18 [13/11/18 09:16 General View 0 waaws A
15 [1N11/1809:16 | Genersl View . © | aows | B
[zn___ﬂ.r:u:lm:iﬁ | General View | Loecwrc | B
2 (13/11/1800:16 | General View - O wors B
22 1311180916 |General View " @ | waows | B
23 |HANI06:10 | Geners) View © | owrs | @
L" 13117180916 | General View ©  cedwc | A
25 101118 06:16 | General View : B o - O  wowc B
26 ;I:if_l_l!_lr_l_ﬂ_ﬂi_l_b |ﬁ|n|nim (i ] |_Lmum: | & |
:n 13/11/18 09:16 _ General View : O | e ws [ ;|
m-ﬂﬂﬁﬂﬁ_ P —— - :-w_ _Iv_'_m_
No_|Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) _Thumbnail | Print
1 02/10/1820:13  ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO ITI DD 2.10.2018 @ | Loedror
2 02/10/182013 TP ESTIMATE + TP GIA REPORT @) | Load boF
3 0911181723 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED - B | @ ioasror
4 10/05/19 14:37 TP LOD - B 1 3___ Load FOF
3 18/05/19 09152 “m' Im Load POF

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc...
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Merimen e-Claims Page20f 2

Video . - _[:E%gg v] &
No |Fmsiged Gn | indla International Insurance PteLtd (W) [ Thumbnall| Print|
& —[ms.' 1906:52  |AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM B | @ | oadror
7 |28/05/1909:51 A DISCHARGE VOUCHER - | Load POF
FE__';_J.”,_"_?“ 0#52 w0 Lowd POF
Ho | Fmalized On | Indla International Insurance Pte Ltd {(HQ) Thumibnall| Prirt
1 03/10/1800.19  Singapere Accident Statement - 0 | LoadPoF

Documents Checklist

-bﬁﬁ.lll;ﬂl‘ll:ﬂlﬂl.ml “sst | Seve | M
There are no document checkdists configurned.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: [] Handling Insurer
Mot Barmaris Bre pruate unies you thew 10 olfer partes

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 28/5/2019



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregne 1esso7 108

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sun@ikkaulo com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CCaNllMB8017879/R1FA302

Date: 2B/0572018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India Inlernational Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMOD15
ﬁl:‘:'“'"' Vehicle o pog2op insured Vehicle No : SHD3872A
Date of Loss: 20/08/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18090568
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLR2922P
Make & Model: TOYOTA VOXY HYBRID, 1.8 X CVT (A) Engine No: 2ZR18711686
Reg Date: DB/08/2017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: ZWRB00D258027
Colour: Purple Odometer; 31852 km
Engine Capacity 1787 cc
Markel Value/Mew Car Prica:  N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Markel Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceabls): Yas
Handbrake {Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyra Size: 185/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size 195/85 R15
Front Left Side. Yokohama & mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama & mm
Front Right Side Yokohama 6 mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama 6 mm
The mbove valles represent the remaining fyrs eads depth
COST OF CLAIMS . _ Repairer's  Adjustor’s Difference _DIff %
Paris 1.771.25 684 .00 1.087.25 61.38
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,020.00 1,390.00 1,630.00 5397
Painwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (55) 4,781.25 2,074.00 2.117.25 56.M
+ GST 7.00/7.00% ($%) 335.39 145.18 180.21 56.71
Nett Amount (S§) 5,126.64 2,219.18 2,907.456 56.71
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x $5100.00/day) (S5) 400.00
Nett Liabllity (S§) 261918
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment 02/107/2018
Date Inspected 08/11/2018 Inspected Al Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Plte. Ltd (HQ)
Mo 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road
Singapore 629705
Estimated Period of Repair 4.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 28/5/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: Chong Poh Kin

NOTE This report represents our findings: f the tme and pisce of ingpechion stafed herein, Sueh ingpection fas been caried oul fo the bosr of pur
knowiledge and abulily but any ather fabiily urder any ather crcumstances is hareby expressly srciuded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 28/5/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference
Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 12 Mar 2019)
Parts: M1-MPV TOYOTA VOXY HYBRID 1.8 X CVT (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard Lisi)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLR2922P)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: temsvalues not n reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's  Amount

1 1 *REAR BUMPER Tom 559.00FL *558.00FL
2 1 *REAR TOW HOOK COVER Scratched 45.00FL *45.00FL
3 10 “REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 5500FL *55.00FL
4 2 *RR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER INNER RIL  Necessary (1 PCS ONLY) 160.00FL *B0.00FL
5 2 *RR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER OUTER RIL  Necessary (1 PCS ONLY) 180.00FL  *85.00FL
6 2 *RR BUMPER REFLECTOR R/L Cracked (1 PCS ONLY) 156.00FL *78B.00FL
7 1 *RR BUMPER END PANEL Repair 715.00FL “FL
B 1 *RR BUMPER ROD Mol Necessary 215.00FL *-FL
a 1 *REVERSE SENSOR Mot Necessary 200.00FS *-F§
10 1 *REAR FENDER LH (NPA) Repair 0.00FS *-FS

F=Franchise part S=Spchet! L=LatliemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 2,295.00 912.00
= List tem Discount on L lems 25.00/25.00% (S5) 523.75 228.00

Total Parts (S$) 1,771.25 684,00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

hitps://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 28/5/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous itema selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

Na Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltlems
1 PANEL BEAT ,CUT WELD ,RE-ALIGN & REPLACE DAMAGED Mew 1.500.00 S00.00
PARTS OF AFFECTED AREA
2 PUTTY BLEND AND SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREA New 1,250.00 750.00
3 REMOVE & REFIT REAR END PANEL LINING AND GARNISH New 150.00 80.00
TO FACILITATE REPAIR
4 REMOVE AND REINSTALL REVERSE SENSORS MNew 120.00 60.00
Gross Labour Cost [S5) 3,020.00 1,390.00
Report was unsubmitted dunng this print-out
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen ... 28/5/2019



