6/3/2020 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SMC4926H //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18017871/Npa3

Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>
Wed 3/6/2020 9:29 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; claims@huahong.com.sg <claims@huahong.com.sg>; 'Jonathan Tan'
<jonathan@huahong.com.sg>

Dear Hsiao Tong

We accept global sum of $4,030
Kindly proceed

Thank you

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

il E ®

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 June 2020 1:27 PM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; claims@huahong.com.sg; 'Jonathan Tan' <jonathan@huahong.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SMC4926H //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18017871/Npa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $4,030.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WwE2MfQpF%2BZo1s...
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 June 2020 1:02 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; claims@huahong.com.sg <claims@huahong.com.sg>; 'Jonathan Tan'
<jonathan@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SMC4926H //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18017871/Npa3

Dear Hsiao Tong
Please refer to the attached LOD
Thank you

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

 {Min NN

From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 1 June 2020 3:08 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; claims@huahong.com.sg; 'Jonathan Tan' <jonathan@huahong.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SMC4926H //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18017871/Npa3

Dear Hsiao Tong

We accept P/P $3,469.97(before GST).
I will submit the necessary documents once it’s ready

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpF%2BZo1s...  2/8
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Sorry for the delay
Thank you

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

 {Min MO

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 29 May 2020 5:28 PM

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>; 'jerleen’ <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SMC4926H //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18017871/Npa3

4th REMINDER Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

For COR, recommended amount at P/P $3,469.97(before GST) with 03 repair days.

**Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act,
rental receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpF%2BZo1s...  3/8
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Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 May 2020 9:41 AM

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>; 'jerleen’ <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SMC4926H //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18017871/Npa3

3rd REMINDER Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

For COR, recommended amount at P/P $3,469.97(before GST) with 03 repair days.

**Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act,
rental receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,

whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@]lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpF%2BZo1s...  4/8
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 20 April 2020 11:07 AM

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>; 'jerleen’ <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SMC4926H //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18017871/Npa3

2nd REMINDER Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

For COR, recommended amount at P/P $3,469.97(before GST) with 03 repair days.

**Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act,
rental receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,

whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 3:24 PM
To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpF%2BZo1s...  5/8
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Cc: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SMC4926H //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18017871/Npa3

REMINDER Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
For COR, recommended amount at P/P $3,469.97(before GST) with 03 repair days.

**Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt)
to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 September 2019 8:18 AM

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SMC4926H //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18017871/Npa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your patience.

For COR, recommended amount at P/P $3,469.97 (before GST) with 03 repair days.

**Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt)
to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpF%2BZo1s...  6/8
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Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 1:39 PM

To: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SMC4926H

Importance: High

Dear all

Please refer to the adjusted report as attached and confirm part by part finalisation.

Thanks & Regards
AshLeg Tan

O ietad HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

@ @

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 10:15 AM

To: 'Naz (LKKAuto)' <Naz@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)' <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SMC4926H

Dear Naz
https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxL WE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpF %2BZo1s...  7/8
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Please refer to the photos attached and confirm part by part finalisation.

Thanks & Regards

AshLeg Tan

| HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

M@ @
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