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Consuitants

e B Pra Lid Company Registration No, 19960T198R
31 UKL AVE 1. #02-25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 488933 TEL @ (063) 62363561 FAX : (5) 62504315
Your ref: D18007160MFSH

Our ref CS/FCILIBO17835/Uvd3 DATE: 9/10/2018

The Motor Claims Department

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.GBB S608E

We thank for your instruction on 2/10/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
vehicle on 2/10/2018  at the premises of M/s ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check" Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett YValue

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear ofs portion,

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser

: 5317.667.61
+ §$3,000.00 (LUMP SUM)
55
5%
1 5%
1 5%
rear




MS ‘ Firs tcE pi tal M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Coreq o 1550001060 G5T Reg No. M2-000167E9

& Ralties Quay #21-00 Singapare D4B5S80
Tek |65)6222 2311 Faxc (65} 6222 3547

Claims & Mot Undeswriting Degt 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Sngapore DEBATT
Tel {65) 6507 3848 Fax |65) 6507 3549
wvw.mafirsteapital.oom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Persaon

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
01-10-2018 QOur Ref No. D18007160MFSH
28-09-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHD3960T Third Party Vehicle. GBB5608E

130 BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD#08-1339
ELIN CAl
94507920/ 94507920 Fax No. 0

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE
Attention. NIL
LTD
MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
MAY CHUA
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 3:59 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

(of MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007160MFSH/1, GBB 5608E
Attachments: GBB 5608E PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBB 5608E
Date of survey: 2/10/2018
Number of days : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 12:07 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=
Cc: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007160MFSH/1, GBB 5608E

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBB 5608E on 2/10/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 12:45 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007160MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080a313)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 12:06 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007 160MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. A“G This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
, " WWW.aVE.com




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 12:.07 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Ce: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007160MFSH/1, GBB 5608E
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBB 5608E on 2/10/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 12:45 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007160MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@ msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent; Tuesday, 2 October 2018 12:06 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; MAYCHUA@MSFEIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007160MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.
Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

1



Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
; WWW.AVE.COm
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Mew Cars

Sell My Car

Used Mitsubishi Fuso Car for Sale in Singapora, Net Link Partners Pte Ltd - sgCarhart

Products Insurance Article

Directory

-Mitsubishi FB70 Price Range_ ¥ [}epremauan v | 2009 ¥ | | Vehicle Type ¥
Hame » Used Cars » Net Link Partners Pte Ltd » Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FE7O
Resources Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FB70
Car Buying Jervii Financial Accessories Similar Research Photos Map

Car Selling

Car Ownership

NE

'Z;om @mm

Car Aftermarket

On The Move Add to Shortlist

Lifestyle
Price

Car Tvres Depreciation

Reg Date

Manufactured

E’CS TH PS31

Stylish Performance

-]:E-

e Mileage
Transmission
Engine Cap
Curb Weight
Fuel type
Features

Accessories

Description

COE
oMV
ARF

Dereg Value

specialized in New & Used Curnmerciul \.r'ehl::'.er. lnsurunce Hire P

add to Compare Add a Note Report Error More Actions

$17,800

$18,620 fyr (7]
View madels with similar depreciation

18-Sep-2009
{1imths 14days COE left)

2009 (7]

Manual
2,977 cc
2,460 kg

Diesel

Good Condition Maintained By Previous Owner, Cheap
And Economical. Loan With Lowest Interest Rates. High
Trade In. Call Now To View and Test Drive The

Vehicle!

$18,801 (7] cd
428,133 (7] ilrﬂ
§1,407 6 Locaticn Ma
41,798 as of today (change) (7]

Ritos:/fwww sgcarmart.comiused _cars/info.php?ID=7676E7 &DL=3030 13



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Business

Owner ID: 1702E

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GBB5608E
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 02 Oct 2018
Vehicle Make: MITSUBISHI
Vehicle Model: FB70BB1SRDEA
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2009

Engine No.: 4M42A73440
Chassis Mo.: FB70BBA20034
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $28,133.00
Original Registration Date: 01 Jul 2009
First Registration Date: 01 Jul 2009
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $1,407.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 30 Jun 2019
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $12,615.00
COE Rebate Amount: $939.00

Total Rebate Amount: $939.00

Page 1 of |

The information contained herein is correct as at 02 Oct 2018

OK

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION_ID=F030...  02-Oct- 18



—~ ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD

— L 130 Bedok Reservoir Road
’ A B e #08-1339 Singapore 470130

B e, S — g
; = Tel: 9450 7920

AUT WERKS . * momautowerks@gmail.com

. / ﬁéﬁ,ﬂ/ 02 October 2018
| [_

REG NO. : GBB 5608 E |
MAKE/MODEL:  MITSUBISHI FUSO & / Z / \
— "
ESTIMATED REPAIR COST FOR THE VEHICLE MENTIONED ABOVE 7/*’ :?/ is bt (o M,V"'
Qry DESCRIPTION -ﬁ !‘fﬁ AMT(5%)
LIST ITEMS
1 Rear taillamp {‘ g 1488 0g” )-?tﬁcn., 38150 _~
1 Rear exhaust pipe 615 .3, & s 71650 —
1 Rear exhaust mounting % A 42, Eﬂ)(
4 Rear tow hook bracket % A= 25000
1 Rear wheel rim $ 11 280,00
1 Rear o/s leaf spring £ 1.656.009%
1 Rear o/s mudguard - rear ﬂ-bfuﬂM 33520 "
1 Rear o/s mudflap $ a4/ 19220%/
r L] 3.852.90
Less /ﬂ]/% 1L v % 38529
& 346761 °
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
i Rear tyre (Depreciation) % AA 300,00 "‘(
1 Rear freezer box tailboard $ A1 220000
i Rear freezer box tailboard hinge - lower $ A7 120.00°¢
1 Rear freezer box tailboard pillar frame $ 0 2.850.00 /3,00
i Rear freezer box side board % F‘L 2,500.00 X
1 Rear reverse sensor (1 set) L3 nA 350.00 A
5 832000

PAGE 1 OF 2



¢/f: $ 11,787.61

5/N LABOUR CHARGES %
1 To remove, replaced damaged lamps and check up rear wiring. % 80.00 Lo
2 To remove and refit rear reverse sensor. g 1A 150.00 «
3 To remove, refit and replace exhaust silencer and mountings. £ 15000 é 1)
4 To apply undercoating. 5 A 20000 3
5 Panel beating. S 2.800.00 fﬁlﬂ_}
6 To re-spray painting on the affected areas. % 2,500.00 S@ o
& 5880.00
GRAND TOTAL : 5 17,667.61 |
BT nsuliants hence notify
‘ fallowing:
I . - i1af spray painting
f{ 2} during resuney
I o conliemation
: ! ’ . r 4 r il Prajudica” Dass -
o N il ifotils) s afiowed
i emeitary (tEMIS) must be resurveyed and
& subject 1o finak approval from Insurance Company
Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:

PAGE 2 OF 2



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607108-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CSIFCI1B017835/Uvd3n2

AN

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Rle:  A1ieal

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 39607 Veh. Inspected GBB 5608E
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D18007160MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MAY CHUA Assign Date 02/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI FBYO [ 2977
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. FBTOBBAZOO34 Colour WHITE
Odometer 229123 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185R15 HIFLY & mm
L/H Front Tyre |135R15 HIFLY & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |155R15(D} FIRESTONE &6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195 R15 (D} FIRESTOME &/6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTICN.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/09/2018 Inspection Date 02/10/2018
Survey held at 15 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 48 01-53
Repairer Z0O0OM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANGCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 1561 FAX: 256 4315

Reg. No: 109607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBB 5608E

Page No.:1 of 2

Qty Description of Parts Condition \E:;T;;?:H Our A;{:j}ushd
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAILLAMP OIS DAMAGED / 381.50 288.05
SCRATCHED
1|REAR EXHAUST PIPE DENTED 715.50 £15.30
1|REAR EXHAUST MOLUNTING NOT NECESSARY 42 50 -
1|REAR TOW HOOK BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 250.00 >
1|REAR WHEEL RIM NOT NECESSARY 280.00 ;
1|REAR OIS LEAF SPRING NOT NECESSARY 1,656.00 :
1|REAR O/S MUDGUARD-REAR DEFORMED / 33520 335.20
WARPED
1|REAR O/S MUDFLAP NOT NECESSARY 192.20 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -385.29 .
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -309.64
3467 .61 eze o
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR TYRE (DEPRECIATION)(SN) NOT NECESSARY 300.00
1|REAR FREEZER BOX TAILBOARD (SN) NOT NECESSARY 2,200.00 -
1|REAR FREEZER BOX TAILBOARD HINGE-LOWER (SN}  |NOT NECESSARY 120.00
1|REAR FREEZER BOX TAILBOARD PILLAR FRAME (SN)  |DENTED 2 850.00 1,300.00
1|REAR FREEZER BOX SIDE BOARD (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 2.500.00 -
LABOUR
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) MOT NECESSARY 350.00 -
&,320.00 1,300.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE REPLACED DAMAGED LAMPS AND CHECK 80.00 20.00
UP REAR WIRING.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR REVERSES ENSOR. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
T REMOVE,REFIT AND REPLACE EXHAUST SILENCER 150.00 60.00
AND MOUNTINGS.
TO APPLY UNDERCOATING. NOT NECESSARY 200.00 g
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 2,800.00 1.000.00
FREEZER BOX SIDE BOARD.

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18017835/Uvd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

mlm BE B 51 Linl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 406933
/___Ll TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199507108R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
: te By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition Estima
i v Workshop ()| (5)
TO RE-SPRAY PAINTING ON THE AFFECTED AREAS, 2.500.00 500.00
5,880.00 1,580.00
GRAND TOTAL 17,667.61 3,808.91
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,000.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18017835/Uvd3n2

MARKET VALUE: $12,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $939.00=NETT VALUE: $11,061.00

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report 8 made solely for the use and benefit of the Clhent namad on the front pags of this Reporl




