Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Khoo, Kay-Eng <Kay-Eng.Khoo@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 2:39 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Accident Involving SLX9461A and SJJ3347) on 28 September 2018 *LKK REF:
CC6/AIG18017824/Upb3

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE_MARKED.pdf

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Thank you for the update and confirmation.

We have received the LOD from the third party law firm and the amount claimed is as per your law firm
recommendation.

Kindly submit your survey fees for this case via Merimen so that we can close the case accordingly.

Khoo Kay Eng

AlIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1026 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

kay-eng.khoo@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, November 28, 2018 1:55 PM

To: Khoo, Kay-Eng

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLX9461A and S113347] on 28 September 2018 *LKK REF: CC6/AI1G18017824/Upb3

Hi Mr Khoo,

Attached is a copy of marked estimate for your easy reference.



Recommended repair cost: $6,000.00
Recommended repair days: édays

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khoo, Kay-Eng <Kay-Eng.Khoo@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 11:06 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Accident Involving SLX9461A and SJJ3347) on 28 September 2018

Importance: High

Our Ref: 46296165295G003/004
Dear Hsiao Tong/Vivian,
Noted this is an agreed SJE case.

Can you advise what was the eventual repair cost amount and number of days recommended for repairs for this
case at Choo Motor?

Thank you.

Khoo Kay Eng

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1026 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

kay-eng.khoo@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:



The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



