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51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065] 62564315

Your Ref: D18007205MFSH Date; 04 January 2019
Our Ref: CS/FCIL18017823/Aqd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SLM 4896U .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 02/10/2018 at the premises of M/s SM AUTOMOTIVE. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 8% 15.171.95

Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 4,500.00 (Lump Sum) .
“Check” Items Amount : 58 -

Market Value 158 -

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 55 -

Nett Value : 8% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

offside

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, MMATAI
Licensed Appraiser



MS @ FirstCapital

M3 First Capital Insurance Limited [oReq o 1550001060 G5V Re No. H2-0000676-9
& Rafties Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580
Teb {65) 6222 2311 Fax (B5}6edZ 3547

(laims & Motor Uinderwsiting Dept 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore DBBATY
Tel |85) 6507 38458 Fax. (65} 6507 3849
hw.msﬁr“rapﬂal [Om.Sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

02-10-2018 Our Ref No. D18007205MFSH

28-08-2018 Claim Type. Third Party

SHDE7S59P Third Party Vehicle. SLM4896U

BLK C, 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-43 @ AUTOBAY
REENA

67479241/ 0 Fax No. 67417276

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Flease submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

SM AUTOMOTIVE Attention. NIL
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

B s 5.0 [T




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

# ——— —_— e —
From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 January 2019 3:45 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System'; assignments

Cc SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007205MFSH/1

Attachments: CSFCI18017823Aqd3.pdf

Dear Serene,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLM 4896U.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 1:39 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007205MFSH/1

Dear Serene,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLM 4896U on 02/10/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 3:29 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007205MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDHS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

IE’hme: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)
" 1



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 1:39 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'; assignments

Cc: SEREMELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COMSG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007205MFSH/1
Dear Serene,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLM 4896U on 02/10/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4515
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 3:29 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007205MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1072 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Erom: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com 5g]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 3:06 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SERE NELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007205MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,
Admin Team



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

1 ofl

,> Baclcto OneMotoring

hitps:

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Creener 1D Type

Creneer 100

WVehicle Details

Wehicle Nao.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Model

Primary Colour:
tanufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

taximum Power Cutput:
Open Market Walue

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):
QP Paid

COE Rebate Amount.
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
15922

SLMEBFEU

Yes

01 0ct 2018
HOMDA

VEZEL 1.5X CVT
Black

2015
L15B35154608
RU110193%93
& 0 KW (128 bhp)
$168,436.00

29 May 2015

29 May 2015

1

%5,000.00

Yes
2B May 2025
£3.750.00

28 May 2025

A - Carupto 1600cc & 97kW
({130bhp)

10

S48, 58%.00

$45652.00

54940200

The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Oct 2018

OK

vrlIta.gov.sg/lta'vel‘action enquireRebateByPublicBefore. .

12018, 12:44 PM
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SM AUTOM OTIVE

il SM_AUT OMOTIVE@HOTMAIL.COM

Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#01-43

Singapore 417883

Accident date: 24/09/2018
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: SLM4896U HONDA VEZEL 1.5 X A '15

01/10/2018

S/N QTY ITEMS U/PRICE AMOUNT

1 1  RearBootlid meitd 51,160.90"

2 2 Rear Boot Lid Hinge 2 A $68.10 $136.20°"

3 2 Rear Boot Lid Shock Absorber (¢~ $180.90 $361.80

4 1  Rear Boot Lid Emblem Logo 4« $45.10

5 1  Rear Boot Lid Inner Lock  #¢ $185.60

6 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Rubber 447 &4 $135.25 ¥

7 1  Rear Boot Lid Inner Trim Board  A~f 5335.75 °

8 1  Rear Boot Lid Camera (Special Nett) ' ~ $680.00

9 2 Rear Tail Lamp A A $565.80 $1,131.60 #

10 1  Rear Bumper “J¢t—c $863.70

11 2 Rear Bumper Side /s $198.70 $397.40
12 8  Rear Bumper Clip ~' $6.50 $§200 >~
13 2 Rear Bumper Side Retainer /*~ $38.00 $76.00 -

14 2 Rear Bumper Side Reflector N~ - 5148.40 $296.80

15 1 Rear Bumper Lower Spoiler {SpecisiNett) Vo< $450.00

16 1 Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor (Special Nett) ' $380.00 " 2o
17 1  Rear End Panel  “Peadcd ’ . $595.60
18 1 Rear End Panel Top Garnish 73— $132.30 B~
19 2  Rear Fender Inner Trim Board M2 »— §325.25 $650.50 -

20 1  Rear Spare Tyre Panel Top Cover ft« A $306.65 1~
21 1 Rear Spare Tyre Panel Under Lower Cover ¢ i~ $190.90
22 8  Rear Spare Tyre Panel Under Lower Cover Clip »* $6.50 $52.00 = SO
23 1  Rear Exhaust N-L ptr $828.00 +
24 1 Rear Exhaust Chrome Pipe A~ $135.00

25 1 Rear Centre Exhaust L $956.00 *
26 1  Rear Windscreen Moulding /4~ $95.00
27 1  Rear Windscreen Seal  pJe $151.70 -

Subtotal:-

$10,781.75




Labour charges

To remove & refit cushion

To remove & refit rear windscreen

Gum

To remove & refit reverse sensor

To remove & refit rear boot lid camera & video camera

To remove & refit rear & centre exhaust

Tuff kote
To check wiring
Panel beating

Spray painting

LKK Auto Cc

. I ('
onsultants hence

_ notif
the H'-‘:[JEI'EF"--‘:-"I:‘ iollowing: !
* Tore Urvey before sHaropmr fieed
“fEatier spray painfing
Subject 1o ':-:. :I
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wed
r B and
I va | rance o pany
Acknowledged by Repairey
Signature;
Date:

g,zg/q,m’g;:
$150:00 |
Sspad¥
51/09:[56*5:4*‘
$380:00 (OU
53:@_95 - X
$150:00 5o
A1 00 $100.00 " 2D
51:&9,0400 g0
51,42@(1’5"{»'}

Subtotal:- $4,390.00

Total:- $15,171.75

Aoz, [
L/J @1/;%5_
Dé'&},f:.

4oln]  £013-6¥
RS




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref CS/FCI1B017823/Aqd3n2

#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date - 09-01-2019 Ml‘l‘mmumum
Code : FCI2
1, Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 6752P Veh. Inspected SLM 48980
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D1B007205MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SERENE Assign Date 02/10/2018
2; Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAVEZEL c.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. RU11018583 Colour BLACK
Odometer 84146 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[215/60 R16 DUNLOP B mm
L/H Front Tyre 215/60 R16 DUNLOP B mm
R/H Rear Tyre [215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/80 R16 DUNLOP & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  29/09/2018 Inspection Date 02/10/2018
Survey held at SM AUTOMOTIVE
BLK C, 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-43 SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR § Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 100607198R GST Reg. Mo, 10-8607T168-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLM 4836U
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT LID DENTED 1,160.90 1,160,890
2|REAR BOOT LID HINGE @$68.10 NOT NECESSARY 136.20 -
2|REAR BOOT LID SHOCK ABSORBER @$180 50 NOT NECESSARY 361.80 -
1|REAR BOOT LID EMBLEM LOGO HECESSARY 4510 4510
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER LOCK DAMAGED 185.60 185.60
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER RUBBER cuT 13525 135.25
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD NOT NECESSARY 335.75 .
Z|REAR TAIL LAMP @3565.80 NOT NECESSARY 1,131.60 -
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 863.70 BB3.70
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE @$198.70 TO REPAIR SEE 397 40 -
LABOUR
B|REAR BUMPER CLIP @%6.50 NECESSARY 52,00 30.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @$38.00 NECESSARY 76.00 76.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR @$148 40 NOT NECESSARY 296,80 .
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER SPOILER DEFORMED 450.00 450.00
1|REAR END PANEL DENTED 595.60 595 &0
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 132.30 132.20
2|REAR FEMDER INNER TRIM BOARD @3$325.25 NOT NECESSARY 650.50 -
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP COVER NOT NECESSARY 306 65 -
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL UNDER LOWER COVER DEFORMED 180,80 180.90
8|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL UNDER LOWER COVER CLIP |NECESSARY 52.00 30.00
@%6.50
1|REAR EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 828.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST CHROME PIPE NOT NECESSARY 135.00
1|REAR CENTRE EXHALST NOT NECESSARY 955 00 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING MNECESSARY 5.00 95.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEAL NECESSARY 151.70 151.70
LESS 20% DISCOUNT - -B2B.41
9,721.75 3,313 64
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BOOT LID CAMERA (SN) NOT NECESSARY £80.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18017823/Aqd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-96071%6-R

Page No.2of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | .\ = oo p !_;J} )
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SEN3OR (SN} DAMAGED 280.00 200.00
1|GUM (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1,110.00 250.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT CUSHION 280.00 80.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEM 150.00 120.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 60.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR BOOT LID CAMERA & VIDEO 380.00 100.00
CAMERA
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR & CENTRE EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
TUFF KOTE. 150.00 50.00
TO CHECK WIRING 100.00 20.00
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,400.00 BO0.00
BUMPER SIDE.
SPRAY PAINTING 1,400.00 800.00
4,340.00 2,050.00
GRAND TOTAL 15,171.75 5613.64
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18017823/Agd3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng.AMSOE, AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




