Vic (LKKAuto)

From: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg

Sent: Thursday, 18 July, 2019 3:35 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: RE: SFP5115P - FINALISATION OF COR LKK REF CC4/LPC18017817/Bhb3
Attachments: 3548_001.pdf

Dear Vic,

Enclosed is signed DV for your perusal.
Will mail out original copy via Registered Mail.

Thanks you.

Best Regards,

Jen

Insurance Claims Dept

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

27A Tanjong Penjuru

Singapore 609042

T: (65) 6331 0698 F: (65) 6331 0690
E: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 11 July 2019 2:47 PM

To: Catherine Chua <catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg>

Cc: Jess Francis Amurao Carlos <jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SFP5115P - FINALISATION OF COR LKK REF CC4/LPC18017817/Bhb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Catherine,
We refer further to your below email and we confirmed in receipt of your LOD.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we propose below amount to settle your client’s claim.

Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 3,390.57
Loss of Use ($60 x 5 days) S 300.00
LTA Search Fee S 2.00

TOTAL $ 3,692.57

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward back to us (LKK) the original signed hard copy
for our Principal to process the payment.




The above amount is to be made payable to TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 4:16 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: FW: SFP5115P - FINALISATION OF COR

Dear Joy
This is a reminder for you to finalize the COR with us asap.

Thanks n Regards
Catherine Chua

Insurance Claims Executive
Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd
DID: 6603 6121

FAX: 6476 7417

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is
confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then
delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other
person. Thank you.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>

Sent: 07 December 2018 11:17 AM

To: Catherine Chua <catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
<Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jess Francis Amurao Carlos <jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SFP5115P - FINALISATION OF COR

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS



Hi Catherine,

The case handler for this case is Joy.

Hi Joy,

Kindly assist.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg <catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 December 2018 2:02 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: SFP5115P - FINALISATION OF COR

Dear Admin-A@LKK/Asher

Our COR computation is attached for your agreement.
COR: $3168.76 before GST
3 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)

Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible.

Thanks n Regards
Catherine Chua

Insurance Claims Executive
Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd
DID: 6603 6121

FAX: 6476 7417

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is
confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then
delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other
person. Thank you.

From: mazdacanon@mazda.com.sg <mazdacanon@mazda.com.sg>
Sent: 06 December 2018 12:58 PM

To: Catherine Chua <catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: Attached Image




