Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 March, 2019 5:31 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SLG2881G DOA27092018 TO FINALIZE

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 March, 2019 4:20 PM

To: 'CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Operation'; assignments
Cc: Kristy Tay Siew Hwa; Patrick Chung Chan Kim; Denis Teo Chin Chye
Subject: RE: SLG2881G DOA27092018 TO FINALIZE

Dear William,
Confirmed COR $2246.42 before GST @ 3 working days.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

From: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Operation [mailto:braddell_operation@sparkcarcare.com]
Sent: Saturday, 24 November, 2018 11:31 AM

To: assignments; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kristy Tay Siew Hwa; Patrick Chung Chan Kim; Denis Teo Chin Chye

Subject: SLG2881G DOA27092018 TO FINALIZE

Dear Sir,

Kindly refer to attachment and finalize the COR.
3 working days to repair.
Please reply as soon as possible.

William Wang

Best Regards
External Business | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6383 7656 (Ngo - Supervisor) / Off: 6383 8115 (William) / Off: 6383 7362 (Andrew)

Fax: 6281 5767
www.SPARKcarcare.com




