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Consultants

nr ]’fl‘/ Auto

....r.: ma = Pie Lid Company Registration No_ 199607 198R
21 UBIAVE 1. #02-25 PAYA URLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 02564315
Yourref: TBA Date: 03/10/2018

Our ref: CC6/CTI18017747/Ufa3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SJV 60800
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 01.10.2018
at the premises of M/s Hup Motor Trading & Service - Tampines have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount gh 13,116.02
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 6,000.00
"Check" Items Amount : S% =
Total (Including Check Items) : Sh 6,000.00
Market Value : 85 - (est.)
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% - {est.)
Nett Value 1 5% - {esL.)
el il
Description of Damage: - -
The vehicle sustained damages at the ': Iit".[_;___j';j o
Rear O/S Portion ortuce

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 6.0 days

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Catherine Thia <catherine thia@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October, 2018 10:45 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAUto}

Cc: Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAute); Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB4679G (01 : CAl - TBA) and SJVE080U
(TP - LKK REF - CC6/CTI18017747/Ufa3) on 28/09/2018

Attachments: Ol report. pdf

Categories: HMK

Hi

Please see attached Ol report

Thanks

Catherine Thia
Saenior Executive
Motor Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
Direct (65) 6389 6193

www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
in Simgapore vinee (558

Disclaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except
where provided for in a written agreement belween you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid, Any unauthorized
disclosure. use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately,

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 4 October, 2018 1:22 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

1



We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841
2132,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto,com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4o08933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.symanteccloud.com
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CHINA TAIPING

R E AT REE (HI0E) HRAE)

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

Our Reference: SNM18D04718/C01/3
Date : 03 OCTOBER 2018

YLF MARKETING fSé PTELTD

2 WOODLANDS SECTOR 1

#01-06 WOODLANDS SPECTRUM 1
SINGAPORE 738068

Dear Sir/ Madam

3 Anson Road #18-00 Seringiead Towes Singapore 07500
T B3RO A1 Fax: 8222 9033

Welbislie: www.sg cnimping com

Co. Reg Mo, PO0P0RIBE

via Ordinary & Registered Mail

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB4679G AND SJV6080U ON 28 SEPTEMBER 2018

ALONG SLIP ROAD EXIT TO LOYANG AVE

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SJV6080U , is filing a third party property

claim against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accident.

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation accordingly.

Yours truly,
Claims Department

(This is a computer generated letter and no signature 1s required.)

CC LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Attn POH KIN

Ref ; CCRICTIIBO1TT4T/IUFAS
Contact No : 68412132

via Email 1  POHKIN@LKKAUTO COM

CC - Agent - (ANC421A) - VITESSE SOLUTIONS

FO1/LKKDS-2013



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of' |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
9273G

SJV6080U
No

010ct 2018
TOYOTA

HARRIER 2.0 PREMIUM AT AIRBAG 2WD
5DR

Black

2015

3ZRB714565
Z5U600070553
111.0 kW (148 bhp)
$31,422.00

22 Feb 2016

22 Feb 2016

0

$30,991.00

Yes
21 Feb 2026
$23,243.00

21Feb 2026

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$46,970.00

$34,724.00

$57,967.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Oct 2018

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/Ita/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_I D=F030... 01-Oct-18



% Poh K4

e ‘f:L i ‘*Ef ’%’ AR 7% *” 75 6 !.' |
HUP MOTOR TRADING & SERVICE 1/i6/c4 .

Bk 9004 Tampines Street 93 #01-120 Singapore 528838 Tel: 6784 0035 Fax: 6784 DOT6H Email: hupmotor@gmail.com Reg. No. ITBO 100w

=+ = i

= z“"-

OurRef: TP 2925/10/18 Your Ref: Date: 18% OCT 2018

MS LIM MAY LING, YVONNEB
96, Plora Road, S (507007)

Estimate cost of repair to TOYOTA HARRIER 2.0 (4) __lj'_renm Sdr = SJV 6080 U
™

' pc rear bumper 4 $ 1,381.50 ¢ —
€ pcs rear bumper top clips g; $§ 3.80 Aln 22.80 —
8 pes rear bumper lower clips 3.80 e 30.40 —
6 pce rear bumper ofs & n/s side clips &: stopper g § 4.807-] 28.80 \__/
1 pe rear bumper lower garnish — P fuarfed 355 20,
1 pe rear bumper ofs reflecter £ A 54.10 —
1 set rear bumper reverse sensaor clAA 280, gﬂd,gd N
2 pcs rear bumper o/s & n/s side retainer g § 92,20 /¢ @m’ 184,40 (0
2 pes rear bumper o/s & n/s top retainer @ § 94.80 o/ e 189.60 (V¢
1 pe rear bumper reinforcement ; % ‘£ 288, 000w
1 pec rear bumper spounge damper 7% .~  137.B0— -
1 pe tail gate door Ao ﬂ'f; s 1,369.50 c—
12 pecas tail gate door immer trim board elips ¢ § 5.30 2+ 63.60—
pe tail gate door o/s refleecter A A §32.20%
pe tail gate door weatherstrip Aoy 390.90—
pc tail gate door 'HARRIBR' emblem e T2.30—
pe rear windscreen glass lower moulding o 40.70—
pe rear windscreen glass top moulding AL 38.80.~
pcs rear windscreen glass o/s & n/s moulding ¢ § 28,50.4c« 57.00
pe rear windsereen glass inner damper seal €1 58.00 — !
pec rear windscreen glass sealant AL 60.00 ¥ (- v
pe tail gate door lock ?a:?, 963.10i—

pc tall gate door lock stricker V= g 37.50,%

e oah ol o T e T e ot et T e e ek o P e e = b =B

$ 11,034.70

pes tail gate door stepper @$ 9.704 1 19.40.%
pes licence lamp garnish clips & stopper @§ 5.7041 34.20 <
pe o/s tail lamp assy €A 455,107
pes of/s tail lamp clips stopper @ § 4.20 ko 15,59-*""'
pc 7rear end panel T 715.0Q —
pc rear end panel top garnish A7 353.80 2
pcs rear end panel top garnisk clips 0§ 4.204- 25,29.}3
pe rear exhaust muffler & pipe 1 1 1,872.70 X
pcs rear exhaust muffler mounting @ $ 32.90 4 7 65,80 ¥
pc tool set damper sponge ' A 361,70 ;i{
pe rear floor board panel 4 965.10
pec spare tyre board cover ,, 4 562, gnjs(
pc rear number plate i T &60.00 i’ffb A
|23

To wiring check up & transfer affected wiring system.

Balance C/PF...

/ f -
Less 25% § 2,758.68 b4V (
|.-r|"-.!I
$ 8,276.02 Egis
60.00 2{)
$ 8,336.02

LELEL BN RN



n A 2K » R B
HUP MOTOR TRADING & SERVICE )

Blk 9004 Tampines Street 93 #31-120 Singapore 528838 Tel: 6784 0039 Fax: 6784 0076 Email: hupmumr@gmf_lf_nm Reg. No. 37R09100W

TP 2925/10/18 o pet Date: 18t _Cct 2018

Our Ref, ___

MS LIM MAY LING, YVONNE.,

Balance B/F... $§ 8,336.02
To remove & refix resr windscreen glass, moulding & necessary ‘
perts. 150.00 / 2

To trensfer tail gate door inner trim board, wiper motor,
arm, inner lock, top & low spoiler, hinge, shock sbsorber,

key less senser & necessary parts. 7 480.00
S L L
Te remove & refix rear carpet, garnish, floor board cover, y
tool set, spare tyre, weatherstrip & necessary parts. lEG.ﬂﬂ_f}EJ
To refix & pump sealant for tail gate door top & lower spoiler 5
& necessary parts. 450,00 V"
To jack, straighten & knocking out rear exhaust, pipe & necessary N
parts, ;A 48Q.,00 "
To respray Tuff-Kote on all affected accident paris. 150.0Q V?;r
4
Labour charge to remove & cut cut damaged parts, to jack,
straighten & kpoocking out rear ofs fender, rear floor board ey
panel, rear end panel & necessary parts, to weld, renew & YRAYEY
align above parts. 3,850.00
I a
To putty & respray painting onm all affected accident parts. 2,000.00 / jj,_a
§ 43,3a6.02
EFFF ST ERFEER-FOY
| 386602
Dollars : Thirdteen Thousand Cne Hundred Sixteenm Dollars And Centa
Two Only.
nING & SERVICE .
............................................. e, ;
DESES




Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

H

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 12:08 PM

To: ‘David Ang'

Subject: RE: LOD : LKK Ref : CC6/CTI1807747/Ufa3, RTA for SIV 6080 U & GBB 4679 G on:
28/09/18

Attachments: DV S)V 60BOU.pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC6/CTI1807747/Ufa3
Your Ref:  TP/2925/10/18

Dear David,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GBB 4679G AND SJV 6080U ON 28/09/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Thank you for your patience waiting on this matter.

please be informed that we just received the mandate approval from our principal.

We hereby confirmed settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair (W/GST) S$ 6,000.00

2. Loss of Rental (5100.00 x 7days) SS 700.00

3. GIA search fee 5 2.00
5$ 6,702.00

Please duly sign the DV attached and return with rental tax invoice for payment processing.
We need original copy DV.

Your prompt action is very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108



Poh Kin (LKKAuto) _

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October 2018 6:14 PM

To: ‘Catherine Thia’

Cc: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: <Seak Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB 4679G (O : CTl -
SMM18D04718/C01/9) and 5JV 60B0U (TP : LKK REF - CCe/CTI18017747/Ufa3) on
28/09/2018

Attachments: LKK ADJUSTMENT REPORT.pdf, LKK INSPECTION REPORT.pdf; LKK RESURVEY

PHOTO- AFTER REPAIR. pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO pdf

Importance: High

Your ref : SNM18D04718/C01/9
Our ref : CC6/CTI118017747/Ufa3

Dear Catherine,

ROAD TRAEFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 4679G(Ol), IV 6080U (TP) and Others ON 28/09/2018
We refer to the above matter.

It is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is down against our insured driver.

We did clarify with Insured (PIC-Ms Zhung) the nature of the accident and they agree to settle and aware
that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Hup Motor Trading & Service" at $ 6,702.00(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (L/S) $13,866.02 S 6,000.00
2. Loss of Rental $  700.00 (7 days x $100) | $  700.00 (7 days x $100)
3. GIA search fee & 20 s 200
Total | $14,568.02 $ 6,702.00

**06 days recommendation for repair.
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
For your approval please.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciate.



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CT| <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 9:41 AM

To; Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc Catherine Thia: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Alfred Toh; KKLau; Chee So Chow

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB 4679G (Ol : CTI - SN M18D04718C02/9)

and SJV 6080U (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTIIN8017747/Ufa3) on 28/09/2018

Categories: clear

LKK REF - CC6/CTII18017747/Ufa3
CTI REF — SNM18D04718C02/9 (GBB4679G)

Dear Poh Kin

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

P’lease proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $6,702.00.
We await your payment advice to enable Catherine to act accordingly.
lBest Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

1 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 T175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

L Y
e |
W

ANNIVFRSARY
In Singapore sinee 1938
Disclaimer ;
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. excepr

where provided for in a wrilten agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Lid. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole ar partial, is prohihited. [f you are not the intended recipient af the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@]lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, November 12, 2018 1:06 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=

Ce: Catherine Thia <catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao

1



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Lin| Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607108R GST Reg. No. 19-0807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909

Ref CCE/CTIB017747/Ufa3n2

Date: 26-11-2018

Code: CTI

LI

1.

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh.  GBEB 4679G Veh. Inspected SJV 6080U
Policy No. DMCVSNS00B251809 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18004718/C02/9 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 01/110/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HARRIER (A) c.c 1986
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. ZSUB00070553 Colour PURPLE
Odometer 37874 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/55R18 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |235/55 R18 BRIDGESTONE 7mm
R/H Rear Tyre |235/55 R18 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |235/55 R18 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/09/2018 Inspection Date 01/10/2018
Survey held at HUF MOTOR TRADING & SERVICE
ELK 9004 TAMPINES ST 93
#01-120
SINGAPORE 528838
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

& Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX.: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-3607196-R Page No.:1 of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJV 6080U
] Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ ehop {g'” [SJ}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED 1,381.50 1,281 50
&|REAR BUMPER TOP CLIPS @$3.80 NECESSARY 22.80 22.80
8|REAR BUMPER LOWER CLIPS @$3.80 NECESSARY 30.40 30.40
&|REAR BUMPER 0O/S & N/S SIDE CLIPS & STOPPER NOT NECESSARY 28.80 -
@$4.80
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER GARMNISH DEFORMED / 366.20 366.20
WARPED
1|REAR BUMPER (/S REFLECTOR CRACKED 5410 54 10
2|REAR BUMPER O/S & N/S SIDE RETAINER @3$92.20 QIS BENT 184 40 92.20
2|REAR BUMPER O/S & N/S TOP RETAINER @394 80 O/S CRACKED 189,60 04,60
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT MO SUCH PARTS 288.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE DAMPER TORMN 137 .80 137.80
1| TAIL GATE DOOR BADLY DENTED 1,369.50 1,368.50
12| TAIL GATE DOOR INMER TRIM BOARD CLIPS @$5.30 NECESSARY 63.60 63.60
1| TAIL GATE DOOR QS REFLECTOR NOT NECESSARY 41220 -
1|TAIL GATE DOOR WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED 390.80 36090
1|TAIL GATE DOOR "HARRIER" EMBLEM NECESSARY 72.10 72.10
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS LOWER MOULDING MECESSARY 40.70 40.70
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS TOP MOULDING NECESSARY ag.80 38.80
=|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS O/S & N/S MOULDING WECESSARY 57.00 57 .00
@528 50
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS INNER DAMPER SEAL NECESSARY 58.00 58.00
1|TAIL GATE DOOR LOCK DENTED/ 963.10 963.10
SHORTED
1| TAIL GATE DOOR LOCK STRICKER NOT NECESSARY 37.50 .
2| TAIL GATE DOOR STOPPER @%9.70 NOT NECESSARY 19.40 -
&|LICENCE LAMP GARNISH CLIPS & STOPPER @3$5.70 NOT NECESSARY 34.20
1| VS TAIL LAMP ASSY CRACKED 45510 455.10
4|ovs TAIL LAMP CLIFS STOPPER @%4.20 MECESSARY 16.80 16.80
1|REAR END PANEL DENTED 715,00 715.00
1|REAR EMD PANEL TOP GARNISH WOT NECESSARY 353.80
6|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS @3%4 20 NOT MECESSARY 2520 -
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty Pt Workshop (5)|  ($)
1|REAR EXHAUST MUFFLER & PIPE NOT NECESSARY 1,872.70
2|REAR EXHAUST MUFFLER MOUNTING @332.90 NOT NECESSARY 65.80 -
1|TOOL SET DAMPER SPONGE NOT NECESSARY 361.70 -
1|REAR FLOOR BOARD PANEL NOT NECESSARY 965 10 -
1|SPARE TYRE BOARD COVER NOT NECESSARY 562 80 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -2,908.68 -1,605.10
B8,726.02 4,815 30
1|SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 280.00 200.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 40,00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) SCRATCHED 60.00 4000
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -100.00 -
300,00 280.00
LABQUR
TO WIRING CHECK UP & TRANSFER AFFECTED WIRING 60.00 20.00
SYSTEM
TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN 150.00 120.00
GLASS MOULDING & NECESSARY PARTS.
TO TRANSFER TAIL GATE DOOR INNER TRIM 180.00 £0.00
BOARD,WIPER MOTOR ARM,INNER LOCK, TOP & LOW
SPOILER HINGE SHOCK ABSORBER KEY LESS SENSOR
& NECESSARY PARTS. }
TO REFIX & PUMP SEALANT FOR TAIL GATE DOOR TOP 150.00 ;
& LOWER SPOILER & NECESSARY PARTS. }
TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR CARPET,GARNISH, FLOOR 150.00 80.00
BOARD COVER, TOOL SET.SPARE TYRE WEATHERSTRIP
& NECESSARY PARTS
TO JACK STRAIGHTEN & KNOCKING OUT REAR NOT NECESSARY 150.00 .
EXHAUST PIPE & NECESSARY PARTS,
TO RESPRAY TUFF-KOTE ON ALL AFFECTED ACCIDENT 150.00 BO.00
PARTS.
LABOUR CHARGE TO REMOVE & CUT OUT DAMAGED 1,850.00 1,000.00
PARTS TO JACK STRAIGHTEN & KNOCKING OUT REAR
0/S FENDER,REAR FLOOR BOARD PANEL,REAR END
PANEL & NECESSARY PARTS TO WELD,RENEW & ALIGN
ABOVE PARTS.
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D ipti Con
Qty escription of Parts dition Workshop ($)) (s)
TO PUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING ON ALL AFFECTED 2,000.00 1.080.00
ACCIDENT PARTS
4, 840.00 2 440.00
GRAND TOTAL 13,866.02 7,535.30
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 6,000.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser




